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Type
Fiscal Impact
Budgeted
Budget Source

Recommended
Action

Public Content

BoardDocs® Pro

Mar 10, 2025 - Regular Meeting
7. Consent Agenda

7.12 Tag-On Bid: ITB 21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment, Catalog Discount Bid,
presented by Vince Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended by
the Superintendent for approval.

Public

Action (Consent)

Yes

Yes

Federal Funds, Project 3510 SFS Contract Exclusions

Motion to approve tagging on with Pasco County Schools ITB 21-095-DM Large
Kitchen Equipment, Catalog Discount Bid

Request approval to tag on with Pasco County Schools ITB 21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment, Catalog
Discount Bid. The bid was awarded to muitiple vendors based on discount percentage off pricing, and will be
used on an as needed basis. Funds will be paid from Federal Funds, Project 3510 SFS Contract Exclusions,
and a copy of the award tabulation is attached.

For additional information, please contact Steve Anderson, Program Director, School Food Service, (850)

301-3084.

PASCO CO SCHOOLS-AWARD OF ITB 21-095-DM LARGE KITCHEN EQUIPMENT, pdf {1,926 KB)

Administrative Content

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several
iterns for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been
provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items
may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member.

Motion & Voting

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by the

Superintendent,

https://go.boarddocs.com/fl/okaloosa/Board.nsfigoto?open&login&id=DBMG2X41C31B# 112



3/11/25, 217 PM BoardDocs® Pro

Motion by Parker Destin, second by Linda Evanchyk.
Final Resolution: Motion Carries
Yes: Tim Bryant, Parker Destin, Linda Evanchyk, Brett Hinely, Lamar White

https://go.boarddocs.com/fliokaloosa/Board.nsf/goto?opend&login&id=DBMG2X41C31B# 2/2



Solicitation and Contract Renewals

May 7, 2024
. N . ; G ted A 1 asi
Bid # Bid Title Requesting Department: Awarded Vendor .Date-Term/Year anma ¢d Annuial Afqunt for Pul:chgs:_ng
L N , B i - s e Term/Fundlng + Contact
Glgante Productions, Inter-
State Studio & Publishing
i h ’ 07/01/2024 - 2
21-084-SB Elem:: t:;y :am; Msl:::?;: ool School Based Purchases Leonard's, Lifetouch, On Site 04;310/ / 202:7 G 5900,|000 g :::éiin:a
otograpiy Photography, Strawbridge eneral Funds emn
Studios
2024/2025: $42,191.33 1
BusPl USA (29464) 2025/2026:; $43,619.67 !
usPlanner -
C B rtati 7/1/2024- : !
18-005-LwW omputer a‘sed Transportation Transportation Services Previously GeoRef Systems Ltd 1y 2026/2027: $45,105.81 Jacob Harding
Routing System (21322) 6/30/2029 2027/2028: $46,652.36 1
2028/2029: $48.262.06 1
General Funds
Schoel District of Palm
. . . PP 20 . 2
Beach County Stage Rigging Ins.pectlons and Maintenance Services Tom Kat Rigging 05/11/2024 $7.50,000 Xris Donato
Repairs (15494) 05/10/2025 Capital Funds
20C-44P
Central Restaurant (40760)
Douglas Equipment (28918)
International Restaurant
Distributors, Inc. (6357) 3
- . 07/06/2024 - $1,000,000
- - i i d _ d + ¥ M
21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment Food and Nutrition Services Johnson-Lancaster an 07/05/2027 ENS Funds Deb Mateo

Associates, Inc. {3269)
WH Reynolds Distributor,
Strategic Equipment and

Supply Corporation (72801}

- -
i %7 Motion to-approve the consent agenda and aEI consent agenda ztems. Including’ addenda or revisions, as. recommended by the superintendent

agtion by Gynthia Armstrang, secand by~ Ce!}een Beatidoin, o w , - e : & T
! Final Resoliition: Motisn Carres : ’ N ' ! "
5 Yea: Cynthia: Armstrong, Colleen Beaudoin, Megan Hardmg, Al Hemandez ;




Solicitation and Contract Renewals

I\/lay 7 2024
e o EP % j R i N - ] vy PR D A acins
Contract'# . Contract Title Requestmg Department Vendor Name Date-Term/Year Estlmated Annual Afnountfor- ° Purchgsm_g
. - » ; G, - Term/Funding_ Contact
| d Inf i - 1
2022000718 Microsoft Products Technology an. nformation Microsoft Corporation (8643) 05/24/2024 $96,000 Zsuzsanna
Services 05/23/2025 General Funds McGovern
2018000488 Services for Visually Impaired Student Support Programs and| Allied Instructional Services, 07/01/2024 - | 5130'000 ’ Debra R
y imp Services LLC (18929) 06/30/2025 General Funds and IDEA Part B ebra Reaves
Grant Funds
) _ 05/07/2024 - $75,000
2016000705 Host Products Maintenance Services Lawton Brothers, Inc. (32526 ' Kris Donato
( ’ 05/06/2025 General Funds

! Additional expenditures will be brought to the Board for approval when the anticipated increase is 510,000 or more.
% additional expenditures will be brought to the Board for approval when the anticipated increase is 5% or more of the original amount.
3 Additional expenditures will be brought to the Board for approval when the anticipated increase is $50,000 or more.

B :
§ ,:" Mouon m apprr.ve l:he cunsemt agenda and all° mnsent agenda itemns,. Encludmg addenda or revlsfans as recommended by thie, supanntendent !
% ‘Maten by c\ynthia Armstreng secmd by Calleen Beaudoln : . " 1 o

t Final Resolution: Motion Carries . i

i ) Yea C.ynthia An'nstmng, Ceifden Beaudum Megan Hardlng AI Hemandez

bt s Rantmen s s, i < n o 2




*

”,,y HMotion to epprove the.consent agenda and all consent agenda items numbered 8 through 13, lnctudmg addenda (1F any), 85 re..cmmended by 1h= 5upcrantendcnt

Pasco County Schools

Kurt 5. Browning, Superintendent of Schools
7227 Land O’ Lakes Boulevard « Land O’ Lakes, Florida 34638

— BOARD RECOMMENDATION

Bid Title

Large Kitchen Equipment

Bid Number

21-095-DM

Date Solicited

' May 11, 2021

Amount [Anticipated)

Date Opened June 10, 2021
Date of Board Presentation Ju|v 6, 2021
Annual Expenditure $1,000,000

This is for this year’s expenditures only and will be brought to the Board
for budget approval in subsequent years.

Additional expenditures will be brought to the Board for approval when
the anticipated increase is 550,000 or more.

Funding Source

Food and Nutrition

Term Dates/Renewal

The initial term of this contract will commence on July 6, 2021 and

Option remain in effect for three (3) years. It may be renewed for a period not
to exceed the initial contract term at the mutual agreement of the
parties.

Intent The intent of this bid is to award a contract to multiple vendors that

offer a discount off the Manufacturer’s Published Price List(s) for the
purchase and delivery of Large Kitchen Equipment.

Recommendation

Awards for all line items are noted on the attached tabulation sheet.
Several factors were used to determine the awards. The bid document
stated that discount ranges would not be accepted, so bids for any line
items where vendors inciuded ranges were disqualified. Florida Statute
287.084 establishes a preference for Florida businesses, which also
impacted awards for some line items. Finally, a tiebreaker was needed
for some line items, so the “Toss of a Coin” was used to determine the
award.

Notations and Exceptions

The offers received from the vendors listed herein are the only offers
received timely as of the specified opening date and time. All other
offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby
rejected as late.

Sam Tell and 5on Inc. was considered non-responsive for failure to
complete and upload the Principal Place of Business form.

Administrative Procedures
Act (F.5. 120)

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3),
Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by
law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Recommendation Prepared
By

Deb Mateo, Senior Buyer

Reviewed and Authorized
By

JC

James D. Class, Purchasing Director

E Ncmon by Allen M!mm, ‘second by Alison Crumbiey - T Rt £ .
& F"nal Résglution! Mation Carries. - .
Yea: N!en A!tman, Cynthia Armstrong, Cotleen Beaudein, A!Json Crambley, Megan Hurdmg




21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021

[ 1 Jaccu-Temp T TAWERD.
Suppller qQry UuUom Percent Off Supplier Notes )
{Grady's Feodservice (Pucblo Hotel Stply)” 1 e NoBid - -
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA No Bid
rm!‘ll’lsorl-l.arlcaster and Assadates Inc, 'm [ S . T e ey ;
Internztional Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 54.0% I
iBeltram Edge Tool Stipplviing (Belifam Edea Taol Sunphy, Inc. d/bfa Bel 1-: L GEA. 11— STo5e e B N IS |
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategu: Equi| pment 1 EA 50,0%
Sam Telland Son ng - & Beip iR ’ S iy 5%3;3 L EAT 45.0% RN o 1
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Incl 1 EA 35.0%
"2 Tadvance Tabeo
Supplier qQry UoMm Percent Off Supplier Nates
Eny R arders over $4300 are 66.36% off / Brders Under, 54300 are

* CENTRAL RESTAURANT, PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLE}  .© 7 10 EA. 66.36% 60.11% off h i
Douglas Equipment [Douglas Food Stores Inc) 1 EA 65.056
Hohnson-Lancaster and Assoceates Inc:: - N § X EA . 61.0% . s PPR 5% = 66% 1
Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. dfb{a Bell EA 58.0%
linternational Restaurant Distributars, inc. : IR Ve Y R L e 1
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 50.0%
WH Reyiioids DistriGutor Stratesls ERanient ¢ R T AEO% e R
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 10.0%

*Central Restaurant DQ due to distount range offered.
| 3 [Alto-sham

5uppl|'er

Grady s Foodservice (Pueblo Hote! Supply)
Johnson-l.ancaster and Associates Inc.
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc,

WH Reynolds Distributor, Strateg:c Equipment
&am Telland son nc

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCI' [CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC]
;Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc, d/bfa Bels:
Deouglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores inc) 1

Percent Off Supplier Notes

[_4_Jamerican Metalerate

*

Supplier QrY UOM Percent Off Supplier Notes

g L : i S8.4% OFF ON GRDERS OVER 32050, 45% OFF ON ORDERS ,
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC) EA . 58.5% UNDER SZﬂSG 3
Johnson—lancaster and Asswates Inc. EA 52.0%
Douglas 25 Equipment (Dougles FagdStoresingg T T MU R U soos T e ]
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, rnc (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. djb/a Bell EA 45.0%
Ham. &3m Tell and Son (nc o1 L EA S 45,09 . B v ¥ i
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 40.0%
WH Reynalds Distributor, Strategic Equipment R E,éﬁ% 1 R T Y o
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 20.0%

*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.

: Hotiad By Aden Altman, second by Alison CmmHey.
i Fmai R&seiatfcn. Motion Carries
Yeaidl Cynthia Armstrong, Co’ een Eeaudnm, Alison Crurnble‘{, Megacg Hardinq

W Motion to approve the consént agenda and all.consent agenda items numbered B I’.?mmg‘: 13, including addenda {xf any}, as recommended by the wpermtendent

21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page 1



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021
| 5 |American Panel
Supplier qQry UoMm Percent Off Supplier Notes
ST B

6138 G Puebloﬁ”’?é?’?iiﬁ'ﬁiﬂm %éﬁﬁ&‘m@gﬁ@Wm&w@a G

"ﬁ’“‘%‘éﬁ‘ e TR . T I
44,13% OFF ON UNITS WEIGHING UNDER 750 POUNDS, 41.5%
OFF ON UNITS WEIGHING 751 POUNDS - 1250 POUNDS,
37.25% OFF ON UNITS WEIGHING 1251 POUNDS - 2000
POUNDS & 33.1% OFF ON UNITS WEISHING 2001 POUNDS -

3000 POUNDS. ALL UNITS WEIGHING 3000 POUNDS OR MORE -
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC) 1 44.12% NO BID

i

CRmeis

Sam Tell and Son Inc

W Reynldistribator, Stiatesld Fasidment TR IRIR I TR E’%’%ﬁ%%ﬁi&‘” ROCITE AR o I
Internatmnal Restzurant Distributors, Inc. 1 10.0% Nu List Price Catalug A\railable .
LA e Doug ek R R M e gékﬁ% o eeratete T e
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. d/bfa Bel 1 PER QUOTE
[ 6 JangeloPo
Suppl:er ary  uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
Ieradys|foadsdrinie Pieblo Harel SURR T 11T xsséi;??%%ﬁﬁﬁﬁ%gm;%%i%o A R o i e

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC) No Bid

Seliam toes Toql&uqbi;%gggﬁfﬁéiﬂgm z@«;ggg:@ﬁ?’i“ djb/q sé

435
Juhnsnn-Lancast or Ine, ., 5.0

internati Mﬁ&ﬁ%ﬁﬁiﬁj% 4 ;

TGN *%%*f’“wwg@ma‘fmwﬁﬁ%
s T T TR T

i el i

WH Revnotds D|§tr|butor Strateglc Equ:pment N 30.0%
gm Tell and. Sb- ; e @%ﬁg;ﬁ L et : ﬁ H :;g%g E§§§§WW§ ey E%%ﬁigﬁgﬁ?’ e ‘iiﬁgﬁw : mgﬁ
Douglas Equtpment {Douglas Food Stures Inc) 10.08

[ 7 |aPw-wyott
Supplier ary ucMm Percent Off Supplier Notes

S gy g o - s

Siradys Fooservice (PUbs HoteTsoeaty] T o ’“@?E??&ﬁ@sse g I TR
Sam Tell and Son Inc EA No Bid

S58.75% OFF FOR ROUND COOKERS, 56.5% OFF FOR HOT DOG
EQUIPMENT, 54.7% OFF FOR DISPLAY AND WARMING
CABINETS, 52% OFF FOR HOT/COLD DROP-INS, 54.25% OFF
FOR XTREME TOASTERS, 55.8% OFF FOR STRIP WARMERS,
54.7% OFF FOR COOKLINE, 57.4% OFF FOR XPRESS TOASTERS &
CENTRAL RESTAU RANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC) 1 EA ‘28“7:5}51 58.12% OFF FOR ITEMS W43V & W43V-CE
1

-Beltran’q,Ed §; Supply,lnc_ (Bel:ra [
i B & e RS

Duuglas Equipment {Dauglas Food Stores Inc) 50.0%

A Ry DO e L AL

WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment

m%

SeaTiRE s ekl

i e
MR

5 h%

i eﬂt agenda ar;d alr

gn Carres : :
_E?asa Armsérang, Coiieeﬁ

21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page 2



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021

| 8 JArctic air
Supplief qQry uom Percent Off Supplier Notes

. e L T
R B A e
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT(CENTRAL PRODL.ICTS LLC) Bid

starnational RastAGaRY BAIFRORLInel 1111 M&m R ey
Duuglas Eqmpment {Dauglas Food Stares Inc)

T e e L R et e

Sarn Tell and Son Inc 1
i 35y 2 o BW“M*L" s SkiesiNa s
TohnsonaneasterEnd Rtata el NN I R S T GG ey NI
Be!tram Edge Tool supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. d/b/a Bell EA PER QUOTE
[ 9 Jatlas
Supplier aQry uvom Percent Off Supplier Notes

GRS EaDdservice (Piablo Hatek Supply) o R S Ne R

5]
i IR
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRDDUCTS LLC) No Bid

A imﬁawﬁﬁmb TR j‘“?ggq e g@gﬁ&%g@gﬁgﬁ@ m;mmgg@m%mmm@
ks sncona s bsSosen 1 ey

WH Reynolds Distributor, Strateglc Eqmprnent

SRR SR T T m&ma@m

Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores nc) EA

{FP NI 37 s

| 10 [Baker's pride
Supplier

Pn]

OVEI\:IS ARE 59, 5%

* R
i As,.i“si.éei
ehnsonLancaster d N 1 S
Sam Tell and Son Inc
06iefas Eduipment (Doiglas Food StoresTnc}| &i&%ﬁgﬁﬁéﬁim&ﬁ i A s T
WH Reynolds Distributer, Strategic Equipment
Irsmantinal hestaurant Distributars, Tne. -7 AN §§z§§%§§§ [ i RN T
" Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply)
*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.
[ 11 [Berkel

Supplier ary  uom Percent OFf Supplier Notes
Nia

Sredys vasdserved (hos ki Mot iR L ;;&;@.M,ﬁaf;“@é%ﬁ%&é?g@ﬁ?mm‘%&g

Sam Tell and Son Inc

A

[CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT, [CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLc) 770 x1e ;gA T e 7T SN L o
Beltram Edge Too] Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Ine. d/b/a Be[l 65 0% 65% ON PLATINUM ITEMS / 54% ON NON-| PLA'I‘INUM
BB AR (OBl RBBR STAFRR IR T T ’”’ffm,%iﬁ s T T T
iInternational Restaurant Distributzrs, Inc. S2. 0% . MBI e

FIe] T G G e - = e e UM
I Reybtds Diskvibdtor Sfrafealc Equpment " TE TR &ﬁ?ﬁéﬁfﬁm ST SRR nif“:*mm_mhﬁ}ég%?i%ﬁi
Johnson-Lancaster and Assaciates Inc. 36.05%

21-095-DM Addendum 1- Page 3



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment

BOARD: July 6, 2021

| 12 [Beverage Air

Supplier ary  uom Percent Off Supplier Nntes
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC} 72 9% . B i, ¥
liohnsan-Lancaster and Assaciates Inc. T 68.0%; I
Intemahonal Restaurant Distribuiors, nc: 7.0 o e 1
Dnuglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores Inc) 65.0%
%@Mgehnl supply, Int. (Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Inc, d/b/a'Bell .. EA BA.0%6 ity SRS S,
Sam Tell and $on Inc 1 55.066
Wi Reynolds Di§irlbu£or,’$trateéiézgilgpﬂgpt ; IR ~§§%§§§§E%EA . 0,00 *%Esi TR A
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply} 1 EA 10.0%

[ 13 [Bevies
Supplier - oY uUoM Percent Off Supplier Nates
Anternational Restaurant Distributors, Inc. L1 EA No Bid T . [ 1
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRCDUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA No Bid
‘Beltram Edge Tool Supgly, Inc. (Beftram Edge Tool Sugply, inc. d/b/a Bel1 EA NoBid .« ) . ]
Johnson-Lancaster and Assotiates Inc. EA No Bid
Grady's Fondservice (PLeDIO HOLELSLERN. v o s SRS T No Big ", - ; § !
Sam Tell and Son Inc EA
IWH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment AR N o T v 7 Ty
Douglas Equ}pment (Douglas Food Stares Inc) 1

| 14 [Blodgett
Supplier QY uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUET (CENTRAE PRODUCTS, LEC)™™ " "1 EAT 7 "~y gl i i
International Restaurant Dlstrlbuturs, Inc. 1 EA 60.0%
{Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. (Bafiram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. d/bfaBalt. . EA 59.0% T B 1
Johnson Lancaster and Assocrates lru: 1 EA 57.0%
SamTellandSonlng o L5 Ao EA 55.0% S B . i
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores lnr.l 1 EA 50.0%
{(WH Reynolds Distributor; Strategis Equipment, A EAL 50.0%. | < PO
Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supaly) 1 EA 10066

| 15 Jcambro
Supplier QY Uom Percent Off Supplier Notes

*  CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) i .. .5B77% 56775 OFF UN ORDERSOVER $4000 ' . ]

Inlemar.lnnal Remurant DI&tz}by‘tors, e. A 52.5%'
Hohnson-Laacaster and Associates ine. — ” UE N T ) LA T ]
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 50.0%
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc, [Beftram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.d/b/z Bel T, 50.0% ¥
'WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment 1 45.0%
:Douglas Eguipment {Douglas Food Stores Inc} ~~ R 40.0% e
Grady's Feodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 10.0%

*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.

[FOS——

g Motioa to approve the consent agenda and all consert agenda items numbered.8 through 13, incitding addenda {if any), as'recommended by the supeijéi'téndeq_t

Nottcu by, Allen Altman, second by Alison. Crumb!ey.
Firial Resolution: Motion Carries

1]
;  Yea: AEIenA ‘man, Cyntiia Armstrong, Coﬁeer Beaudom, Alison Crumbley, Megan Hardmg

21-085-DM Addendum 1 - Page 4



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 5, 2021

[ 16 [captive aire
Supplier aqry uom Pewent Off Supplier Notes

{EENTRAL RESTAURANT PB_ODUCY.‘[CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) No Bid seiciiy. - v T " ",‘
* sam Tell and Sonlnc 40.0%
{Douglas Equipment [Dolglas Faod Stores Inc) -« T 50% T L

20,0%

‘WH Reynelds Distributor, Strategic Equlprnent
e u ose ST T e CAPTIVE AIRE WILL BESOED AT COS T r

Hohnson-Lancaster and Associatesfne T
Grady's Foudserwce (Pueb!o Hotel Supply)

" f,»;., g

i ‘z; B tive Alredoes not havellstpi

Slaiine st
F]nfernationm Restauranaé@%aﬁg teded

Beltram Edge Toal Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Ine. d/bfa Bel1 EA PER QOUTE

*Sam Tell and Son, Inc. DQ for failure to complete and upload
Prinfcpal Place of Business form.

[ 17 |carter Hoffman

Supplier QrYy UuUom Percent Off Supplier Naotes

E{ENTR;E\L RESTAURANT PBODUCT . _No Bid ;2 ) !
n-Lancaster and A Astoda ;

%g_»gla_sg_qj iWpmeant (Douzlas Fodd Slareilnc) -

Internatignal Restaurant Distributars, Inc.

Beltrarm Edye Tool Supply;ind $AEHTam Lage 190l SUpply.Inc: a/Bla B

Sam Tell and 5on Inc

SWH Reynolds Distrlbator; Stragggg Equipmem R

Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 0.0%

| 18 Jcentral Restaurant

Supplier Ty uom Percent Off Supplier Notes

dnternational Restaurant Distributors, Inc. ) . No Bid /2. T . Lt L i ]
Beltram Edze Teol Supply, Inc. {Beltram Edge Too! Supply, lnc. d/bfa Bell No Bid

ohnson-Lancaster and Associafosing. L, No'Bid @i N i

Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supplv)

Hain S b

L hd ?REFR|GERAT|ON 22.83 OFF & VALUE SERlES REFRlGERATlDN
_ 28.56% 15.11 OFF

E’Qurpment N ; B BN

0.0%

b

S Reynaids Distriblios, Siratege
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores Inc)

| 19 |champlon
Supplier Qry uom
ok Lancaster and Associates Inc.. "~ : H -1 EA .,
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores Inc) 1 EA
{international Restaurant Bistsibutors, inc. - - B T A
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT [CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC)
iWH Reynolds Distributor, Stratesic Equipment. : EOG T
Sarn Tell and Son Inc 30,0%
JBeftram Edge Tool SUpply, inc. (Bairan Edge 1051 SUBpIY, Inc, o/o/a Ber il ”éii BTN Y
Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 10.0%

AT A *,"I

N 1

T T T

1 ; i S R . S, . Ll hgas,ur o
'iﬁr Motscn tn approve the consent ag enda Bl all, consen: enda itéms numbered 8 throughi13, including addenda {if any}/.2s recommended by the saperintendent

Motior B Allen Aitman, secdnd by-Alisan. Chalr b!ey.
Final Reschition: Motlon Curnes 3
£ Ailén,

o P

audoln, Allson'Crumbles

!
L

21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page 5



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment

BOARD:; luly 6, 2021

I_Zl:l |channel

Supglier Qry uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
{CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCE {CENTRAL PRDDUCTS LLC) ‘1 EA . No Bid * .
‘Beltram Edge Tool Supply, ine, EBeItram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. d[bla Bl -EA . 49.0%, TOS5 of the COIN, 1
‘lohnson-Lancaster and Assodiatesine. I . S 49.0%
International Restaurant Distributars, Inc. 1 EA 46.0%
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Fquipment i, s SEALH DX
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 40,00
gﬁgggmgggpment=(0ahglas Food Stores'nck. - &ggg?gf‘i:ﬁm ¢ 35000 i g}; TR a1
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 10.6%
| 21 [Cleveland
Supplier ory uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCI'S, ey 1 EA GO.BT%L n o . 1
liohnson-Tancaster and Assaciates tnc. 1 EA 58.0% i PPE 5%=63% ]
dnternational Restaurant Distributers, Inc:, 3 EA 56.0% . .- K IR |
Dourglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Ine) 1 EA 55.0%
:Beltram Edge Too! Supply, inc: [Beltram Edge Tool Supgly, Inc. d/b/a Bel£." " EA 53.0% 51% ON {ONVOTHERM 1
Sam Tell and Son Inc i EA
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strateeie Equipment: - IR e T e e = Y
Grady's Foodservice (Pusblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA
[ 22 Jeolorpoint/LTi

Suppller QY uoMm Percent Off Supplier Nates
Grady's Foadservice (PuebloHotel Supply). ¢ AT EA NoBid % o M
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA No Bid

*  sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA soof T e 1
WH Reynolds Dlstrlbutor, Strategu: Equls:ment A e 17T TEA 50.0%
Johnsgﬁ Tancaster andAssociates L‘i‘: T T By YEn 0T BE L il
‘Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. {Beltram Edge Toed Supply, Inc. d/bfa Bell EA 23,0%
iDouglas Equipment (Douglas Fabt r . LEA 10.0% 1

Colarpoint/LIT does nat have list prices. Quotes provided on

International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA an as-needed basis,
*Sam Tell and Son, nc. DQ for fallure to complete and upload
Prinicpal Place of Business form.
| 23 |Continental Mfg.
Supplier ary uom Percent Gff_Supplier Notes
I “6366% OFF ON ALCORGERS OF 3 TR ML E"ﬁ'éiﬁrssmmn 01
* CENTRAL RESTAURANT | PHODUCI’ (CENTRA!. PRODUC‘I‘S ey o o1 A .. 63.66% FREEZER LINITS ;

Beltram Edge Tool Supply. In
infernational Restadrans Distrib,

AR i i
F 3 1

Sam Tell and Sen Inc 1

Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Storesine) - i REONE I 7 Ll I i
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment 1 EA

Yohhspn-Lancaster and ASSQEiates Ineie . i TR S 7
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA

*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.

m Mot.on to approve the consesnt agenda and all cx:nsen: agenda items numbered 3 tnmugh 13, inciuding addenda {f any), asrecommended by the su;:enntendent

i, Metion by Aien Aéman, second by Ahsoa Crumbfey

‘Einal Resslution: Motion Carries
Ye

’%len Aitman,lcyn!hla A!Tnstrnng‘ {Z 3

21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page 6



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment

BOARD: July 6, 2021

[ 24 ICres Cor
Supplier Qry uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
*  [CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUICT (CENTRAL PRODUSTR,LLC) |~ (L0 10, EA - 1[1]1155:39% SS9 OFE ON ALL ORDERS OVER 316,800 AHITIL « . ik
*  SamTell and SonIng 1 EA 52.5%
[ohnsor-(ancasterand Assadatesing, T T ER 510% ]
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 50.0%
WH Reynpotds Distributor, Strategic Equipment cA EA RO N R 1
Douglas Equipment [Douglas Foad Stores Ing) 1 EA 45.0% )
{B&ltram Edge Tool SUpply, nc. (BEHfam Edge Ta0l SUppIy,In. a/b/a Bl 1T ER I a3 g . qiie e PR "
Grady‘ 's Foadservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 0.0%
*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.
*Sam Tell and Son, Inc. DQ for failure to complete and uload
Principal Place of Business form.
[ 25 Jcrown Steam Group
Supplier aQTY  UoMm Percent Oft Supplier Notes
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCI'S LLC) 1 EA 64.4%[ : T
Johnson-(ancaster and Associates Ing: _ TITTTTER L% [
EBeltram EdgeTooISgpp_y. Inc. (ngggemmfwdge Toglisup AR }}? 58,005 BLODGERT L = 110 i ¢, N
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 50.0%
‘Douglas Equipment (Dovglas Foad Stores Inc) PR e EA Futn 60,088 s o i L |
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 48.0%
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment = . s 1 EA 45,00 o s : o PR
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 10.0%
[ 26 [Delfied
Supplfer ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
‘Johnson-Lancaster and Associates Ine, . A T T4 “_"EA:_t 59,0%: : i H
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC] 1 EA 57.6%
;[nternauonal Restaurant Distributors, Inc; i h ‘; oo EA i 56.0% B i
Sam Tell and Son Inc EA 52.5%
{Beltram £das ool SUpply, inc: (Beltram Eoge Toal Supsly, Inc. d/b/a Bemi EA sy 0% i ! ki
WH Revnnlds Distributor, Strategic Equiprment 1 EA 50.0%
{Douglas Equipment {Couglas Food Stores Inc) . . 1 . EA 50.0% - - 1
Grady's Foodservice {Puehlo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 10.0%
[ 27 [boyen
Supplier Qry  uom Percent off Supplier Notes

&

—

57 035 OFF ON ALUOR GVERS10,000 oﬁ"a PIECES OFT

\CENTRAL RETAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCFS LLC] 57 02% EQU]PMENT o .

Sam Tell and Son Inc 52.5%

Ja E:_'w { =nr.asr.er and_Afgm:lates Irlc. N " ,,":_.“:._.;N;:“-:‘... _: 1 e ;§I‘o§§77“ Lt BN t
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stnres Im:) 1 45.0%

Beltram Edge 1001 supply, Int: (Beltram Edge.To0L SUDRI,InE. d/bja Bedi v EA R i i !
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment 1 EA 40,0%

iinternationsal Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 35.0% ) i e 1
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 5.0%

*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.
*Sam Tell and Son, Inc. DQ due to failure to complet and
upload Principal Place of Business form.

5 Motion ko a::pr’uve the consent agenda and all consent agerda ifems numbered & Bhrough 13, fnz:hi_ciihg addenda {if any), as reccmmended by the superifiterdent

Motion By HEE" Altman, second by Alison Crumbley.
Final-Resatution: Mction Carries. -

Yea: A%]en AEtman, Cynthla Arm&rang, CaEEeerz Beaudom, Ahsa :Cmmbley, Megm Hardmg

B

21-055-DM Addendum 1- Page 7



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment

BOARD; July 6, 2021

[ 28 Jouke

Percent OFf Supplier Notes

Intematlonal Restaurant Dlstnhutors, Inc.
Uphrsori(ancaster and Assoriatesindg

R e e .
H 4

Supplier QY uom

7 X e KO

TOZFECTF ALCONVECTION OVEN " ORDERS GVER $4000,”
, UL AEROHOT STEAMTABLE GRDERS OVER $4000,

. 60.86% oﬁ#ou AL THRUMADUKE smwm;:.s ORDERS
,71.5% OVER $4000, 55.2% OFF ALL DROP-IN ORGERS OVER $5000,; §

Sam Tell and Son Inc 1
Wi Reynolds Distributar atraleRis EQUPIEnt w1 o e T T 7
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. d/b/a Bal1 EA
;Douglas Equipment (Dauglas Food Stores Ing} .~ e AT i i
Grady's Foadservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA
*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.
[ 23 [e control system
Supplier QY uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
gnlernétinnal Restaurant Distributgss; inc. . L eimgr EA . No Bid . . R M H
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA No Bid
Beltram Edge 1ol SUpply, Ine. {Beitram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. dfbj/a Bel 1 " A NaBid —wiiines R il 1
Johnson-Lancaster and Associates Inc. EA No Bid
Grady's Foodservice (BUSBIO HOTal SUBRY. s N Eigﬁ A "No Bld Ty TRy B
Sarm Tell and Son Inc EA Nogid
“WH Reynolds Distribitor, Strategic Equipment o Y F TEAT T A0.G%7 RN L T =™
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stares Inc) ’ 1 EA 0.0%
| 30 [eagle Group
Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off Supplier Notes
{CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CEHTRAL FRODUCTS, [1€). DK : _ No'Bid o i
I ' 1 65.0%
{niernational Hestaurant DistABgtars, Inc.. Ter Ly A A ; IR i
Douglas Eguipment {Douglas Food Stares Ing) 1 55,086
{B&itram Edge Tool SURply, INc: (Beliram Edge 160l Supply, Inc, ofa/a el 1 EUXCONE . i A
Sam Tell and Son Ing i 50.0%
[WH Revnolds DistribUtor, Strategls EqUipment. .« - Pat 0 [ |
Grady's Foodservice {Puehlo Hotel Supply) 1 10.0%
31 |Edlund
Suppllef ary uom Per:ent Off Suppller Notes
[CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PROBUCTS, tic) 1 EA ~ 56.55%. T - T )
Sam Telt and Son lac 1 EA S0.0%
Hehnson-Lancaster and Associatesineg, o e L SEA 47006 5w o = ~ 1
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 42.5%
Wi eynolos Distributer, Strategis Fatipment T ER 380 . i,
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stares Inc) 1 EA 35.0%
Belfram Edge 100l SURRLY, Int:| BAILAm Edge Tool SRR, INC, 0/6/a Bal L CEAGY ™ T2 NOT INETUDING PARTY ™
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hote! Supply) 1 EA 5.0%
| 32 [Follett
Supplier aQry uvom Percent off Supplier Notes
\Beltram Edge Tool Supply; Inc. {Beftram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.d/bfaBell -~ EA . No Bid : « ) |
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT [CENTRAL PRQDUCTS, LLC} 1 EA No Bid
lishnson-Lancaster and Associates Inc. 1 EA 50,0% C e TOSS of the COIN ,
WH Reynelds Cistributar, Strateglc Eqwnment 1 EA 50.0%
Sami Tell and Son Inc ¢l EA 45,084 i A L 1]
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 40.0% Ice Mathmes 50% off listice Blns/Storage 40% off [ist
{Doligfas Equipment (Douglas Faod Stores inc) e SRR 20,05 i T
Grady's Foodservice {(Pueblo Hotel Supply) EA 0.0%

’fm" Hctzen to approve the consent, agenda and:all consent agenda’ items numhered 8 through 13, mciudmg ad&enda {iFany), as rer'ommended by the sup

HMetion by Aflen Aftman, secand By Alison Cmmb!ey.

Final Reschytion: Mobion Carfies

|
i “Yea: Allen Altman, Cynthia Armstrong, CB§§°EH Beaudoin, Alison Crumb[ey, f{egan’'Harding

nntendent

21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page &



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021
| 33 ]Food Warming Equipment
Supplier aQry uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
““%?

CENTRAL RES TA U AR B T e AL PR D e e e R TR eled T

Beltram Edge Tnol Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supp!v, Inc. d,n'b/a Bell EA
te

R T

1 323{? EN;" W.ﬁﬁi&u e
i

wmmwsn.strsu%gﬁrggmmw%mfgmﬁﬁm“

Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Inc)

Uepasenilansasterand AssBcaReE el TR IR

Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hote! Supply}

e

it

0.0
L ﬁﬁ%@ﬁ%ﬁﬁ%@?& B Eﬁ%@fﬁ%&ﬁﬁ i

| 34 [Garland
Supplier qQry  uom Percent Off Supplier Notes

64 15% 64.15% OFF, EXCLUDES SUNFIRE AND INDUCTION EQUIFMENT

mﬂ?ﬁ%@%‘&ﬁ%&?’”% Sl o T A
e R S
.mskw%ﬁ%‘%“ﬁ%’éﬁ%@‘?&?mmmm R

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODLICT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LL

o e 75%{@ i
;{%g ol ig.e %Sw Lant Distreby ﬁﬁ%QE? : "éiwmn.‘;_mé%«ma é&ws{i@

Dauglas Equipment (Douglas Ft;od Steres Inc)

Beftram Edge, Topl,Suwwﬁﬁgmﬁfw?@ﬁﬁ%@m%

Sam Tell and Son Inc

Wl Reyncles Dl strategcEqdiprene i R AT EE’KT’:‘} f"w?%?
1

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

2 T

| 35 IGmen

5upplier ary  UoM Percent Off Supplier Notes

. Sneregey 3o 7 7 13l i

1 ﬁéégﬁﬁ‘%@é{f i S0 0% R e L
55.7%

i ,mg.ﬁﬁ%%? T e
Sam Tel anﬂgcn lng W - . -
Q_oy_skz.gqszs.cﬁéiits{@ﬁé%’%fz SR E?é%é@mwwﬁ?giﬁiﬁéﬁéﬁiﬁa LT
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment 40.0%

[Bliam Edi oA KT setram Ece 0T SUUBTIBIA B

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

N

et R 2

| 36 IHatcn
Supplier QY  UOM Percent Off SuppllerNotes

S

Tohnsan-lancastar and Associates Inci Al RS L i éEAz gL

Hi
1 x -

tratDistribofors BTN 2T }m’§§§§§?%v:w

CENTRAI RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC)

B ot il fool STolv, 1R {Be oA EOER TRnlBLERN) ﬂaui@’i”“%m{%ﬁ ks

WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment

Potales et ipodeias Food stofesiB THTIIINITY

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

T
SN 1 i
RDERS OVER $3850.00

ag:;fm%%@ﬁ’“

" 21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page 9



21-095-DNv Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021

{ 37 [Hobart

Suppller Qry uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
DEALER'S CHOICE ITEMS ARE 42.47% OFF & SPEC LINE [TEMS

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC) 1 EA 42.47% ARE 35.38% OFF
'.Ioﬁnmmlancaster and Associates Inc. . R ? EA 34.0%' VTN REE SKs 39%
‘Beltram Edzé Taol Supply, Inc. (Beliram Edge Tool upply, Ine. dfbfa Beli- 7 EA - 33.0% 33% DEALER'S CHOICE/ 29% ]
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. EA 31.5%
Sam Tell'and Son Inc._ - B - " EA S30.0% e R o b
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment 25.0%
{ougias Equfment (Dougias Food stares Ing) (i TR O N
Grady"s Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 0.0%

| 38 JHoshizaki
Supplier QT\' UOM Percent Off Supplier Notes
CENTRAL RESTAURART PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUETS LT : : =y
Johnsen-Lancaster and Associates Ine.
[international Restaurant Distribufors;ine, o .
WH Reynolds Distributer, Strategic Equipment
Sam TYelland Son tnc L e 1 = : i
Belttam Edge Tool Supply, Inc. {Beltram Edge Toal Supply, Inc. d/bfa Bel1
Douglas Equipment (Dotiglas Food StoreSInch,  sedint: - o™ A T e i
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supplv) 1

| 39 [1ce0 Matic
Supplier ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
XCENTRAL RESTAURANY PRODUCT (CERTRAL FRBBUETS, LLEL 17" BA 7" 1 “3106%
Johnson-Lancaster and Associates Inc. EA
Polgias ERtipment [DDURINS FOOH SEOrBS NG - o IR o b ;
International Restaurant Distributors, Ing, 1 EA
#WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment 1 EA e
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA
{Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Ine. {Beltram Edge Taol Supply, Inc. d/b/a Bel1 EA B ]
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA

[Le0 [i
Supplier qQry uom Percent Off Suppher Notes
ICENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODLUCT, [CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA No Bid _ 1
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supplv, Inc. dfbfa Bell EA No Bid
‘abnson-Lapcaster and Associates nc.i: EA SiNoBid . et 5 Pt 1
Grady's Foodservice (Puebln Hotel Supply) EA No Bid
Sam Tell an son lhe.. * © EA E No Bid ol ol . . 1

nal R ! tc . EA » - - mo% No List Price Catalog Avalrable { T TT08E of the €OIN

Wil ﬁeiﬁdi&'s'”fﬁ;éfﬁutér, Strategic Equipment EA” 0.0 w 5 ]
Dougtas Equipment (Dotglas Food Stores Inc) EA 10.0%

e MoBonto approve the consent agenda znd all consent agenda stems numbered 8 ‘through 13, mcludmg addenda  any), as recommended by the superintendent

. Motian by Allen J\!trna econd by: Allszm Crumhley‘. : ‘;
Final Resoigtion: Motier Carries - o
“Year Allen Altman, Cyn{h_a Armstrony, n!ieen lie:auﬁmrsJt

Fdlson Crumbley, Hegan Hardlng s

21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page 10



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment . BOARD: July §, 2021
m IKeating

Suppher QTY uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
JCERTRAL RESTAURANT, PRODUCT [ CENTRAL FRODUGTS, LLCh 0o Sy o BRI i o B -
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. (Beftram Edge Tool Supply, Ine. djb/a Bel 1 EA No Bid

flohnson-Lancaster and Associates inc., . ;v S D s s '-NoBig

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

Sam'¥ell nd Son 16 RS St T z
RDIstr[huturs, ine. ” N
M Eeyriolds Distributos SteateRle Eauinment s - . L o 5_;“51{;“ T
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stares Inc) 1 5.00
["42 TKolpak
Supplier ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
‘Johnson-Lancaster and Assodlates Inc. N 1 EAL b 0 e R SR = BO%. 7+ v o}

55,0%

Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Steres lnc)
ASTTED A% NG List Price Catalog AVAIABIE . o LT i T e

linternatianal Resteurant DatrIBUtaraTING i o

WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment EA

BamTellandsemine. o TR
EA

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

msaetﬁ‘uo w.cw OACCURATELY Qu TETHIS RAND

{ ; : % . : : 'EHE TO HIGH WéfGH‘[’ AND 5F€EPPIN(¥3§)STS PL e ﬁEéUEST
CENTRAL RESTAURAN‘I‘ PRODUCT( NTRALP ODULTS LLC) - 1 EA- T S O QUGIEAS NEEDED. " . s
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. {Beltram Edge Taol Supply, Inc, d/b/a Bell EA PER QUOTE

[ 43 [Lakeside
Supplier QTY UOM Percent Off Supplier Notes

*
Be[trani Edge T001 Sup‘ply'?]nc. (Beltra m Edge‘TnaI Supp]y, Inc.'dfb/a Bel1”
International Restaurant Cistributors, Inc.
[WH Reynolds Distributor; Strategic Equipment |
Sam Tell and Son Inc
Doughs Equipment [Douglas Food Stores Ing)’. . . -
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1
*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.
[[24 Jtang
Supplier ary  uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
Sam?ellandSunlnc - P i 23 s w17 CEAC SRR siiNg Bigdl: e o Sy g it R
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRDDUCT(CENTRAL PRODUCI'S LLC) 1 EA 64.0?%
ok Lancaster and Assodiates IAc, o o 1 TTEA E00% T e R . N T PPB be=hbed o 1
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores Inc) EA 60.0%
{Belteam Edae.Tool SUpply,inc. (Belirar Edge Fool supaly, e, f/6/a Bell Bell T e 58@% O T T T e i
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.
{WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment « S T '1, T EAr 5 43.0%, CLT T M T ]
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 5.0%

E;? Mobon to ap;}rove the. consent agenda a

& all ccnsen! agemfa lterr.s numbered 3 thrmt;zh 13, mdudmg addenda (sf anv};as recommended by the supennteadent ,

_— I [RE

Motu:sn by AiEen Altman, second . T i i . i N |
Final Resolut::m- Molion Carries . £ S o . s L. s
n Aitman, Cyn&hza Armstrong, Coileen Beaudotn, PJlsen Cru'nbley, Megan Harqu @ . - &

21-095-DM Addendum 1 - Page 11



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment

BOARD: July 6, 2021

| 45 [Legion
Supplier ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
Sam Tell and Son Inc..- i L g EA = No Bid i P i B N uﬁi
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Int. (Beltram Edge Toal Supplv, Inc dlbla Bell EA No Bid
HohnscRiEancaster 00 ASSOLIAtes oL, ere TR T T P Bl SR L
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUICTS, LLC) 1 EA No Bid
International F f Restaurant Distributors, inc.. ”".-__'___‘_ P A0.0%; . i T o Tn i
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment 1 EA 35.0%
{Douglas Equipmenit {Douglas Food Stores Tne) i & g " CATEER e CTEIEE T
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 0.0%

| 46 |Manitowac

Supplier ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
‘CENTRAL RESTAURANE BRODUCTIEENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLcj TR CX- XN e T U
Jehnson-Lancaster and Assodiates Inc. 1 R 63.0% i PPE 5% =b68%
.Be[tmm £dge Too| Suppiy, Inc. @gjtram EdgeTeolSupplv, e, dibfaBell: - EA .. 61.6% R S s e T T i
Discount Excludes Quads/CVD's which will be quoted as

International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 60.0% needed.
WH Reyrolds Bistributer, Strategic Equipment ~ : 1 . EA 55,00 i 3
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Inc) 1 EA 55.0%
(Sarm Tel 34 S08 INeRL, T i N R ) o y N L
Grady's Foodservice (Puebto Hotel Supply) 1 EA 10.0%

r-‘l? ]Market Forge
Supplier ary uUom Percent Off Supplier Notes
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 64.4% MARKET FORGE IS NOW CROWN STEAM
’Johnson—l.anmster and Assaclates Ine; T 1 EA 60.0% " PPB S% =85%
{Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc: (Beltram Edge Toni Sitpply; Ink: d/bfa Ball . EA T SS0 : i e
Sam Tell and Son lne 52.0%
Daiighas Ecilipment (DOKEIRS FOOEOtOres INg) . b o i A58 R W i
International Restaurant Distributars, Inc. £5.0%
\WH Reynolds Distriburor, Strategic Equipment - - A00% B e S
Grady's Feodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 0.0%

[ 28 [mars
Suppller any UOM Percent Off Suppller Notes
[Beltram n Edge Tool Stpoly, fne; (Beltram Edge Too] Sdpply, Incid/b/a Bell EA .. s NoBid (18 ko RN R
Grady's Foodservice (Pueb!o Hote! Supply) EA No Bid
:Sam Telf:and Son Inc - R ’ 1 EA No Bid o L e o
CENTRAL RSTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUUS LLc) 1 EA 22.03%
International Restaurant Distributors, Ine. 1 EA 20.0%
%wu W Reyhoids Bistribiitor, Stratogic Equip %g@g TR 2ﬁ§§§§‘?
Johnsori Bricaster And Assaciatés Ine. ) EA 20.0% e T A .
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Ine) 1 EA 10.0%

yrrrm—

‘ﬁ:‘ Motr:zn” 3 appmve the consent agenda ané all conse’ ¥ agenda’ 1tems numberefi 8 thmugh 13, |nciudmg addend R anyJ, as re"ornmended by the sspermtendent .

Motrm by Allen Litman, second by Alison Cmmblev.
! F’ nal Resoluticn:. Motion Catries

len Allman, Cynth.a Armstrung. Cn? een Beaudom, Ml..ca Crumbley, Megan Hardir;

21-055-DM Addendum 1 - Page 12



21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment

BOARD: July 6, 2021

{ 49 [Masterbilt

Supplier

Qry uom

Pen:ent off Supplier Notes

BT Ey

{Beltram EdgaiTool SUBPlY, Inc. (Belitam EOge 100l SUppIY, Ine. d/bja Bery)

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCI'S LIn]
Johnson—Lamzster and Associates [nc, :

Sam Tell and Son lnc

N T N

iDouglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores inc)
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc.

48.0% No List Price Catalng Avallabie

o Vi 45 00 e o B ]

Higoet o
b

WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment ;¢
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

0.0%

[ 50 [Metro

S uppl lier

’lul;r;;an-lancaster and Assodates Inc. "
lintefnational Restaurant Distributors: Ine..

WH Reynolds Distributar, Strategic Equipment

Sam Tellang son e L wrA T e —"
Douglas Equipment (Dauglas Food Stores Inc)
{Beltram EdgeTool Supply, Inc. (Beliram Edge ool Supplv;ir PE |
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 10 0%
*Cantral Restaurant DO due to discount range offered.
| 51 Jmieko
Supplier ary uUom Percent Off Supplier Notes
\Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply} L me s " JNoBld e R G [
Sam Tell and Son Inc No Bid
LENTRAL RESTALURANT PRCDUCT{CENTRAL I’RODUCTS LLC) J.’llc‘:“Bid s o . f
Johnson-Lan: 36.0%,
%Intemauonal 3105 - : L 3
‘WH Reynolds Drstnbutor, Strateglc Equipment EA 30.0%
Belfram Edge Too| Supply; INc. (BeRram EUEE 00! SUpDIY, TNE 0/ b/a BRI L (EAL w s 3O o P A i}
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Feod Stores Inc) 1 EA 0.0%
| 52 IMontague
Suppller uoMm Percent Off Suppller Notes
&am Telt andkon el © T ProseEn EA NG Bid, i R |
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Ine. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, ln:: dj'b/a Be!l EA No Bid
ICENTRAL RESTADRANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, I.LCI EA .- NoBd R L S0 1
fJohnson—Lan:aster and Assodiates Inc, EA '
JntEmational Resfaurent Distributars, nc. o5 T e oo G LisE Price Cataton AvalBIE = —
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment EA 35.0%
{Dauglas Equipment (Douglas Focd Stores Inc) i o U EA e 30080 han v S anE i
Grady s Foodservice (Pueblo Hotef Supply) 1 EA 0.0
| 53 [Norlake
Supplier any uoMm Percent Off Supplier Notes
57.3% OFF FOR FINELINE WALK-INS, 55.26% OFF FOR KOLD
LOCKER & FAST TRAK WALK-INS, NO BID ON ADVANTEDGE
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 57.3% AND NOVA REFRIGERATION
Irohnson-lancaster and Associates inc. i 1 EA TET.0% H PPB_5% = 62% -
international Réstauiant Distribistofs, e, .« =~ . *. 157 EA 5409 WoList Price Catalog Avalabie, . T R
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stares Ing) 1 EA 50.00%
{Beftram Edge Tool SUpRLY, he: (Beltan Edge 100 SURDIYAne. d/bya Bel Lo T BA . o ag fag - aes R N 3
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 45,0%
Wi Reynolds Distiibutor, Strategic EGUPMERt & e ) 7Y Y TN T AR e 7
Grady's Foodservice (Puehlo Hotel Supplvl 1 EA 5.0%

[ F:ﬁal ReséE;;stion' Motis
' Yeas Allen Altman, Cy

&5 A T R
u;‘.= -2

aia Armstreag, Coliden Beaudom, Ahsun Crumbley;’ Megan Hardmg

i
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21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment

BOARD: luly 6, 2021

| 54 IPanasonic

Supplier ary uom

Percent Off Supplier Notes
Johnsen-Lancaster and Associates Inc. , - CoL v 63.0%
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCI’S LLC) 1 61.07%
nternational REstaurant DISIBATOrS, NG, . Do oo w o ome bk 58.5%: CurrentList Price Catalog N/A At This Time, =55 770" 7028
Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. d/bla Bell 53.0%

[Wii Reynoids Distributor, Strategic Fquipment 7 A §§§

R e

Sam Tell and Son Inc

LL

[BouEs Euipment (BougIHs Fold STares InCh o

Grady's Foedservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1

| 55 [Randell

Supplier

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (cemi PROGUCTS, LLC)

oy =

Aiiternational Re -stmbumrs,tnc.

Sam Tell and Son Inc

WH Reynefds Distributor; Stratesic Equipment .. & . . © 1Ot HTEAT

Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Inc. [Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. d/b/a Bell
Doblglas Equipment {Douafas Food Stores Inc) .

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

| 56 [Rationate

Supplier ary UOM Percent Off Suppller Notes
Tohnsan-Lancaster and Associates e, .. - G N A
36.7% OFF ON COMBI OVENS AND ACCESSORIES ORDERED
WITH COMBI OVENS, NO DISCOUNT OF INSTALLATION/TRAVEL
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 36.7% SERVICES OR INST ALLATION KITS.
international Restaurant Distributors;inc, - s L PLTEAT 36.00 e . sl T g
WH Reynolds Distrlbutnr. Strategu: Equnpment 1 EA ..

Sam Tell and Son [nc 2

Beltram Edge Tool Supplv, Inc. (Be[tram Edge Tool Supply, Inz. dlb/a Bell EA
{Dougies Equipment (Dougkes Faad stores Inglr o o e gﬁﬁf THEA

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) EA

| 57 |Robo Coupe

Supplier ary  uoMm Percent Off Suppller Notes
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 27.83%) TN s N i 1
AInternatignal Restatirant Distributors, N SO LUUEAT 4 26.0%! H PPB.5%=31%
Johnson-l.ancaster and Associates e~ - LTy 25,05 N T R g
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 25.0%
Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc.|Beitram Edge Tool Supply, inc. a/b/3 Bel 1. - : o210% s _ = R T T
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Inc) 1 20.094
WH Reyniolds DIstrIbutor; SUATBEC ERIPIENE . 1 cor g s o L GAEA T T 8 et v I e
Grady's Foedservice {Pueblo Hote! Supply) 1 EA 10.0%

I 58 |Scolsman
Supplier ary  uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
‘fohnson-Lancaster and Associates inc., ; LA 63.0%
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 60.97%
iBeltram Edge Tool Supply, Inci(Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. 6/b/a Bel T+ EA S8.0% . " i 1
Douglas Equipment [Douglas Food Stores tnc) 1 EA 55.0%
iAnternztional Restaurant Distributors, Inc. - I S 1 A S |
Sam Te!l and Son Inc 1 EA 52.5%
AW Reync!ds Distributor, Strategic Equipment ., . TITER 50.086 * il : )
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 15.0%

Moticn by ‘Allen Altman, second byAftsanCmmblcy.
Fna] Reso!utzon- otion Carfies = -
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21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021
| 59 [servolift/Piper Products
Supplier
JCERTRAL RESTAURARTRODUCT ICENTRATR
Sam Tell and Son Inc
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Inc)

B TS
lachra éﬁgsfgg?g&%u %,!m%ge_ejéﬁﬂeg ﬁeﬁ“

WH Reynelds Distributor, Strategic Equipmant

Wehfach:Lorcastel and Associetet TRl ITAEIT mm.wmwm“ m%%mx:‘"ﬁo Wﬁ%ﬁéﬁﬁﬁi&ﬁ@i@%ﬁ“

Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hetel Supply)

QTV uom Percent Off Suppher Notes
; oA iSOl -
T T mﬁ% (HORELR

LI RRTER S0k ]
T B sth.r. o I

Sam Tell and Son, Inc. DQ for failure to complete and upload
Principal Place of Business form.

[ 60 Jsouthbend

Supplier QrY uomMm Pen:en: off Supplier Notes

Befifeliand Soninc. “ ;&ﬁé%%}? ] e e T ’
i}gﬂixggség‘g s i ‘E SOUTHBEND CORNERSTDNE SERIES IS 68.5% OFF STANDAF\D
ICENTRAL RESI'AUR.ANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LiC) "‘%@li;gﬁ; + 68.5% SOUTHBEND SERIES IS 64.96% OFF

‘Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Taol Supply, inc. d/b/a Bel 1 58 O%“Emﬁlf&w_ﬁwa I i
Johnsen-Lancaster and Associates Inc. 1

R e o oo srad ﬁﬁ@%ﬁiﬁ&@ﬁﬁxﬁﬁ%ﬁmﬁm BN 11157

rpeTTR FrETS
"3§1§! é@ﬁ%%g?ﬁmﬁ sl
Internationa! Restaurant Distributors, Inc.

W Reineds Pists b or Sicateaic EaSRRE LRI WW% il *43%?‘“”“”“mm%ﬁjjﬁﬁmﬁ%@@%

Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply}

| 51 |StellarSteam

mﬁlle: ot Ty  uom I:Sr:ent Off Supplier Notes
- SR s " T —
Nl Restadrant Distribatars IRRLRENITK T e ‘m L T S R R e
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRCDUCT [CENTRAL PRODUCTS, s!.LC) " . ) No Bid — _—— "
Belbrat Eder OO SN gl Bl A Edge &Z@ﬁ%’éﬁi@@iﬁﬁ?ﬁé&ﬁ&&mm B e
Iohnson-Lan:s%iEer and Assoclagtﬁeﬁs Inc, - p—- No Bid ) — (
loradys Fobdsenide I TRMI ot Boahy S R %ﬁ%ﬁﬁmmmw@%@@é&m e
Sam Tell and Son Inc2 T ) - sy e, No Bid
WH Revnnlds Dlstﬂbtltof, Strategic Equipment. T qgfig ‘EA ge};
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores Inc) ‘ 0.0

| 62 [Structural Concepts
Suppller

JE R ~-;£A-W I e MRS
é%j&i%{ [T ] ] o R AR ! ’ i, gxééif;gm@mam
DouglasEq ment(Douglas Food Stores Inc) y ) 55.0% .

el N SRR L St

B s, I DI v ﬁ%gmew o
1
S i TS s o S A 51 @3@:&%}3@3@ SR e
0.0%

£ 5
WH Revnolds Dlstributor, Strategic Equipment 50.0%
Grady"s Foodservice (Pueblo Hote! Supply)

[ 63 |Tableeratt
Supplier ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
s J TESTRIE

i.lohnson -Lancaster i Aednciatesing, o ‘4“ N N M,Mif ﬁ BEACT “
lntemanonal Restaurant Distributors, Inc. EA 45.0%

EENTRALRES AOGHLT (CETRAL PRGDUCTST LEIT, %ﬁ@ﬁﬁﬁé@izwﬁ_@; i“33ﬁﬁﬁ?ﬁé@ﬁ‘”ﬁ@fﬁ”&@mg@%@m&@; i i
Beltram Ed, Tnnl Supply, Inc, {Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc: d/b/a Bell EA 40,0%%

e AT “
T e

R0,

S LI T C R

WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment

IBSURSS vt (Deueis Food Sorea hel | IEIABERESEAT Mwwm

Gradv s Foedservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply)
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21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021

| 64 [Taylor Predsion

Suppller ary uom

Percent Off Supplier Notes

OR THERMO CHECK si i

* ECENTRAL RES]’AURANT PRODUCNCENTRAL PRODUCTS l.I.C) A ’ _ 576K QUOTED ATTIME OF PROJECT BUT HAVE ND! Ef g&épﬂl‘;&lf :
ilnternational Restaurant Distrd i rs, lm:. L. . ET’JA 0%
Beltram Edge Tool Supplv, Int: {(Belrra‘m Etige Taol Suppl\f, Inc. dlb/a Aol EA . - v . it !
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA
N Reynoids Distribator, Statesic Eqspment T ER: : " 1
Douglas Equipment {Deuglas Food Stores Inc) 1 EA
'johnson-Lancaster and Assochates fne.. 1 EA 7 "1
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA
*Central Restaurant DQ due to discount range offered.
| 65 [Traulsen
Supplier ary uom Percent O Supplier Notes
80.36% GFF ON CENTERLINE PREP TABLES, 79.22% QFF ON G-
SERIES REFRIGERATION, 70.71% OFF ON CENTERLINE (EXCEPT
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 80.36% PREP TABLES), §3.63% OFF ON SPEC LINE AND MILK COOLERS
Johnson-lancaster and Associates Inc. - i PUEA 69.0% i . PPBS%=74% |
‘Beltram Edige Toal Supply, Inc. {Bkitram Edze Tool Supiply, Inc, d/b/‘a aen _EA 64.006 BAY. G SERIES f 529 OTHER -
Traulsen Spec-Line 56% off listTraulsen Dealer < Choice 63% off
Internatignal Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 56.9% list
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipfrent C et EA S5.0% . oE E [
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 55.0%
Douglas Equipment {Dougtas Eand Stares e} e TER: A N f
Grady's Foodservice {Puehlo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 2.0%
[ 66 JrRue
Supp!ler ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
'CENTHAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT [CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC) ¢ - 4 v EA " 71,9235 Gt . )]
Discount Inc!udes General Foodservice and Specialty Retall
* International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 1 EA 67.0% Display Categaries. Exeludes Premium Bar Category.
Sam Tellapd Sonnc_ * . - ) FIE) 65.0% R ) N v 1
Beltram Edge Taol Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Suppty. Inc. dfbfa Bell EA 64.0%
{Dougtas Equipment (Dowglas Food Stores inc) I Y T AR . Lt }
WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equment 1 EA S0.0%
{ahnsoh-Lancasterand Associatesing o & ;.. ] 30.056 it R i
Grady's Feodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 EA 1008
* Range
[ 67 J1s Brass
Supplier ary uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
ICENTRAL RESTAURANT FRODUET (CENTRAL PROBUCTS, Lie) =37 BT 77 NOBH_ o ' T ;
*  sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 50.0%
Beltram Edge Tool | Supply, Iac. [Beltram Edge Tool Supply, tnc. d]b/a Bell EA 48.0% 48% GAS HOSES / 42% FAUCETS
lnlernéu'onél Restaurant Distributors, Inc. . B ' Y
{wH Reynolds { Dlstnbutor, Strategic Equipment’ - T TR T T ds.om T ] e i
lohnson-Lancaster and Assaciates Inc. EA 44.0%
[Dalgias Equipment {Dotgias Faod Stores nd) - ER A0 - T o
Grady’s Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) EA 0.0%

*5am Tell and Son Ine. DQ due to fallure to complete and
upload Prineipal Place of Business form.

3 Hnt-nn tn approve the consant agemfa and all c:msent agenda ltems numbered 8 through 13, including addenda f arw], as recemmended by the Ezmr’ntendent

Mo_t:_cn by Aflen Altman, second by F\]lGBﬂ Crumbley.
Final Resolution: Motion Carries

Yea: Aflen Aftman, Cynthia Armstrorg, Colleen Beaudoin, Alison Crumbley,:Megan Harding
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21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021

| 58 Ju.s. Range

Supplier QT\’ uom Percant Off Supplier Notes

{Beltram Edge Toc! Supply, Inc.{i

Edge Taol Supply, Inc.d/b/aBell. .~ £A . CONoBid e e

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) No Bid

B3 TEll 90D SON [0 gt e i e ek NOBI G s R oh N |
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CEN.TRAL PRODUCI'S LLC) No Bid

Johnsan-Lancaster and AssodiatesInc.; - ;. . Lot ARRASCHERT L - « B1.0%:

International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. 56.0%

(VT Revnols DistribUtor, SLFALERIS EOtpMEnt. ha. &t NGRS =

Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores Inc) 0.0%

[ 69 Junified Brands

Percent Off Supplier Notes

Supplier
15am Tell and SonInc * i T N, T 1
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS LLC) i No Bid

,W'H Reynotds Dlstrlbu'tor Strateglc ngpmem

Grady s Feodser\nce (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

gmulpment [Douglas jﬁﬁg

’}

International Restaurant Distributars, Inc. 1 EA Follett, Randell

Discnunt based on specifl: brand:

See A!to Shaam Groen,

[ 70 Juniversal staintess

Supplier qQry Uuom - Percent Off Supplier Notes

international R Distributors;inc.” - s LRI NoBid . +. © .. i u I

Grady's Foodservice {(Pueblo Hotel Supply) 1 No Bid

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT:{CENTRAL PRODUCTS; LLT) Shie No Bid - . OO
No Bid

BeItram Edge Tool Supply, lne. {Beltram Edge Teol Supplv, Ine. d/b/a Bell

prre

ws';zi“

ic Equip :
Douglas Equipment (Douglas Feod Stares Inc) 1

“TOSS of the COIN: .o,

1

*Sam Tefl and Son Inc, DQ due to fallure to complete and
upload Principal Place of Business form.

| 71 IVarimEzer

Supplier qQry uoMm
(CENTRAL RESTALURANT. " PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUICTS, LI.C) _' R BEAL TS
;Internaﬁonal Restaurant Distxibutnrs, fne. | ‘EA- !
|WH Reynolds Dlstrlbutor,StrategL&Equlpmeni o 4 AT

Sam Tell and Son Inc

DouglasEquspmen‘t(Déug Eq_%@.nres Incy it

Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Irc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc d/b/a Bell

Hoinson-lancaster and AssOtiates IR Lo~ & T *ﬁgg’?? ?E,\

Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply)

| 72 |victory
Suppller QryY uvom
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LiC) " 1 EA
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Food Stores Inc) 1 EA 65.0%
Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Inc, GB‘é!zi—am'Edg:e Tool Stipply, Inc. d/b/aBell: . !EA 64.0% L - : |
International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. EA 60.0%6
Uchnson-lancaster and Assotiatesing: = 55.00. i il
Sam Tell and Son Inc EA 55.0%
WH Reynolds Distelbutor, Strategle Equlpment: > o " oo EAG: " B0 L LT e
Grady's Foodservice (Pueblo Hotel Supply) EA 0.08%

fr Muh“. :

I Hotmn by Ai’eu A&tman, second by Alison CrumE!ey
Final Reso £ Motion Carries ’
Yea: A‘!en A?i.ma n, C,‘nthra Armstmng, Calleen Eeaudom, Ahsm Crumbley, Megan Hard'ng
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21-095-DM Large Kitchen Equipment BOARD: July 6, 2021

[ 73 |vollrath

Supplier Q.  uoMm Percent Off Supplier Notes

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT {CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 55.93%

Beltram Edge Tool Supply, Inc, (Beltram Edge Tool Supply, [nc. d[b[a Bell EA 52.0% EQUIPMENT ONLY

[rotnson-Lancaster and Associates Inc.. I N S i T o i s Y T

International Restaurant Distributors, 1nc. 1 EA SLO% T

Sam TellandSorn inc i i SUete T TR SRR e e S0.08 - e LR

Douglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stares Inc] 1 EA 40.0%

PWH Reynolds Distributor, SUBLRgIC BQUIpMENt o ot o R g TR Ao g‘@. L R L e

Grady's Feodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply} 1 EA

| 7a |vulcan

Supplier ary uUom Percent Off Supplier Notes
79.75% ON VCAG, VCAE, VC44G & VCA4E CONVECTION GVENS.
69,93% OFF ALL STOCKED STEAM EQUIPMENT {STEAMERS,
TILT SKILLETS AND STEAM KETTLES) 54.7% OFF ALL OTHER

CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA 79.75% ITEMS

“ohnion-Lancaster and Associates Inc.. TTEA, - 66.006) 1. = "PPB SR Fi%,. o 4

Béltram Edge Tool Sup&y, Iné, (ngttzam Edge Tool Supplhy, Inc, dlb]a Betl EA ;4 65,006 65% PLATINUM /592 NONPLATINUM . " ; ]

International Restaurant Distributors, Inc. EA 60,1 0%

Wi ReynoldS BiE TibTor, Strategic EQUIPMent. ) AT L AT AN ] i

Sarn Tell and Son Inc EA

iDouglas Equipment (Douglas focd Stores Ing) - 7 EA

Grady's Foodservice {Pueblo Hotel Supply) EA

[[75 Jwells/Bloomfield
Supplier ary uoMm
:CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT ICE‘N_]'RAI. PRODUGS,M) i 4 N
Johnson-Lancaster and Associates Inc. 1
Dauglas Equipment (Douglas Food Stores Ing) > . - - 15

International Restaurant Distributors, Inc, 1
iWH Reynalds Distribator, Strategickatmpment . o o oA R TR
Beltram Edge Too! Supply, Inc. (Beltram Edge Tool Supplv, Inc. d/bfa Befl 45,0%
Sarn Tell and SOR N, " . i s GO B O] TR e
Grady’s Foodservice (Puebla Hotel Supplv] 1 0.0%

[ 75 Jwinston
Supplier QTY uom Percent Off Supplier Notes
{Grady's Fopgdservice (Puzblo Hotel SUPPIVL. o r i o 1 e ER T R T
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS LI.C) 1 EA No Bld
{International Restaurant Distributors, ine, 5 . 175" 1 EA_ S BREH T A N
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA 50.0%
{WH Reynolds Distributor, Strategic Equipment -~ . LT CER, w5006 < i s o1
Dewglas Equipment (Dovglas Food Stores ine) 1 EA 30.0%
[Beftram EdgaTTon) Supply, inc (BelTam EdRe Too] SHABIIInG. d/bra. Bel1 FEA IR O e T e
Johnson-Lancaster and Associates Inc, EA 5,0%

| 77 ]Zurn
Supplier ary UOM Percent Off Suppher Nates
‘Internatianal RestaurantDlstnbutqg_g,an. EaE COER i wocr NGB g L N IR i
CENTRAL RESTAURANT PRODUCT (CENTRAL PRODUCTS, LLC) 1 EA No Bid
BelitrTam Edgd Yool Supnlv, It (Heltf3m Edga Taol Supalv-ine. a/bja BeL i B T T R Bl L T e
Iohnson-Lancaster and Associates Inc, 1 EA No Bid
{Grady's Foodservice [Pueblo Hotel Supply) o« o o A B e No Bl e —— "
Sam Tell and Son Inc 1 EA No Bid
{WH Reynolds Dictribtitor, Strategic Equipment . & 5 . 1 EA oo e
Douglas Equipment {Douglas Faod Stores Inc) 1 EA 0.0%
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