

**Agenda Item Details**

Meeting	Jul 11, 2016 - Regular Meeting
Category	7. Consent Agenda
Subject	7.8 Tag-On Bid: RFP 161202 Food Processing USDA Commodities, presented by Vince Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended by the Superintendent for approval.
Access	Public
Type	Action (Consent)
Fiscal Impact	Yes
Budgeted	Yes
Budget Source	Federal Funds
Recommended Action	Motion to approve tagging on with The School Board of Escambia County on RFP 161202 Food Processing: USDA Commodities.

Public Content

Request approval to tag-on with RFP 161202 Food Processing: USDA Commodities through The School Board of Escambia County to provide commodity processing of bulk food items. The bid was awarded to multiple vendors and will be used on an as needed basis. The contract is effective August 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017. A copy of the award tabulation is attached.

For additional information, please contact Rick Norris, Specialist, School Food Service at (850) 301-3020.

AWARD TAB FOR RFP 161202.pdf (1,421 KB)

Administrative Content

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member.

Motion & Voting

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by the Superintendent

Motion by Rodney Walker, second by Dewey Destin.

Final Resolution: Motion Carries

Yes: Dewey Destin, Cathy Thigpen, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker, Lamar White



**Agenda Item Details**

Meeting	Jul 11, 2016 - Regular Meeting
Category	7. Consent Agenda
Subject	7.8 Tag-On Bid: RFP 161202 Food Processing USDA Commodities, presented by Vince Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended by the Superintendent for approval.
Access	Public
Type	Action (Consent)
Fiscal Impact	Yes
Budgeted	Yes
Budget Source	Federal Funds
Recommended Action	Motion to approve tagging on with The School Board of Escambia County on RFP 161202 Food Processing: USDA Commodities.

Public Content

Request approval to tag-on with RFP 161202 Food Processing: USDA Commodities through The School Board of Escambia County to provide commodity processing of bulk food items. The bid was awarded to multiple vendors and will be used on an as needed basis. The contract is effective August 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017. A copy of the award tabulation is attached.

For additional information, please contact Rick Norris, Specialist, School Food Service at (850) 301-3020.

AWARD TAB FOR RFP 161202.pdf (1,421 KB)

Administrative Content

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member.

Motion & Voting

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by the Superintendent

Motion by Rodney Walker, second by Dewey Destin.

Final Resolution: Motion Carries

Yes: Dewey Destin, Cathy Thigpen, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker, Lamar White





THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Boulevard
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
March 7, 2016

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Food Processing: USDA Commodities, RFP
#161202

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement to provide food processing of USDA commodity items into ready to use products for use in the preparation of school lunches. Items are stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for cafeterias throughout the District. Bidders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for the commodity/lot were awarded in each area. No bids were received for nine (9) items and seven (7) items were not awarded for various reasons. Sixty-two (62) items were bid, forty-six (46) items are awarded.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:
Bongards, Chaska, MN	6	\$ 59,397.00
Chef's Corner, Hayward, CA	4	234,232.00
Jennie-O, Willmar, MN	8	240,872.00
JTM Processing, Harrison, OH	9	290,180.00
Land O' Lakes, St. Paul, MN	7	72,868.00
Pilgrim's Pride, Tucker, GA	2	411,300.00
Tyson Foods, Springdale, AR	10	717,360.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$2,026,209.00 Est. / Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD RFP

Responses Received: 20 Responses Rejected: 1

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

March 7, 2016, 2:30 pm Central Time

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY												
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT												
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD												
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505												
BID TABULATION												
DATE: February 24, 2016												
RFP NBR: 161202												
BID TITLE: Food Processing: USDA Commodities												
Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Meat Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
1	Sweet and Sour Chicken (0516820)	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Green Dragon/Asian Food Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	72005	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	72005	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	3.90 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	176 servings	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	6/5# ck, 6/2.15# sauce	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$82.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.5461	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (0516830)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Green Dragon/Asian Food Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	73001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	73001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	2.85 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	240	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	6/7.15 # ck & sauce	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$81.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.4149	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Green Dragon/Asian Food Solutions	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	72001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	72001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	3.90 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	176	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	6/5# ck, 6/2.15# sauce	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$81.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.5405	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]

[illegible]

[illegible]

[illegible]

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
17	Beef Taco Meat - Reduced Sodium (0516170)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNK12500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNK12500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.03 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	158	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4623	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Beef Meatballs (0516191)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	1-17-505-0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ28053VS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	3-17-505-0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN280053VS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	2.5 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.00 OZ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	192/2.5 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	23.02 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.4851	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Ground Beef Patties (0516115)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ162403	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN162403	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.40 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.7613	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
26	Turkey Roast (0516311)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Shady Brook Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8700131	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8700131	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.13 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	19#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.548	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Turkey Pot Roast (DELETED)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Shady Brook Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	700267	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	700267	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.54 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	135	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$49.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.707	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Shady Brook Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	700196	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	700196	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.00 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	160	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	20#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.184	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
29	Beef, Flame Broiled Patty (0516113)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	1-155-525-20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ212503	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	155-525-20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN212503	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	2.5 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.50 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	31.25 lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	31.25 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	19.42 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.4782	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5813	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30	Country Fried Steak (0516150)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	69035	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ633803	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	68035	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN633503	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	3.8 oz.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.80 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	130	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	20.19 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.875 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	11.65 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$25.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.8203	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.7082	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
31	Beef Steak, Cooked, Breaded (0516132) (DELETED)	(a)(u)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	APF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Don Lee Farms	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	1-15-312-09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CNQ621603	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	15-312-09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	CN621603	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	1.01 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.60 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	475	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30.00 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	42.32 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$29.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.3790	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4316	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]

[illegible]

[illegible]

[illegible]

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	Don Lee Farms Ingleswood, CA	ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms Livingston, CA	Jennie-O Turkey Willmar, MN
50	Macaroni and Cheese, Red.Fat, Red. Sodium, Whl Grain (0517600)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	ES FOODS	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	05915	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	05915	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6.002	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	80	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.89	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.60	No Bid	No Bid
51	Bread Sticks, Cheese Filled, Reduced Fat (0516640) (DELETED)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	The Max	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	77387-12722	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	77387-12722	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.95 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	192	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.2284	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
51	Bread Sticks, Cheese Filled, Reduced Fat (0516640) (DELETED)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gilardi	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16272-20117	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16272-20117	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.21 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	144	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.49	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.3514	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
52	Tomato Catsup (0507090)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
53	Tomato Catsup, Individual (0507102)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]

[illegible]

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR			
1	Sweet and Sour Chicken (0516820)	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	Minh	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15551-7	No Bid	No Bid	69016 100113- Chicken Legs	No Bid	No Bid			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15551-7	No Bid	No Bid	69016	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	3.6 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz	No Bid	No Bid			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	192 servings	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	No Bid			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	43.5 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	42.00 Net lbs	No Bid	No Bid			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$94.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$140.61	No Bid	No Bid			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5680	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6560	No Bid	No Bid			
2	Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (0516830)	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	(a)(u)			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	Minh	No Bid	Tyson			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15554-8	No Bid	No Bid	69018 10013-Chicken Legs	No Bid	026072-0928			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15554-8	No Bid	No Bid	69018	No Bid	026072-0928			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz	No Bid	3.31 oz			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	240 serv.	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	180			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	42 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	42.00 Net lbs	No Bid	37.32#			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$87.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$115.05	No Bid	\$76.13			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4403	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5500	No Bid	\$0.67			
3	Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	(a)(u)			
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	Minh	No Bid	Tyson			
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15555-5	No Bid	No Bid	69020 100113- Chicken Legs	No Bid	026073-0928			
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15555-5	No Bid	No Bid	69020	No Bid	026073-0928			
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	3.6 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz	No Bid	4 oz			
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	192 serv.	No Bid	No Bid	240	No Bid	142			
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	43.5 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	42.00 Net lbs	No Bid	35.80#			
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$88.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$140.61	No Bid	\$75.54			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.5371	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6560	No Bid	\$0.82			

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dunmore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
4	Kung Pao Chicken Without Vegetables (0516651)	No Bid	No Bid	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	Ling's	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15556-2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	8-52724-15556-2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	2.8 oz per serving	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	240 serv	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	42 lbs net weight	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	\$87.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.4403	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Chicken, 8 Piece Breaded (0516550)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(a)(u)
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	666000-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	666000-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.7-8.4 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57/100 Range (Target 82 svq)
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	29.64#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$55.13
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.95
6	Chicken, 8 Piece Roasted (0516540)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(a)(u)
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Tyson
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	021879-0928
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	021879-0928
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.7-6.5 oz
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57/100 85 Target
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	23.06#
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.93
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.72
7	Chicken Patty, Small, Breaded (0516561)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	635300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	635300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.63 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	294	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.198	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwartz's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
8	Chicken Patty, Home-Style, Breaded (0516801) Brand:	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	665400	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	665400	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.05 oz	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	156	No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.40	No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.373	No Bid	No Bid	
9	Chicken Patty, Breaded, Hot and Spicy (0516910) Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	666600	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	666600	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.05 oz	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	156	No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.30	No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.396	No Bid	No Bid	
10	Chicken Tender-Shaped Strips Breaded (0516860) Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	625300	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	625300	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.06 oz	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	156	No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.40	No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.373	No Bid	No Bid	

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rite Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwab's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
11	Chicken Tenders, WHI Muscle, Breaded (0516660)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
12	Popcorn Chicken, Breaded (0516871)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	691600	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	691600	No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.08 oz	No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	103	No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	20#	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$28.60	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.395	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
13	Popcorn Chicken, Spicy, Breaded (0516880)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
14	Chicken Breast Filets, WHI Muscle, Breaded (0516930)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gold Kist	No Bid	No Bid	
	Commercial Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7516	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7516	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4 oz	No Bid	No Bid	
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	120	No Bid	No Bid	
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$67.80	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.77	No Bid	No Bid	

[illegible]

[illegible]

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rite Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
26	Turkey Roast (0516311)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Turkey Pot Roast (DELETED)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	Beef, Flame Broiled Patty (0516113)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(a)(u)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Maid-Rite	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	75156-93427	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	75156-03427	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.25 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	213	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30 lbs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6418	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]

[illegible]

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rite Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwann's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
37	Cheese Sauce, Pouch, Cheddar, Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium, Shelf Stable (0517850)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
38	Jalepeno Cheese Sauce, Frozen (0507172)	(m)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	JTM		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	5708	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	5708	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	1.82 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	263	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	30 #	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	\$33.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	\$0.2394	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
39	Jalepeno Cheese Sauce, Shelf Stable (0507172)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
40	Cheese Sauce, Italian, Shelf Stable	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
41	American Cheese, Yellow, Sliced, Reduced Fat and Sodium (0516350)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Land O Lakes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	46288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	46288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	1 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	480	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$28.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
42	American Cheese, White, Sliced, Reduced Fat, Refrigerated (0516352)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Land O Lakes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	46219	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	46219	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	1 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	480	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	30#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	JTM Processing Harrison, OH	Land O Lakes, Arden Hills, MN	Ling's El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA	Schwan's Food Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Tyson Foods Springdale, AR
43	American Cheese, 5-Pound Loaves, Refrigerated (0516341)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
44	Cheese Portions, Cheddar Cheese, Reduced Fat, Mild, Refrigerated (0517640)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Land O Lakes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	44881	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	44881	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	1 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	168	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	10.50#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$20.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45	Cheese Portions, Colby Jack Cheese, Reduced Fat, Refrigerated	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	No Bid	Land O Lakes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:	No Bid	44878	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commercial Code:	No Bid	44878	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size:	No Bid	1 oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portions / Case:	No Bid	168	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Case Size:	No Bid	10.50#	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Fee For Service/Case:	No Bid	\$20.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	No Bid	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]

[illegible]

[illegible]

[illegible]

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST													
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids .													
Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.													
I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.													
<i>John Dombroskie</i>													
John Dombroskie, Director													
Purchasing Director													



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Boulevard
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
March 7, 2016

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Food Processing: USDA Commodities, RFP
#161202

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement to provide food processing of USDA commodity items into ready to use products for use in the preparation of school lunches. Items are stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for cafeterias throughout the District. Bidders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for the commodity/lot were awarded in each area. No bids were received for nine (9) items and seven (7) items were not awarded for various reasons. Sixty-two (62) items were bid, forty-six (46) items are awarded.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:
Bongards, Chaska, MN	6	\$ 59,397.00
Chef's Corner, Hayward, CA	4	234,232.00
Jennie-O, Willmar, MN	8	240,872.00
JTM Processing, Harrison, OH	9	290,180.00
Land O' Lakes, St. Paul, MN	7	72,868.00
Pilgrim's Pride, Tucker, GA	2	411,300.00
Tyson Foods, Springdale, AR	10	717,360.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$2,026,209.00 Est. / Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD RFP

Responses Received: 20 Responses Rejected: 1

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

March 7, 2016, 2:30 pm Central Time