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As.enda Item Details 

Meeting Jun 22, 2015 - Regular Meeting 

Category 7. Consent Agenda 

Subject 7.16 Tag-On Bid: RFP 151803 Food Processing: USDA Commodities, presented by Vince 
Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended by the Superintendent for 
approval. 

Access Public 

Type Action (Consent) 

Fiscal Impact No 

Budgeted No 

Budget Source Federal funds 

Recommended Motion to approve tag-on bid RFP 151803 Food Processing: USDA Commodities through 
Action Escambia County to processing USDA Commodities items. 

Public Content 

Request approval to tag-on with The School Board of Escambia County on RFP 151803 Food Processing: 
USDA Commodities to process commodity items on an as needed basis. Multiple vendors were awarded and 
the contract is effective through July 31, 2016. 

For additional information, please contact Rick Norris, Specialist, School Food Service at (850) 301-3020. 

TABULATION.pdf (1.693 KB) 

Administrative Content 

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several 
items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been 
provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items 
may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member. 

Motion & Votin.9 

Motion by Dewey Destin, second by Rodney Walker. 
Final Resolution: Motion Carries 
Yes: Dewey Destin, Cathy Thigpen, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker, Lamar White 

https://www.boarddocs.com/fl/okaloosa/Board.nsf/Private?open&login 





THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 

DATE: January 22,2015 
BID NBR: 151803 

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD 
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505 

BID TABULATION 

BID TITLE: Food Procesalng: USDA Commodltlea 

Item Advance American 
No. Vendor Pierre Fooda Fooda Group 

SwHt and Sour Chicken 
1 051&820 No Bid No Bid 

Brand 
Commod· Code #. 
Commercial Code#. 
Port1on Size· 

Portions/Case 
Case Size· 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total PriCe/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Smoked BBQ Teriyakl Chicken 
2 0518830) No Bid No Bid 

Brand: 

Commodity Code t: 
Commercial Code# 
Portion Size. 
Portions/Case· 
Case SIZe 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Mandarin Orange Chicken 
3 0518840) No 81d No Bid 

Brand 
Commodity Code I 
Commercial Code t: 
Port1on SIZe. 
Port•onsJCase 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portton Includes OF S Value 

Aalan Food 
Solutlona 

-~ 

Cargill ConAgra 
Brookwood Cargill Meat Kitchen Chera Corner Food• Salea, Giorgio Don lee 

Bongard Farma Inc. Solution a Solution• Foods LLC E S Fooda Food• Inc. Farm• 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d 
Chefs Corner 
CMOTYWG-0116 
COMWG-0116 
3.920 

171 
42.00 
27.09 

6626 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid a)(Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Cheh Comer 

CMDTY-01178 
COM-01178 
2.800 
240 
42.00 
27.88 

4000 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Chefs Corner 
CMDTYWG-0111 
COMWG-0111 
3.920 
171 
42.00 
27.88 

.6400 
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CarQIII ConAgra 
11em Advance Amerk:an Aalan Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Kttchen Chera Corner Food• Salea, Giorgio Don lee 
No. Vendor Pierre Food• Food• GrouD Solutlona Bonaard Farrnalnc. Solution• SoluUona Foodo LLC E S Fooda Fooda Inc. Farma 

Kung Pao Chicken wlo Vega 

• 0516851) No Bid No Sid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid a)(Y) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Btd 
Brand: ChehComer 
CommoditY Code 1/.: CMOTY-01138 
Commercial Code#: COM-0113B 
Portion Size. 2.800 
Portions/Case 240 
Case SIZe: 42.00 
Fee for Service/ Case 27.88 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 4000 

Chicken, 8 Piece Breaded 
5 05165~ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand: 
Commod Code f.: 
Commercial Code 1/. 

N/A Port1on Size 

Port1onsJCase 
Case Size 
Fee for Serv1ce/ Case 

Total Price/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value 

Chicken, 8 Piece, Roa1ted 
6 0516540_)_ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand 
Commodrt Code tJ 

Commercial Code # 
N/A Port1on Size 

Portions/Case· 
Case Saze 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total PriCe/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
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Cargill ConAgra 
Item Kitchen Cher• Corner Food• Sale•, 

le s Fooda 
I Giorgio loon Lee 

No. Vendor Solution• Foodo LLC Foodl,lnc. Farm• 

Chicken Patty, Small, Breaded 
10518581) No Bid No Bid No81d I No Bid !No Bid !No Bid 
Brand: 
Commodity Code 'It: 
Commerc1al Code 1· 

N/A 'Portion Size 

Portions/Case: 
~ 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion jlncludes OF$ Value 

Chicken Patty, Home .. tyle Brd. 

i0516801l !No Bid JNo B1d I No Bid !No Bid I No Bid !No Bid INoBid JNo 81d INoBid !No Bid I No Bid !No B1d 
Brand. 

Commodity Code t· 
Commercial Code t· 

N/A I Portion SIZe: 

Portions/Case. 

Case Size 

Fee for Serv1ce/ Case 

Total Pnce/ Port1on jlncludes OF$ Value 

Chick Patty, Hot & SpM:y, Brd. 

,05115810! JNo B1d jNo Bid JNo B1d jNo Bid jNoBid JNo Bid !No Bid JNo Bid !No Bid /No B1d !No 81d !No 81d 
Brand 
Commodity Code #I 
Commercial Code .,. 

N/A IPort1on SIZe 

Portions/Case. 
~ 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total PriCe/ Portion {Includes OF$ Value 
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Cerulli ConAgre 

Item I Kitchen Chers Corner Foods Seles, I Giorgio lOon lee 
No. Vendor Solutions Food a LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Ferms 

Chick Tend..Sheped Strips, Brd. 
10 I 0516860 No Bid No Bid No 81d No Bid I No Bid !No B1d 

Brand 
Commodit Code tl 
Commercial Code 1: 
Port1on Size 
Portions/Cas 
Case Size 
Fee for Serv~ce/ Case. 

Total PriCe/ Portion {Includes OF$ Value 

Chlek Tend, Whole Muscle, Brd. 
11 1!05166501 (No Bid INo Bid INoBid I No Bid I No Bid I No B1d INoBid I No Bid (No Bid I No Bid I No Bid (No Bid 

Brand· 
Commodity Code t· 
Commercial Code tl: 

N/A )Portion Size 

Portions/Case· 

Case Size: 
~e/Cese· 
Total PriCe/ Portion ~Includes OF$ Value 

Popcorn ChM;ken, Breaded 
12 1(05168711 I No Bid (No B1d I No B1L_______k!Q B_id __ INoBid (No Bid ~- ~<L- ~-ei~Bid (No Bid (No Bid 

Brand 
Commodity Code I 

Commercial Code t1 
~ 
PortlOiiSiCaS8. 
~ 
~eJCase· 
Total Price/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value 

4 of38 



Clrgill ConAgr. 
Item Advance Amer'can Allan Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Kitchen Cher• Corner Food1 Sale•. Giorgio Don Lee 

No. Vendor Pierre Food• Food• Group Solution• Bongard Farm• Inc. Solution• Solution• Foodo LLC E S Food• Food• Inc. Farm• 

Popcorn Ch'cken, Spicy, Brd. 
13 0516880 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bld No B1d No Bid No Bid 

Brand 
Commodll: Code t 
Commercial Code i# 

N/A Portion Size. 

Portions/Case 

Case Size 

Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Pnce/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Chicken Bre .. t Flletl, Whole Muacle, 
Bread. 

14 0516930 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand. 

Commodit Code II: 
Commercial Code t: 
Portion Size· 
Portions/Case: 
Case SIZe 
Fee for Service/ Case· 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Chicken Fajita Strip• 
15 051681HlJ. No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid 

Brand 
Commod Code#t 
Commercial Code tl 
Port1on Size: 

PortiOns/Case 
Case SIZe 

Fee for Serv1cei Case 

Total Price/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value 
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Cargill ConAgra 
Item ~~dvance ~~merlcan ~~alan Food II ~~rookwood ~~arglll Meat Kitchen Chera Corner Food• Sales, If ~~torgio lOon lee 
No. Vendor Pierre Food• Food• Group Solution• Bongard Farm• Inc. Solution• Solutiona Food• LLC E S Fooda Food•. Inc. Farm• 

Grilled Chicken Patty 

_ko Bid _koBid 16 0518560 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid I No Bid 

Brand 

Commochty Code t1 
Commercial Code .,. 
Portion Size: 
~ 
~ 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Prtee/ Port10n !Includes OF$ Value). 

Beef Crumble• 
17 I 05169701 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 81d No Bid a Y 

Brand M'F American Fds Don Lee 
Commodit Code tl 1-320610-20 290663 CNQ21104 
Commercial Code '1: 3·320610·20 290862 CN21104 
Portion Size: 2.000 2.000 2.50 

I PortiOns/Case 287 240 256 
Case Siza: 3000 30.00 40.0 

~ Fee for Service/ Case: 23.66 26 00 28.96 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 4069 .2750/2700 4397 

BeefT.co Meat, Reduced Sod. 
18 lcos16170l a)(u No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d 

Brand. APF -DoilLee 

Commodit Code I 32432·328 CNQK12500 
Commercial Code '1: 32432-330 CNK12500 
Portion Size: 2.400 3.030 
Port1ons/Case 220 158 
Case SIZe 33.00 30.00 
Fee for Service/ Case 31.90 23.31 

Total Pnce/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value) 4067 .4456 
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Cargill ConAgra 
Item Advance American A•lan Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Kitchen Chers Corner Foods Sale•, Gtorglo Oonlu 
No. Vendor Pierre Foods Food• Group Soluttons Bongard Farms Inc. Solutton• Solutlona Foods LLC E S Food• Food• Inc. Farm• 

BeefMelltballt; 
10 0518181 No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand· APF American Fds Don Lee 
Commod· Code tl: 1-17-505-0 290855 CNQ28053VS 
Commercial Code II: 3-17-505-0 290854 CN28053VS 
Portion Size 2.500 0.500 2.000 
Portions/Case· 192 9<30 240 
Case Size 30.00 30.00 30.00 

Fee for Serv1cel Case: 24.96 26.61 24.78 

Total PriCe/ Portion Includes OF$ Value .4784 1072/.1050 .4443 

Turkey Sausage Patty 
20 0516210 No81d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 81d 

Brand 

Commodity Code •· 
Commercial Code II 
Port1on SIZe 
Port1onsJCase 
Case SIZe. 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total PriCe/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Turkey Ham 
21 05162211 No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No B1d No Bid No 81d No B1d 

Brand: 
Commodity Code 11· 
Commercial Code tl: 
Port1on Size: 

Portions/Case 

Case Size. 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Pnce/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value) 

7 of38 



Cargill ronAgra 
Item I 'Brookwood !Cargill Meat 'Kitchen lchero Corner Foods Sales, 

IE S Foods 
'Giorgio lOon Lee 

No. Vendor Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foodo LLC Foods. Inc. Farms 

Turkey Ham, Deli Style, 
Pre-ellced 

22 0516220) No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid I No B1d INo Bid I No Bid I No Bid !NoB~ I No Bid 
Brand Harvest Prov 

Commodity Code tl 700275 
Commercial Code tl 700275 
Portion Size 3.430 
Portions/Case· 140 
Case Size 30.00 
Fee for Service/ Case. 67.66 

Total Price/ Portton {Includes OF S Value) .7260 

Roast Turkey Breast, Deli Style, 
Pre-eliced 

23 I 0511S:WO NoB1d No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid INoBid INo Bid I No Bid I No Bid INoB~ I No Bid 
Brand: Harvest Prov. 
Commod Codet 700168 
Commercial Code t: 700168 
Portion Size: 3930 
Portions/Case 122 
Case Size: 30.00 

Fee for Servtce/ Case 62.62 

Total Price/ Port1on Includes OF S Value 7800 

Turkey Roast 
24 1{0516311) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid IN~ Bid INo Bid I No Bid I No Bid I No Bid I No B1d 

Brand· HarvestProv 

CommoditY Code tl 8700131 

Commercial Code tl 8700131 
Port1on Size 3130 
Portions/Case 97 
Case Size: 19.00 
Fee for Service/ Case 1.510 

Total Price/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value) 5390 
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Cargill ConAgra 
Item Advance Amerk:an Allan Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Khchen Chef'• Corner Food• Salel, Giorgio Don lee 
No. Vendor Pierre Fooda Food1 Grouo Solution• Bonaard Fann11nc. Solution a Solution• Foodo LLC E S Fooda Fooda Inc. Fanno 

Beer, Flame BroUed Patty 
25 0518113 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand APF American Fds 
Commodity Code # 1-155-525-20 290807 
Commercial Code t: 155-525-20 290808 
Portion Size 2500 2.5 
Portions/Case 200 200 
Case Size 31.25 3125 
Fee for Serv~cel Case. 18.00 22.34 
Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value .4537 .4744/ 4640 

Country Fried Steak 
28 0518150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand: APF 

Commodity Code #: 89035 
Commercial Code t· 88035 
Portion Size: 3800 
Portions/Case 85 
Case Size: 2019 
Fee for Service/ Case 19.98 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 7635 

Beer Steak, Cooked, Breaded 
27 0518132} No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Btd 

Brand 
Commodit Code t 
Commerc•al Code I# 
Portion SIZe 
Port1ons/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ PortiOn Includes OF$ Value 
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Cargill ConAgra 
Item Advance Amerk:an Aalan Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Kitchen Chef'a Corner Fooda Salea, Giorgio Don Lee 
No. Vendor Pierre fooda foodaGroup Solutlona Bon ard farma Inc. Solutions Solutlona fooda LLC E S fooda Fooda Inc. farma 

Cheese Portions, Mozzarella String, 
Refrigerated 

31 0517030 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand 
Com mod Code# 
Commercial Code 1:: 
Portion ~ize. 
Portions/Case: 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Pnce/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
Cheese Sauce, Pouch, Cheddar, Reduced 
Fat, Reduced Sodium, Refrigerated 

32 0517650) No B1d No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d 
Brand 
Commodity Code 1:. 
Commercial Code t· 
Portion SIZe 
Portions/Case: 
Case Size 
Fee for Serv1ce/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Jalapeno Gheen Sauce, 
Reduced Fat 

33 0507172 No Bid No Bid No B1d No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand. 
Commod· Code t#: 
Commercial Code t#: 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case: 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case. 

Total Pnce/ Port1on (Includes OF$ Value) 
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Cargill ConAgra 
Item Advance American Allan Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee 
No. Vendor Pierre Foods Foods Group Solution• Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods Inc. Farms 

Macaroni and Chee1e, Reduced Fat, 
Reduced Sodium, Whole Grain 

40 0517600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: E S Foods 
Commod· Code I 5915 
Commercial Code 11. 5915 
Portion Size. 6.000 
Portions/Case 80 
Case Size 30.00 
Fee for Service/ Case 3489 
Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 6109 

Bread Sticb, ChMH filled, 
Reduced Fat 

41 0518640 No Bid No B1d No Bid No B1d No B1d No Bid NoB1d No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commodit Code#: 
Commercial Code 11: 
Portion Size· 
Portions/Case· 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Pnce/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Bread Sticb, ChH .. Filled, 
Reduced Fat 

41 0516&40 No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Bran 

ommodit 0 • 
ommercia ode I 
ort1on lle: 

Portions/Case 
ase lle. 

Fee for Service/ Case· 

Total Pr~ee/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value 

ChMse Sticks, Mozzarella, Brd. 
42 0517680 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand. 
Commod· Code t· 
Commercial Code11 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case. 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case· 

Total Pnce/ Portion Includes OF S Value 
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Cargill ConAgra 
Item Cargill Meat Kitchen Chera Corner Foods Sales, Don Lee 

No. Vendor Solution• Solutions Food a LLC Fanna 

Tomita Cataup, Shelf Stable 
43 0507090 No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid 

Brand: 
Commocf Code #: 
Commercial Code fl· 
Portion Size. 
Portion siCa! 
Case Size· 
Fee for Servicel Case: 

Total Price/ Portion ~Includes OF$ Value 

Tomita Cataup, lndtvldual, 
Shelf Stable .. 0507102} _____11;0 Bid ~j~ JNo Bid _ !No~ !No~ JNo Bid_____lNo Bid ~ JNo Bkl (No Bid JNo Bkl INoS•d 
Brand: 
Commodity Code II 
Commercial Code# 
Portion Size 

Portions/Case 
~ 
Fee for Servicel Case 

No Sid ~-INo_B_id ___ (No~ __ (No Sid _______ill~ Sid ~ I No Bid I No Sid I No Bkl I No Bid 

Commercial Code I: 
Portion SIZe. 
Portions/Case: 
~ 
Fee for Servicel Case 

Total Price/ Portion {Includes OF$ Value 

15 of38 



Cargill ConAgra 
Item Advance Amerk:an Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Kitchen Cher. Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don lee 
No. Vendor Pierre Foods Foods Group Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foodo LLC E S Foods Foods Inc. Farms 

Salsa, Dipping Cup, Low Sodium, Shelf 
Stabhl .. 0507350 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d 
Brand 
Commod· Code II: 
Commercial Code#: 
Portion Size. 
Portions/Case· 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Marinara Sauce, Shelf Stable 
47 0505200~ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand: 

CommoditY Code #: 
Commercial Code#". 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case. 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case. 

Total Pnce/ Port10n Includes OF$ Value 

Spaghetti Sauce, Shelf Stable .. 050805111 No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand. 
Commodit Code 1#. 
Commercial Code II 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case 
Case Size. 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

16of38 



Cargill ConAgra 
Item Advance American Atlan Food Brookwood Cargill Meat Kitchen Chert Corner Foodt Salet, Giorgio Don lee 
No. Vendor Pierre Foodt Food• GrouD Solution• Bonaard Farmtlnc. Solution• Solution• Fooda LLC E S Fooda Foodt Inc. Farmt 

Whole Grain Cheetelaugna 
Roll Up 

•• 051.500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commod Codet: 
Commercial Code tl 
Portion Size· 
Portions/Case· 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 

Chicken Taco, Mini 
50 0514530 No81d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand 
Commod Codetl· 
Commercial Code.,. 
Portion Saze 
Portions/Case. 
Case Size· 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portaon Includes OF S Value 

Quetadilla, Bib Chicken 
51 0517&40 No Bid No B1d NoB1d No B1d No Bid No B1d NoB•d No Bid No B1d No Bad No Bad 

Brand 
Commodit Code ,. 

Commercial Code ' 
Portion Size. 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Pnce/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value 
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Cargill IConAgro 
ijeml IAdvtnce \American \Asian Food 

loongard 
\Brookwood \Cargill Meat ~Kitchen lchero Corner Foods Sales, 

\e s Foods 
\Giorgio 1Don Lee 

Vendor Pierre Foods Foods Group Solutions Fsrms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foodo LLC Foods,lnc. Farms No. 

Stromboli, Pepperoni and 
Cheese 

52 I 05145101 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid I No B•d 
Brand· Gior io 

Commo_Q_i!Y_Code #: 5193 
Commercial Code#: 5193 

N/A Portion Size 4.200 
PorttonsJCase 72 
Case SIZe 2250 
Fee for Service/ Case 45.51 

Total Pnce/ PortiOn Includes OF$ Value 7000 

Omelet, Colby Cheese 
53 I 05160601 No B1d No Bid No Btd No Btd No Bid No Std No Btd No Sid No Bid No Bid I No Btd 

Brand Sunny Fresh 
ommo ode if 4 1 

Commercial Code if 40176 

N/A Portion Size 2.100 

Portions/Case 225 
Case Size 29.53 
Fee for Service/ Case 45.00 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 2830 

Potatoes, Roaated Chunks 
54 I o514430 No Bid No Bid No Bid No~ N~_ No Bid ___ No Bid __jN.o.Bid ~Bid I No Bid __ !NoB~ I No Bid 

Brand· 
Commodity Code if 
Commercial Code Ill. 
Portion Size. 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case. 

Total Pnce/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value 
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Item 
No. 

Potato Wedges 
1!0514311) 

Vendor 

Brand: 
~Code#: 
Commercial Code#' 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case 
Case Size: 
Fee for Servicel Case 

Total PriCe/ Port1on (Includes OF$ Value 

Advance ~American ~Asian Food 
Pierre Foods Foods Group Solutions I Bongard 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Cargill 
Brookwood ~Cargill Meat IKttchen 
Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions 

NoB1d No Bid No Bid 
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ConAgra 
Chefs Corner ~Foods Sales, I ~Giorgio lOon Lee 
Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Fsrm• 

No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 



Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Broa Schwan'• 

Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provlalona McCain Food• Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim'• Pride Food Service, 
No. Foodalnc. Sale• Lilac Co Inc. Una's USA Food• Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold LLC Inc. Tasty Branda 

Sweet and Sour Chicken 
1 0516820 No Bid No Bid No Bid a m Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand: lin s 
Commocf Code t1· 8-52724-1551-7 
Commercial Code#: 8-52724-1551-7 
Portion Size 3.800 
Portions/Case 192 
Case Size 43.51 
Fee for SeiVice/ Case 92.16 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 6042 
Smoked BBQ Teriyakl Chicken 

2 0516830) No Bid No Bid No Bid m No Bid No Bid No Bid No Sid No Sid No Bid No Bid 
Brand· lings 
Commodity Code tl. 8-52724-15554-8 
Commercial Code# 8-52724-15554-8 
Portion Size 2 800 
Portions/Case 240 
Case Size. 42.00 
Fee for Serv•cel Case 78 24 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 4459 
Mandarin Orange Chicken 

3 0516840) No Bid No B1d No Bid m No Sid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Sid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: Lin s 
Commodity Code tl 8-52774-15555-5 
Commercial Code# 8-5277 4-15555-5 
Portion Size. 3.600 
Portions/Case 192 
Case SIZe: 43.50 
Fee for Service/ Case. 92.16 

Total Pr~ee/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value .6042 
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Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Broa Schwan'• 

Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provlak)na McCain Foods MichHI Baking Co, Pilgrim'• Pride food Service, 
No. Foodalnc. Salea Lilac Co Inc. Llng'a USA foodl Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gokl LLC Inc. Ta~Branda 

Kung Pao Chicken wlo Vega 

• 0516851 No Bid No Bid No Bid a m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand· Lings 
Commodity Code il: 8-52724-15557-9 
Commercial Code il 8-52724-15557-9 
Portion SIZe. 3800 
Portions/Case 182 
Case Size: 43.50 
Fee for Service/ Case· 117.06 

Total Price/ Portion Includes DF $Value .8386 
Chicken, 8 Piece, Breaded 

5 0518550 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d 
Brand 
Commodit Code II 
Commercial Code il 

N/A Portion Size 

Portions/Case: 

Case Size· 
Fee for Service/ Case· 

Total Pnce/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value 
Chicken, 8 Piece, Roasted I • 051&5.0) No Bid No Bid NoB1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 81d No B"1d No Bid No B1d 
Brand 
Commodity Code II 
Commerc1al Code I 

N/A Port1on Size 

Portions/Case· 

Case SIZe 
Fee for Service/ Case. 

L__ Total Price/Po~l.nclud~F $ Valu!) 
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Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Broo I, l:hwon'o 

l:tem Htgh Liner Turkey Stove Provisions McCsin Foods MlchHI Baking co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 

No. Foods Inc. Sahts Lilac Co Inc. Llna'o USA Foods Inc. Inc. Cornnration Red Gold LLC Inc. ·, lrastv Brand• 

Chicken Patty, Small, Breaded 
lNoBid lNoBid JNoBid 0518581 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand· Gold Kist 
Commod· Code tf.: 6353 
Commercial Code tf. 6353 

N/A Portion SIZe 1.630 

Port1ons/Case 294 

Case SIZe 30.00 
Fee fOr Service/ Case 38.10 

Total Pnce/ PortiOn Includes OF S Value 57.34 
Chicken Patty, Home-ttyle Brd. 
0516901) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid I No Bid I No Bid I No 81d 

Brand· Gold Kist 
Commodity Code if: 6654 
Commercial Code tf. 6654 

N/A Portion SIZe: 3.050 

Portions/Case: 156 
ase ~IZe: = Fee for Service/ Case· 57.34 

Total Price/ Portion {Includes OF S Value 
Chick Patty, Hot & Spicy, Brd. 

I No e;d 0516910 NoB1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid I No Bid I NoB~ 
Brand: Gold Kist 
Commod· Code tf.: 66660 
Commercial Code tf.: 66660 

N/A Port1on Size: 3.050 
Portions/Case: 156 

aseSIZe: 
Fee for Service/ Case: 42.00 

Total Price/ Port1on (includes OF$ Value) 61.24 
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Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Bros Schwan's 

Item High liner Turkey Stove Provlakma McCain Foods Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 
No. Foods Inc. s .... Lilac Co Inc. Una's USA Foods Inc. Inc. Cor ration Red Gold LLC Inc. Ta~t_y Branda 

Chick Tend-Shaped Strips, Brd. 
10 0516880 No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand 
Commodit Code ., 
Commercial Code .,. 
Portion Size. 
PortionsJCase 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
Chick Tend, Whole Muscle, Brd. 

11 0516650) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No81d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commodit Code I 
Commercial Code t· 

N/A Port1on Size: 

Portions/Case 
858 ~IZ8" 

Fee for Service/ Case· 

Total PriCe/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
Popcorn Chicken, Breaded 

12 0516871 NoB•d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoB1d No Bid No Bid No B1d 
Brand 
Commodit Code •: 
Commercial Code II 
Portion Size 
PortionsJCase 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF S Value 
Popcorn Chicken, Breaded 

12 0516871 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NiA a u N/A N/A N/A 
Brand Gold Kist 
Commodll Code II 110458 
Commercial Code 11· 110458 
Portion SIZe 4.300 
Portions/Case 108 
Case SIZe 30.00 
Fee for Serv1ce/ Case 44.10 
Total Pnce/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 82.57 
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Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Broa Schwan's 

11em Hlgh Liner Turkey Stove Provisions McCain Foods Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 
No. Foodalnc. Sales Lilac Co Inc. Ling's USA Foods Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold LLC Inc. Ta_a_ty Branda 

Popcorn Chicken , Spicy, Brd. 
13 0516880 No Bid No Sid No Bid No Sid NoBtd No Sid No Bid No Sid No Btd No Bid No Bid 

Brand 
Commodit Code i#.: 
Commercial Code 1: 

N/A Portion Size 

Porttons/Case: 

Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ PortiOn Includes OF$ Value 
Chicken Brea.t Filets, Whole Muscle, 

14 Bread. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Btd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commodit Code I. 
Commercial Code i#. 
Portion SIZe: 
Portions/Case 
Case Size: 
Fee for Serv1ce/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
Chicken Fajita Strlpa 

15 0516890 No Bid No Btd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Btd NoStd No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand Gold Kist 
Commodd Code I 1325 
Commercial Code II: 1325 
Port•on SIZe 2.451 
Porttons/Case 195 
Case Size: 30.00 
Fee for Service/ Case· 50.10 
Total Price/ Portion Includes OF S Value 04320 

15 
~~~:::, a)na o1r po 

NIA NIA NIA NJA NIA NIA NIA a Xu NIA NIA NIA 
Brand: Gold Kist 
Commodity Code II: 1330 
Commercial Code II 1330 
Portion Size 2.460 
Portions/Case· 195 
Case SIZe 30.00 
Fee for Service/ Case 50.40 
Total Prtee/ Portton Includes OF $ Value 98.93 
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Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Broa Schw1n'a 

Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provlalona McCain Food• Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim'• Pride Food Service, 
No. Foodalnc. Sale• Lilac Co Inc. Llna'• USA Food• Inc. Inc. Cor ration Red Gold LLC Inc. Taatv Br1nda 

Grilled Chicken Patty 
16 0516560} No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand 
Commod~Code t: 
Commercial Code 'I 
Portion S1ze 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Serv1ce/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF S Value 
Beef Crumblea 

17 0516970} No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commodity Code tl 
Commercial Code tl: 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case: 
Case Size· 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF S Value 
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sod. 

18 0516170 No Bid No B1d No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No 81d No 81d 
Brand 
Commodit Code tl 
Commercial Code tl 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF S Value 
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sod. 

18 0518170 NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA 
Brand: 
Commod· Code tl: 
Commercial Code tl: 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case. 
Case Size: 
Fee for Service/ Can· 

Total Price/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value 

25 of 38 



Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Bros Schwan's 

Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provlskms McCain Foods Michael Baking co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 
No. Foods Inc. Sales Lilac Co Inc. Llna's USA Foods Inc. Inc. CorPOration Red Gold LLC Inc. Tast Brands 

Beef Meatballs 
11 0516181 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d 

Brand. 
Commod· Code t~· 
Commercial Code t1 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case: 
Case Size 
Fee for Serv1ce/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
Turkey Sau1age Patty 

20 0516210) No81d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand 
Commodity Code tl. 
Commercial Code tl 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
Turkey Ham 

21 0516221) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commodity Code tl: 
Commercial Code tl· 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case· 
Case Size: 

Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Pri~/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
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Vendor 
Jennie-0 JTM I uno'• 

I: ·I: lr••d••• a ••• ,~ t .l:"w•··· l:tem H'Gh Liner Turkey Stove Provi1ion1 McCain Food• Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim'• Pride Food Service, L 
No. Food• Inc. Sate• Lilac Co Inc. USA Food• Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gotd LLC Inc. T~Brand• 

125 
Beef, Flame Broiled Patty 

lNoBid _ko Bid _ko Bid _koBid _ko Bid lNoBid lNoBid _boBid 0518113 No Bid No Bid m 
Brand JTM 
Commo<f Code II: CP5661 
Commertial Code II: 5661CE 
Portion Size 2200 
Portions/Case. 228 
Case Size 31.43 
Fee for Servicel Case: 24.36 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value .4316 

~ 
Country Fried Steak m) INoBid I No Bid INo Bid I No Bid I 05181501 No Bid No Bid !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid 
Brand: JTM 
Commodity Code f.: CP5695 
Commercial Code II: 5695CE 
Portion Size 3.350 
Porttons/Case· 137 
Case SIZe 28.89 
Fee for Service/ Case 32 80 
Total Pr~ee/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 8891 

127 
Beef Steak, Cooked, Breaded 
0518132) No Bid No Std No Btd I No B1d I No Btd INo Btd !No Btd INo Bid I No Bid I No Bid !No Bid 

Brand 
Commodity Code II. 
Commercial Code II: 
Portton Size 
~ 
~ 
Fee for Servtcel Case: 

Total Price/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value 

28 of 38 



Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM L .... l:•rdono Bro•l: I, 1:-hwan'o Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provllion• ~~cCain Food+k:haoi Baking Co, Pilgrim'• Pride Food Service, 

No. Foodllnc. s ... , Lilac Co Inc. USA Foodl Inc. nc. CorPOration Red Gold LLC Inc. ' lra•tv Branda 
Beef, Mini Burgers 

m) lNoBid lNoBid lNoBid lNoBid lNoBid lNoBid lNoBid lNoBid 28 05151291 No Bid No Bid 
Brand: JTM 
Commod_rty Code .,. CP5669 
Commercial Code# 5669CE 
Portion Size 1.150 
Portions/Case 417 
Case Size 30.00 
Fee for Service/ Case 2430 
Total Price/ Port10n Includes OF$ Value 2217 
Pork, Bib, Shredded 

29 !(0518040) No B1d No Bid No Bid INot:lliL_ JNo B1d _lN~_!3,1d INoB•d _ ... l~()Bid JNoB~_ !No Bid IN.o B1d 
Brand: 
Commodity Code #: 
Commercial Code#. 
Portion Stze 
~ 
'CHe"SiZe': 
~/Case 
Total Price/ Portion {Includes OF$ Vatu;) 
Mouarella Cheese, Shredded 

30 0516411 !No Bid I No Btd !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid INoBid INo Bid I No Bid I No Bid I No Bid 
Brand. 
Commodity Code#: 
Commercial Code# 
Portion SIZe 
Port1onsJCas 
Case SIZe. 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total PriCe/ Portion {Includes OF$ Value 
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Vendor 
I Nardone Brool I IS.hwon'o 

Item Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 
No. Foods. Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC Inc. lra.tv Branda 

American Cheese, Yellow, Sliced, 
Reduced Fat and Reduced Sodium, 

3o4 (Refrigerated (051635DMNo Bid (No Bid INoBid I No Bid I No Bid (No Sid (No Bid (No Sid (No Bid (No Bid (No Bid 
Brand. 
Commo<f Code 1· 
Commercial Code tl: 
Portion Size: 
Port1onsJCese: 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case· 

Total Price/ Portion jlncludes OF$ Value 

American CheeH, Whtte, Sliced, 
Reduced Fat, Refrigerated 

35 ((05163521 !No Bid (No Sid (No Bid !No Bid (No Bid !No Bid !No Bid (No Bid !No Bid !No Bid INo Bid 
Brand 
Commodity Code tl. 
Commercial Code tl. 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case. 
Case SIZe 
Fee for Serv1ce/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion !Includes OF$ Value 

American Cheese, 
5 Pound Loavea 

36 1!0516341l !No Bid !No Bid !No B1d \No 81d INo_eld )No Bid }No Bid .)No Bid lNo Sid !No Bid '"o_lj~ 
Brand 
Commodrty Code t1 
Commercial Code tl. 
Portion Size. 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value 
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Vendor 
'Jennl«l IJTM 

Ln.·· 
'Nardone Brool I 'Schwen'o 

Item 'High Liner Turkey Stove Provisions 'McCoin Foodo,Micheel Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food service, 
No. Foods Inc. Sates, Lilac Co, Inc. USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC Inc. lrastv Brands 

137 
Ch"1e Portion•, Cheddar Chee1e, 

!No Sid !No Bod !No Bid !No Bid Reduced Fat Refrigerated 10517&4()) !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid I No Bid 
Brand· 
Commodity Code f: 
Commercial Code t: 
Portion SIZe: 
POriiOnSiCaS8: 
~ 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value 

Ch•1e, Swill, Sliced, Reduced Fat, 
Refrigerator 

38 ((0517500! I No B1d !No Bid !No B1d !No B1d INoB1d INo 81d jNo Bid jNo Bid jNo Bid INo Bid I No Bid 
Brand 
Commodit Code t· 
Commercial Code t· 
Port1on Size: 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Pncel Portion 'Includes OF S Value 

Cheddar Ch•se, Shredded, Reduced 
Sodium, Refrigerated 

39 1(05163601 JNoBid JNo Bid JNo Bid JNo Bid JNo Bid jNo Bid INoB1d INo Bid !No Bid jNo Bid INoBid 
Brand· 
Commodity Code t 
Commercial Code t1 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case 
Case Size· 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Portion (Includes OF$ Value 
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Vendor 
Jennie.() JTM Nardone Broa Schwan'• 

Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provisions McCain Foods Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 

No. Foodalnc. Sales Lilac Co Inc. Llng'o USA Foods Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold LLC Inc. Taatv Branda 
Macaron and ChHae, Reduced Fat, 
Reduced Sodium, Whole Grain .., 0517600 No 81d No B1d No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commodity Code ., 
Commercial Code ., 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ PortiOn Includes OF$ Value 
Brud Sticka, ChHH Filled, 
Reduced Fat 

41 0516640) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand· Nardone 
Commod· Code tt. 96WBSM 
Commercial Code., 96WBSM 
Portion Size 2.000 
Portions/Case. 96 
Case Size: 12.00 
Fee for Service/ Case 2300 
Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value .3644 
ChH .. Sticka, Mozzarella, Brd. 

42 0517860 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid No Bid 
Brand: 
Commod Code., 
Commercial Code j· 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case 
C85e Size 
Fee for Service/ Case. 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
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Vendor 
Jennie.() JTM Nardone Bro• Schwan'a 

Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provlstons McCain Food• Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 
No. Food• Inc. s.~. Lilac Co Inc. Una'• USA Foods Inc. Inc. CorPOration Red Gold LLC Inc. Ta•tv Brand• 

Tomato Callup, Shelf Stable 
43 0507090) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoB1d No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand: 
Commodit Code tl 
Commercial Code tl 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case· 
Case Size 
Fee for Servicel Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF S Value 
Tomato Catsup, Individual, 
Shelf Stable .. 0507102 No B1d No Bid No Bid No Sid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand 
Commodit Code I 
Commercial Code tl: 
Port1on Size: 
Portions/Case 
Case Size: 
Fee for Servicel Case: 

Total Pnce/ Portion Includes OF$ Value 
Tomato Cat1up, lndivtdual, 
Shelf Stable .. 0507102 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A a)(m)(u) No Bid No Bid 
Brand: Red Gold 
Commodity Code tl REOYL9G 
Commercial Code tl REDYL96 
Portion Size: 0.300 
Portions/Case 1 000 
Case Size: 19.84 
Fee for Setv~ce/ Case 10.32 
Total PriCe/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value .0103 
Canned Salsa, Shelf Stab._, 

45 05023V3 No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 81d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand 
Commod· Code t1 
Commercial Code 1 
Port1on Size 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Serv~ce/ Case· 

Total Price/ Port1on Includes OF$ Value 
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Vendor 
Jennle-0 JTM Nardone Bros Schwan's 

Item High Liner Turkey Stove Provisions McCain Foods Mk:hael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service, 
No. Foods Inc. Sales Lilac Co Inc. llna'a USA Foods Inc. Inc. CorPOration Red Gold LLC Inc. Too Branda 

Whole Grain Che .. e lasagna 
Roll Up 

49 0514500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Brand. 
Commocf Code ,_ 
Commercial Code t. 
Portion Size 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Portion Includes DF $Value 

Chk:ken Taco, Mini 
50 0514530} No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Brand· 
Comm~~ Code ,_ 
Commercial Code .,. 
Portion Size: 
Portions/Case 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case 

Total Price/ Port1on Includes DF $Value 
Que .. dilla, Bib Ch6cken 

51 0517640 NoB1d No Bid No B1d No B1d No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B1d No Bid 
Brand 
Commo(f Code #· 
Commercial Code #: 
Portion Size· 
Port1onsJCase 
Case Size 
Fee for Service/ Case: 

Total Price/ Port1on Includes OF S Vatue 
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Vendor 

lllem 
No, 

~Pepperoni and 
1~:;;;;"'· _.,. 

52 05145101 
Brand: 

~ 
Total Pr~ee/ Port10n Includes OF _c. v .. •u•l 

I 
Omelet, Colby Cheese 

53 /Rii.1ARAI'I\ 

IN/A 

Case Size: 
Fee for 

Total Price/ Portion Includes OF~ v .. •u•l 

I 
Potatoes, Roasted Chunks 

54 IM1.U.1R\ 

Brand 
Commodit Code t 
Commercial Code t 
Portion Size 
Dn..fj ...... eJI"' .... -

oDF S V•l• 

!High Liner 
Fntvl&ln I

Jennle.O IJTM 
Turkey Stove Provisions 
Sala&_ Lllae Co. Inc. 

!No Bod I No Aid I No Bid 

ltu,..Rjo INn 01• In Aitt 

I No B1d 

l~ln Bid 

I 

'

Nardone Oro• I I ISchwon'o 

I McCain Foods MM:hael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride It"...,..., c ............ 
II~A F'nntfs. Inc. lnr.. ....... ----•• I COM nnlrl 1 1 r 1;n-r..-- --· ··--• ITa&tv a ... 

I No Bid 

I ... Ct;, 
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lim' 

14B025-A51~:r 
?,1nn 

144 

18.90 
28 ~1 

12697 

INoBid 

,_.,,_ 

INn Rirt !No Bid I No Aitt /No Bid 

Nn Ctj• INn a. INn Aj, n Airl 



a = Alternate product bid. 

u :Bid for th•s item is not acceptable Alternate product bid- product not approved in taste test; no sample was sent by bidder, or alternate terms or bidder was not accepted 

Y =Product was approved in Taste Test 

m =Vendor bid mimmum delivery quantity 

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST 

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http:l/ecsd­
fl.schoolloop.com/purchasinglblds. 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed In Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be 
distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed. 

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received In compliance to Escambla County School Board Rules and Florida Law. 

John Dombroskie, 
Director Purchasing Department 
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