TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR RFQ 18-26 MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR CRESTVIEW HIGH SCHOOL

OPENING DATE: 12/12/17 11:00AM CT

ITEM NASCO Fisher Scientific Company LLC Moore Medical LLC School Nurse Supply, Inc.
# ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY
SIGNED QUOTE
YES YES Yes Yes
Full-Body Trauma CPR _ _
1 |Manekin with Electronics. 1Ea $1,254.96x 1 = $1,2_54.96 $1,190.34 x 1 = $1,190.34 No Bid No Bid
Brand / Product Bidding 100-2725U As Specified NASCO 100-2725UG
Life/Form Deluxe Blood —
2 Pressure Simulator with 1Ea $1,084.50 x 1 = $1,084.50 $1,028.66 x 1 = $1,028.66 $885.00 x 1 = $885.00 No Bid
Speaker System LF01129U As Specified NASCO LF01129U NASCO LF01129V
Brand / Product Bidding Moore Medical #77578
Laminated 3B Scientific
Anatomical Chart for Clinically _ - $22.50 x 2 = $45.00
3 |Important Blood Vessels and 2 Ea géflggoﬁ is_st?e’zlfi% $2r\l3/-\.:(SJSOXSZB4l§3§L.JlO NASCO SB41520U No Bid
Nerve Pathways Moore Medical #14274
Brand / Product Bidding
Infrared Thermometer with _ _ $38.10 x 6 = $228.60 $51.50 x 6 = $309.00
- = 43.85 x 6 = $263.10
4  |Digital Readout 6 Ea $53855.05067;U6A §21if3§3 $ 5 ADC Adtemp 429 Veridian Healthcare #09-349
Brand / Product Bidding S Specifie NASCO SB50075U Moore Medical #28727 our ltem #12532
5 #?aeirnd:rl Arway Management 1Ea $2,076.56 x 1 = $2,076.56 $2,431.10x 1 = $2,431.10 $1’828£21;(| ;szoigéizoloo No Bid
Brand / Product Bidding LG01075U As Specified NASCO LG01075U Moore Medical #55274
Life/Form Advanced KERI $2.547.90 x 1 Ea = $2,547.90 | $2,416.71 x 1 Ea = $2,416.71 $2,426.57 x 1 Ea = $2,426.57 )
6  [Manikin - Medium 1Ea LF0A122U As Soecifod NASCO LF04122U No Bid
Brand / Product Bidding s Specifie NASCO LF04122V Moore Medical #77708
S [bher Model with Patologies | $81.90 x 2 = $163.80 $97.46 x 2 = $194.92 $95.00 %2~ $190.00 $82.00 x 2 = $164.00
Brand / Product Bidding SB46336G As Specified NASCO SB46336G Moore Medical #21605 GPI Anatomical Models #3310
o |crdesanaup | aga |  $2340x4=$9360 $28.54x 4 = $114.16 No Bid No Bid
Brand / Product Bidding SB50771G As Specified NASCO SB50771G
Classic Heart - 2 Part 7-1/2" x $58.50 x 6 = $351.00 - $74.35 x 6 = $446.10
9  |4-3/4"x 4-3/4" 6 Ea SB41508G As Specified $71.34 x 6 = $426.04 NASCO SB41508U No Bid
Brand / Product Bidding Note: Lead Time 7-21 Days ARO NASCO SB41508G Moore Medical #83700
10 |EveModel 5"x 3" x 4" 4Ea $78.90 x 4 = $315.60 $94.94 x 4 = $379.76 $92.68 x 4 = $370.72 $68.00 x 4 = $272.00
Brand / Product Bidding SB48129U As Specified NASCO SB48129U NASCO 8,848129U GPI Anatomical Models #2750
Moore Medical #36802
41 |Brain Model 3Ea $124.16 x 3 = $372.48 $151.41 x 3 = $454.23 $134.36 x 3 = $403.38 $119.00 x 3 = $357.00
Brand / Product As Specified SB35428G As Specified NASCO SB35428H NASCO SB35428G GPI Anatomical Models #2900
Moore Medical #21558
Numbered Classic Skull $128.16 x 4 = $512.64 1 X 4= 29
12 ((3-Part) 4 Ea SB41412U As Specified $158.05 $632.20 No Bid No Bid
Brand / Product Bidding Note: Lead Time 7-21 Days ARO NASCO SB41412U
Dissectible Muscled Arm $482.38 x 2 = $964.76 $594.88 x 2 = $1,189.76 $609.75 x 2 = $1,219.50
13 |(6-Part) 2Ea SB41512U As Specified ’ S NASCO SB41512U No Bid
Brand / Product Bidding Note: Lead Time 7-21 Days ARO NASCO SB41512U Moore Medical #83742
Brand / Product Bidding SBA41513U As Specified NASCO SB41513U Moore Medical #83743
Earliest Delivery Date Upon L i
Receiving Order (Start date Shipping direct from the
will begin five (5) days after 3-5 Days ARO when in stock 5-7 days ARO | manufacturer can take 14 to 21 1-2 Weeks ARO
date on Purchase Order to business days
allow for mailing days)
Total Quote Price $11,428.56 $12,544.94 $9,855.11 $1,102.00

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any are hereby rejected as late.




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR RFQ 18-26 MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR CRESTVIEW HIGH SCHOOL
OPENING DATE: 12/12/17 11:00AM CT

BIDDERS WHO BID "NO BID": NONE
NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDERS: NONE

RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD

Committee: Dr. Tammy McKenzie April Branscome

Nancy Takacs

Recommendation for Award: Committee recommends award all or none to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder NASCO in the amount
of $11,428.56.

FUNDING
Fund Function Obiject Center Project Amount
4201 5300 0510 9830 8422 $695.34
4201 5300 0641 9830 8422 $6,963.92
4201 5300 0642 9830 8422 $3,769.30

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Florida Statutes 120.57,Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes."

POSTED: 12/13/17 12:45PM CT



