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A.s.enda Item Details 

Meeting Feb 24, 2014 - Regular Meeting 

Category 7. Consent Agenda 

Subject 7.13 Amendment to Award of RFQ 14-18 Sealcoating and Striping of Three (3) School 
Tracks for Okaloosa County Schools, presented by Vince Windham, Program Director, 
Purchasing, and recommended by the Superintendent for approval. 

Access Public 

Type Action (Consent) 

Fiscal Impact Yes 

Dollar Amount 10,520.00 

Budgeted Yes 

Budget Source Capitalized Funds, Project 2368 Paving-District Wide 

Recommended 
Action 

Motion to approve the amendment to the award of RFQ 14-18 Sealcoating and Striping 
of Three (3) School Tracks, which was originally awarded on January 13, 2014. The 
amendment adds Niceville High School track to the award at an additional cost of 
$10,520.00. An additional amount of $6,000.00 will be paid to Gulf Coast Parking Lot 
Service for sealcoating and an additional amount of $4,520.00 will be paid to Mclean 
Tennis, Inc. for striping. The revised total cost of the project is $42,360.00. A copy of 
the original award and vendor confirmation letters are attached. 

Public Content 

Request approval of the amendment to the award of RFQ 14-18 Sealcoating and Striping of Three (3) School 
Tracks, which was originally awarded on January 13, 2014. The amendment adds Niceville High School track 
to the award at an additional cost of $10,520.00. An additional amount of $6,000.00 will be paid to Gulf 
Coast Parking Lot Service for sealcoating and an additional amount of $4,520.00 will be paid to Mclean 
Tennis, Inc. for striping. The revised total cost of the project is $42,360.00. A copy of the original award and 
vendor confirmation letters are attached. 

For additional information, please contact Steve Bolton, Program Director, Maintenance at (850) 689-7159. 

l;:iRFQ 14-18.pdf (119 KB) !;:)RFO 14-18 LETTERS FROM VENDORS.pdf (83 KB) 

Administrative Content 

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several 
items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Most of the items listed under the consent agenda have 
gone through Board subcommittee review and recommendation. Documentation concerning these items has 

https:/ /www. boarddocs.com/fl/ okaloosa/Board.nsf/Private?open&login 2/25/2014 
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been provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. 
Items may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member. 

Motion &. Votin.s. 

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by the 
Superintendent 

Motion by Cathy Thigpen, second by Cindy Frakes. 
Final Resolution: Motion Carries 
Yes: Dewey Destin, Cindy Frakes, Cathy Thigpen, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker 

https:/ /www. boarddocs.com/fl/okaloosa/Board.nsf/Private?open&login 2/25/2014 
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SCHOOL DJSTRICI' OF OKALOOSA COUNTY 
Purebasiag Depart..eat 

~-sc:.ou 
MAllY Hni.JACKSON 

Arn~Mn'TODKIIIMU 
C. JUJU\' MdNM1S. QQ. 

PUN. NIICnJII• PUIIt1iAaC 
VINCI WJNDBAM,crn 

BIIIDJCINIIaf 
DZWEY DES'I1i 
CDIDYDADI 

CATBr1IIICPI I 
Mll'ISA 'I'BIWt I 

ROIJllf£YL W~ !R 

Jllnuary 31, 2014 

Gulf Coat Parking Lol SerW:e 
Attn:.,._ Pllylll• Caie 
POIIox5011 
Fort WalfDn Buch. FL 32541 

Me. Cole: 

Qn.JifiUary13,201•U.Schoollloard$1ooaCaunt,r,Fiorlde~dRFQ1+11SealcoeUftllli d 
Striping of Ttl rea (3) School Traok• for loose Couna, ScMor.. Since thl8 rac.nt award the SChool : 
DIWict would like to edd the Nlcwll'- Hi Schoal Traok tD tflil qUDI& . 

Pllluacheek"Cifte otu.,..,_,.., ~ndcatinl )'OUrdM,.Ion ,.p-dlnethil JWQU~Rand .tgn an~ 
mum this letter to lhe Pui'CMIIng Dep erL Feel frH tG fa.c rour response tD 850-131-4127.. ' 

Pluse faa a ca.rrent certlftcabl cf lnau,.. form for your IMIMN to lhe Risk ..,.gem..t Dapll~"tRW .tat 
~33-1195. All conu.ceors must corttJrtue Ia complv Wltll the lnslnnce requlrement8 • P1'0¥1ded ~ the 
orlgi_. quotll dGeUJnel"b. . ' 

; 

Thank you for yow conaideratJon. We a,~l)feclata your continued buslnese wllh the Olultoo.a ea..riy • hool 
District. · , 

~ 
Vince WlnclhaiW, 
Program DireCtor of Purch.aing 

L legrH w v.a addition ofu. Nicev .. High School Track ~alftOWit of$8,0DO.oo and &hal! 
CO!IIf)IJ WiUiell tanne .-1 oondltidns clthe RFQ 14-18. · 

I decUn• to tfta aclcRtian of tM Nicivllle High School Treck. 

-~·~-~~ :- ~v : 
-Nrb: 8&dlb6 •/tlnfld by""~ or.,... IYIIIntJ IIIII ~ID biltll,_ 0/NJfiiMfY or6nn.. 

PtlltC1L\IINC DUAilDII'JIIT -ADMIJ'UltiTIYE COMI'I.IX·Dt LOW'UY I'UC8 s.&. 
llOk'r WA.L'I'ON BDCJI,. ILO.IU.D.A DM 

'I'El.U.H.OIU (l5t) &JJ.7M 'U. <*SO) &1J.OZ7 

FEB-03-2014 10:46 B60BS2S716 97~ P.001 



SCHOOL DISTRICf OF OKALOOSA COUNTY 
Purchasing Department 

lllli'IJIIHI'IlKNT Of SCHOOLS 
MARY BE'Ill JACKSON 

A1TOJINIV TO TIU IOAJID 
C JUliREY MdNNIS, ESQ. 

l'CII. DIUCTOR • PVRCBASING 
VINCE WINDHAM. CPPB 

January31, 2014 

McLean Tennis, Inc. 
Attn: llr. Greg Nichola 
2018 Cenlre Pointe Blvd., Suite 102 
Tallaha .... , FL 32308 

llr. Nichola: 

BOARD MDIBIRS 
DEWEY DESTIN 
CINDY F1lAKIS 

CATHY THIGPEN 
MELISSA THRUSH 

RODNEY L. WALKER 

On January 13, 2014 the~hool Board of Okalooaa County, Florida approved RFQ 14-18 Sealcoatlng and 
Striping of'rhree (3)School Tracks for Okalooaa County Schools. Since this recent award the School 
District would llka to add the Niceville High School Track to this quote. 

Please check one of the responses below Indicating your decision regarding this request and sign and 
return this letter to the Purchasing OepartmenL Feel free to fax your response to 86H33-6327. 

Please fax a current Certificate of Insurance form for your buslne11 to the Risk Management Department at 
8~33-3195. AI contractoR must continue to comply with the insurance requirements as provided In the 
original quote documents. 

Thank you for yOW' consideration. We appreciate your continued business with the Okalooaa County School 
DlstrlcL 

~ 
Vince Windham, 
Prog~Director of Purchasing 

_V_ 1 I agree to the addition of the Niceville High School Track for the amount of $4,520.00 and shall 
comply with aU terms and conditions of the RFQ 14-18. 

Signature• A 1 ''1t \.,..P · - TltJe tt[Y( 

Date 'P'~Y 
Wotl: MINt IN1 $/gnsd by •n officer oremp/oyiHI having the euthorl(y to bind the comfMny or f/rm. 

l"URCIIASING DEPARTMENT- ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX -120 LOWERY PLACE S.E. 
FORT WALTON BUCII, PLOillDA 32548 

TELEPHONE (850) 133-7661 I' AX (850) 133-6327 
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A.aenda Item Details 

Meeting Jan 13, 2014 - Regular Meeting 

7. Consent Agenda 
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category 

Subject 7.16 Request for Quote (RFQ): 14-18 Seafcoatlng and Striping of Three (3) School 
Tracks, presented by VInce Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended 
by the Superintendent for approval. 

Access 

Type 

Ascal Impact 

Public 

Action (Consent) 

Yes 

Dollar Amount 31,840.00 

Budgeted Yes 

Budget Source Capitalized Funds, project 2368, Paving-District Wide 

Recommended Motion to approve RFQ 14-18 Sealcoatlng and Striping or Three (3) School Tracks 
Action located at Baker School, Crestview High School, and Fort Walton Beach High School. 

Public Content 

The total cost or the project Is $31,840.00 ctnd will be paid from Capitalized funds, 
project 2368, Paving-District Wide. The committee recommends award to Gulf Coast 
Parking Lot Service for Item 1. Sealcoatlng In the amount of $18,000, and Mclean 
Tennis, Inc. for Item 2. Striping In the amount of $13,840.00. 

Request approval of the award or RFQ 14-18 Sealcoatlng and Striping of Three (3) School Tracks located at 
Baker School, Crestview High School, and Fort Walton Beach High School. The total cost of the project Is 
$31,840.00 and will be paid from Capitalized funds, project 2368, Paving-District Wide. The committee 
recommends award to Gulf Coast Parking Lot Service for Item 1. Sealcoatlng In the amount of $18,000, and 
Mclean Tennis, Inc. for Item 2. Striping in the amount of $13,840.00. A copy of the award recommendation 
is attached. 

For additional Information, please contact Steve Bolton, Program Director, Maintenance at (850) 689-7159 

~EO 14-1B.pdf(74 KBl 

Administrative Content 

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several 
Items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Most of the Items listed under the consent agenda have 
gone through Board subcommittee review and recommendation. Documentation concerning these /rems has 
been provided to all Board members and the public In advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. 
Items may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member. 

https://www.boarddocs.com/fllokaloosa/Board.nsf7Private?open&login 1/14/2014 
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Motion a. Votlna 

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda as amended and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended 
by the Superintendent 

Motion by cathy Thigpen, second by Cindy Frakes. 
Final Resolution: Motion Carries 
Yes: Dewey Destin, Cindy Frakes, Cathy Thigpen, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker 

-~.;.Yf/; 
..... h .. 

https://www.boarddocs.com/fl!okaloosa/Board.nsf/Private?open&login 1114/2014 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR RFQ 14-16 SEALCOATING STRIPING THREE (3) SCHOOL TRACKS- OPENING DATE 12/6/13 2:00PM CT 

Athletic Marking Gulf Coast Parking Lot 
Mclean Tennis, Inc. Precision Striping 

Company, Inc. Service 
I Item # Item Descriotion 

! 

SIGNED QUOTE Yes Yes Yes Yes 

1 ITEM 1: SEALCOATING TRACKS 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE -

A 
SEALCOATING THE TRACK 

No Bid $6,000.00 $12,500.00 No Bid 
AT FORT WALTON BEACH 
HIGH SCHOOL 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE-

B 
SEALCOATING THE TRACK 

No Bid $6,000.00 $12,500.00 No Bid 
AT CRESTVIEW HIGH 
SCHOOL 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE -
c SEALCOATING THE TRACK No Bid $6,000.00 $12,500.00 No Bid 

AT BAKER SCHOOL 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE FOR 
ENTIRE PROJECT FOR 

No Bid $18,000.00 $37,500.00 No Bid ITEM 1 SEALCOATING 
TRACKS (A,B, AND C) 

2 ITEM 2: STRIPING TRACKS 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE-

A 
STRIPING THE TRACK AT $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $4,520.00 $5,100.00 FORT WALTON BEACH 
HIGHSCHOOL 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE-

B 
STRIPING THE TRACK AT $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $4,520.00 $4,700.00 CRESTVIEW HIGH 
SCHOOL 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE-
c STRIPING THE TRACK AT $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $4,800.00 $4,700.00 

BAKER SCHOOL 

TOTAL QUOTE PRICE FOR 
I ENTIRE PROJECT FOR 

$15,000.00 $10,500.00 $13,840.00 $14,500.00 i ITEM 2 STRIPING TRACKS 
(A,B, AND C) 

Sealmaster Sealer and crack 
filler will be applied per 

5 Years (see attached 
manufacturers specification and 

1 WARRANTY STATEMENT will cover labor, equipment to 
One (1) Year One (1) Year 

warranty statement) reapply any area that fails to 
adhere to asphalt or peel. The 

warranty is for 2 Years. Warranty 
covers normal wear and tear 

NUMBER OF CALENDAR 10 Days I Seven (7) Days per track 90 Days I Several days 
2 DAYS I EARLIEST START Upon Completion of 

5 to 7 Days weather sealcoating, Three (3) 
after sealing completed 

permitting 11211612013 Days for striping I to be DATE Sealcoating determined by weather (see attached note) 

3 YEARS IN BUSINESS 13 Years, 6 Months 36 Years, 6 Months 30 Years 14 Years, 7 Months 

University of Georgia, Preston Hood Chev., 
C.W. Roberts Competition Athletic 

Contracting, Leon Surfaces, Baseline 
4 REFERENCES Auburn University, Keith Fenstermacher, 

County Schools, Florida Sports Construction, 
University of Alabama Young Contracting 

State University Court One 

- - -- '--- ----



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR RFQ 14-18 SEALCOATING STRIPING THREE (3) SCHOOL TRACKS- OPENING DATE 1216113 2:00PM CT 

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this 
solicitation, if any are hereby rejected as late. 

BIDDERS WHO BID "NO BID": Athletic Marking Company, Inc. and Precision Striping- No Bid on Item 1. Sealcoating Tracks 

NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDERS: 
NONE 

RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD 

Committee: Steve Bolton. Program Director-Maintenance 

Bill Smith, Director-Facilities Planning 

Recommendation for Award: Committee recommends award to the lowest, responsible and responsive bidder Gulf Coast Parking 
Lot Service for Item 1. Sealcoating Tracks (1A, 1 Band 1C) in the amount of $18.000.00. Committee also recommends award to the 
second lowest, responsible and responsive bidder Mclean Tennis, Inc. for Item 2. Striping Tracks (2A, 28 and 2C) in the amount of 
$13.840.00. Total amount for Item 1 and Item 2 is $31,840.00. Gulf Coast Parking Lot Service did not possess the credentials for re­
striping per the National Federation of State High School Association (NFSHSA). 

FUNDING 

.EI!ill! 
3713 
3714 

Function 

7400 
7400 

~ Center Project 

0677 9025 2368 
0677 9025 2368 

Amount 

$ 6,840.00 
$25,000.00 

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Florida Statutes 120.57,Fiorida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida 
Statutes." 

POSTED: 12/11/13 3:28PM CT 



7270 Ono Road 
Palmetto, GA 30268 
www.trackstriping.com 

Nov. 29, 2013 

Track Striping Warranty 

_/l~uas 
~UDON 

Mobile: 770-356-2446 
Fax: 770-892-3722 

AMC, Inc. guarantees our outdoor running track striping for a period of 5 years against cracking, flaking, 
disappearance, discoloration, and fading beyond normal weathering and wear and tear due to foot traffic. 
Not covered under the warranty is damage due to poor maintenance, poor drainage, misuse of track for any 
purpose other than running track, failure of surfacing, vehicle traffic, flood, fire, or any weather related act of 
God. 

John Wettstein, President 
AMC, Inc. 
www.trackstriping.com 

Track Striping Is Our Specialty 



PRECISIONSTRlPlNG 
ROBBHAYNES 

••• 4978 island home rd • louisville, tn 37777 
phone: 865-556..0760 • Email: precislonstriping@charter.net 
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