
RFB 09-B18 FIXED PRICE ASPHALT PAVING, STRIPING, CURBING, AND SIDEWALK

ITEM 
NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION

Curtis 
Remodeling

Crestview 
Site & 
Undergound

Utility 
Solutions 
Group, LLC

Anderson 
Columbia 
Co.

Mike Moulton 
Construction

Tindle 
Enterprises, 
Inc

Bell 
Construction

Insite 
Contractors, 
Inc.

Helms 
Contracting, 
Inc.

1 Signed Bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
2 Visa Discount 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
3 Warranty Statement 1yr mat/2yr lab 1yr 1yr 1yr 1yr 1yr 1yr 1yr 1yr
4 Years Experience 32 yrs 30 yrs 11 yrs 21 yrs 25 yrs 20 yrs 20 yrs 10 yrs 25 yrs
5 References Included? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

GROUP A
Asphalt Paving and Repairs 
up to 125 square yards

#1 Install Asphalt Tack/sq yd $1.65 $2.00 $1.60 $3.00 $1.75 $2.00 $2.25 No Bid $1.50 
#2 1" R f i / d $9 90 $12 00 $9 00 $12 00 $10 00 $15 50 $15 75 N Bid $9 00#2 1" Resurfacing/sq yd $9.90 $12.00 $9.00 $12.00 $10.00 $15.50 $15.75 No Bid $9.00 
#3 1 1/2" Resurfacing/sq yd $11.20 $16.00 $10.50 $17.00 $11.00 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid $10.00 
#4 2" Asphalt resurfacing $14.30 $20.00 $18.00 $23.00 $21.00 $30.00 $30.00 No Bid $13.00 
#5 1/2" Leveling Course/sq yd $5.97 $11.00 $8.50 $15.00 $6.50 $20.00 $20.50 No Bid $5.40 
#6 1" Leveling Course/sq yd $8.25 $12.00 $9.00 $14.00 $14.50 $21.00 $21.00 No Bid $7.50 
#7 1 1/2" Leveling Course/sq yd $11.20 $13.50 $10.00 $19.00 $18.00 $25.00 $25.50 No Bid $10.00 

#8
6" Base Course (Sand 
Clay)/sq yd $16.70 $14.00 $12.00 $12.00 $18.00 $15.00 $16.00 No Bid $15.00 

#9
4" Base Course (Lime 
Rock)/sq yd $15.80 $14.00 $13.00 $17.00 $15.00 $17.00 $17.00 No Bid $14.50 

#10 Ashphalt Patching/sq yd $49.60 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $35.00 $34.00 No Bid $45.00 

#11
Remove Concrete Wheel 
Bumpers $16.30 $25.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $21.00 No Bid $15.00 

#12

Relocate or Reinstall 
Concrete Wheel 
Bumpers/each $34.20 $40.00 $30.00 $20.00 $35.00 $25.00 $26.00 No Bid $30.00 

#13 Clean Parking Lots/sq yd $2.80 $4.50 $4.00 $2.50 $4.00 $4.00 $3.75 $2.00 
Overall price w/o mobilization 
fee $197 87 $229 00 $190 60 $219 50 $219 75 $249 50 $252 75 $0 00 $177 90fee $197.87 $229.00 $190.60 $219.50 $219.75 $249.50 $252.75 $0.00 $177.90 

#14 Mobilization Fee $672.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $600.00 $700.00 No Bid $600.00 

                         BOARD AGENDA 04/27/2009 
                                                  ITEM NO. 1A



RFB 09-B18 FIXED PRICE ASPHALT PAVING, STRIPING, CURBING, AND SIDEWALK

ITEM 
NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION

Curtis 
Remodeling

Crestview 
Site & 
Undergound

Utility 
Solutions 
Group, LLC

Anderson 
Columbia 
Co.

Mike Moulton 
Construction

Tindle 
Enterprises, 
Inc

Bell 
Construction

Insite 
Contractors, 
Inc.

Helms 
Contracting, 
Inc.

GROUP B
Asphalt Paving and Repairs 
more than 125 square yards          

#15 Install Asphalt Tack/ sq. yd. $1.12 $2.00 $1.50 $0.80 $1.75 $1.00 $1.10 No Bid $1.00 
#16 1" Resurfacing/sq. yd. $7.36 $7.50 $7.00 $8.00 $10.00 $6.00 $6.10 No Bid $6.50 
#17 1 1/2" Resurfacing/sq. yd. $8.42 $12.50 $9.50 $12.50 $11.00 $7.00 $7.25 No Bid $7.75 
#18 2" Asphalt Resurfacing $9.97 $15.00 $11.50 $17.00 $20.00 $9.00 $9.00 No Bid $9.00 
#19 1/2" Leveling Course/sq. yd. $4.72 $7.00 $5.00 $4.25 $5.40 $3.50 $3.75 No Bid $4.00 
#20 1" Leveling Course/sq. yd. $7.02 $9.00 $6.50 $9.00 $10.00 $5.50 $5.75 No Bid $6.25 
#21 1 1/2" Leveling Course/sq. yd. $8.71 $12.75 $9.00 $12.50 $14.00 $7.50 $7.75 No Bid $8.00 

#22
6" Base Course (Sand 
Clay)/sq.yd. $7.82 $8.80 $8.00 $10.00 $10.00 $9.00 $9.00 No Bid $7.00 

#23
4" Base Course (Lime Rock)/sq. 
yd $15.30 $12.00 $9.00 $14.00 $14.00 $12.50 $12.75 No Bid $14.00 

#24 Ashphalt Patching/sq. yd. $49.86 $45.00 $43.00 $40.00 $45.00 $28.00 $28.50 No Bid $45.00 

#25
Provide and Install Concrete 
Wheel Bumpers/ each $67.20 $56.00 $75.00 $60.00 $75.00 $55.00 $58.00 No Bid $60.00 

#26
Remove Concrete Wheel 
Bumpers/each $16.92 $20.00 $20.00 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $19.00 No Bid $15.00 

#27
Relocate or Reinstall Concrete 
Wheel Bumpers/ each $34.60 $30.00 $30.00 $20.00 $35.00 $22.00 $23.00 No Bid $30.00 

#28 Clean Parking Lots/sq. yd. $2.36 $3.00 $3.00 $2.00 $4.00 $1.00 $1.25 No Bid $2.00 
Overall Price w/o mobilization $241.38 $240.55 $238.00 $225.05 $270.15 $187.00 $192.20 $0.00 $215.50 

#29 Mobilization Fee $686.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $700.00 $750.00 No Bid $600.00 

                         BOARD AGENDA 04/27/2009 
                                                  ITEM NO. 1A



RFB 09-B18 FIXED PRICE ASPHALT PAVING, STRIPING, CURBING, AND SIDEWALK

ITEM 
NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION

Curtis 
Remodeling

Crestview 
Site & 
Undergound

Utility 
Solutions 
Group, LLC

Anderson 
Columbia 
Co.

Mike Moulton 
Construction

Tindle 
Enterprises, 
Inc

Bell 
Construction

Insite 
Contractors, 
Inc.

Helms 
Contracting, 
Inc.

GROUP C Painting & Striping of Asphalt      
#30 Paint 2" lines $0.92 $0.56 $2.25 $4.30 $2.25 $1.80 $1.90 No Bid $0.80 
#31 Repaint 2" lines $0.92 $0.56 $2.10 $3.50 $1.75 $0.95 $1.00 No Bid $0.80 
#32 Paint 4" lines $1.03 $0.28 $2.50 $1.05 $1.00 $1.80 $1.90 No Bid $0.90 
#33 Repaint 4" lines $1.03 $0.28 $2.40 $0.95 $0.75 $0.95 $1.00 No Bid $0.90 
#34 Paint 6" lines $1.32 $0.45 $2.60 $1.38 $1.00 $1.80 $1.90 No Bid $1.20 
#35 Repaint 6" lines $1.32 $0.45 $2.50 $1.20 $0.75 $0.95 $1.00 No Bid $1.20 p $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
#36 Paint 8" lines $1.32 $0.50 $2.70 $1.90 $1.00 $2.00 $2.00 No Bid $1.20 
#37 Repaint 8" lines $1.32 $0.45 $2.60 $1.75 $0.90 $1.25 $1.35 No Bid $1.20 
#38 Paint 10" lines $1.56 $0.56 $2.80 $2.20 $1.30 $2.25 $2.35 No Bid $1.40 
#39 Repaint 10" lines $1.56 $0.56 $2.70 $2.00 $1.15 $1.50 $1.60 No Bid $1.40 
#40 Paint Traffic Arrow per FDOT $49.80 $11.20 $75.00 $42.00 $50.00 $40.00 $44.00 No Bid $45.00 

#41
Repaint Traffic Arrow per 
FDOT $38.60 $11.20 $75.00 $37.00 $35.00 $35.00 $34.00 No Bid $35.00 

#42
Paint handicapped space per 
FDOT $84.72 $11.20 $200.00 $128.00 $85.00 $65.00 $64.00 No Bid $80.00 

#43
Repaint handicapped space 
per FDOT $44.73 $11.20 $200.00 $135.00 $45.00 $60.00 $59.00 No Bid $40.00 

#44 Supply/Install Handicap Sign $131.60 $39.20 $200.00 $300.00 $125.00 $165.00 $175.00 No Bid $125.00 
#45 Paint Curb $2.20 $0.56 $3.00 $2.90 $2.10 $2.00 $2.10 No Bid $2.00 
#46 Repaint Curb $2.20 $0.56 $3.00 $2.90 $2.00 $2.00 $2.10 No Bid $2.00 

Overall Total for Group C $366.15 $89.77 $781.15 $668.03 $355.95 $384.25 $396.20 $0.00 $340.00 

                         BOARD AGENDA 04/27/2009 
                                                  ITEM NO. 1A



RFB 09-B18 FIXED PRICE ASPHALT PAVING, STRIPING, CURBING, AND SIDEWALK

ITEM 
NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION

Curtis 
Remodeling

Crestview 
Site & 
Undergound

Utility 
Solutions 
Group, LLC

Anderson 
Columbia 
Co.

Mike Moulton 
Construction

Tindle 
Enterprises, 
Inc

Bell 
Construction

Insite 
Contractors, 
Inc.

Helms 
Contracting, 
Inc.

GROUP D
Installation & Removal of 
Concrete Curbing         

#47 Install 12" flat curb $12.10 $13.00 $11.50 $13.00 $30.00 $8.00 $8.50 $14.00 $10.00 
#48 Install 18" flat curb $13.60 $15.75 $14.00 $15.00 $32.00 $10.00 $10.25 $16.50 $12.50 
#49 Install 24" flat curb $18.20 $20.00 $16.00 $17.00 $35.00 $12.00 $12.50 $19.00 $16.00 

#50
Install sidewalk thick edge 4' 
wide by 4" thick $22.80 $35.00 $25.00 $23.00 $28.00 $14.00 $14.00 $30.35 $20.00 

#51
Install sidewalk thick edge 5' 
wide by 4" thick $25.31 $38.00 $29.00 $29.00 $30.00 $19.00 $19.10 $34.15 $23.00 

#52

Install sidewalk regular edge 
4' wide by 4" thick w/ 8" bell 
footings $29.60 $41.50 $40.00 $45.00 $35.00 $44.00 $45.00 $39.80 $27.00 

#53
Install regular edge 5' wide by 
4" thick w/ 8" bell footings $34.61 $42.50 $45.00 $49.00 $38.00 $50.00 $50.50 $44.00 $30.00 

#54 Install 16" curb and gutter $17.20 $16.00 $15.00 $18.00 $26.00 $12.00 $12.25 $18.00 $16.00 
#55 Install 24" curb and gutter $17.84 $20.00 $19.00 $22.00 $28.00 $14.00 $14.25 $20.00 $16.50 

#56
Install 12" wide by 8" thick 
ribbon curb $14.83 $14.00 $12.00 $13.00 $14.00 $8.00 $8.00 $13.50 $13.00 

#57
Install 6" wide by 16" thick 
standup curb $17.92 $18.00 $17.00 $22.00 $25.00 $14.00 $14.50 $22.00 $16.00 

#58
Provide and install concrete 
wheel bumpers $57.60 $56.00 $75.00 $60.00 $50.00 $55.00 $56.00 $89.00 $55.00
Total for Group D $281.61 $329.75 $318.50 $326.00 $371.00 $260.00 $264.85 $360.30 $255.00

                         BOARD AGENDA 04/27/2009 
                                                  ITEM NO. 1A



RFB 09-B18 FIXED PRICE ASPHALT PAVING, STRIPING, CURBING, AND SIDEWALKS 

ITEM 
NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION

Curtis 
Remodeling

Crestview Site 
& Undergound

Utility 
Solutions 
Group, LLC

Anderson 
Columbia Co.

Mike Moulton 
Construction

Tindle 
Enterprises, 
Inc

Bell 
Construction

Insite 
Contractors, 
Inc.

Helms 
Contracting, 
Inc.

Asphalt Paving and Repairs up to 
125 square yards
Overall price w/o mobilization fee $229.00 $190.60 $219.50 $219.75 $249.50 $252.75 $0.00 $177.90

Overall price w/o mobilization fee $240.55 $238.00 $225.05 $270.15 $187.00 $192.20 $0.00 $215.50
 

$781.15 $668.03 $355.95 $384.25 $396.20 $0.00 $340.00

GROUP B

Asphalt Paving and Repairs more 
than 125 square yards

$89.77 GROUP C
Installation & Removal of

$241.38 

$366.15 

GROUP A $197.87

Painting & Striping of Asphalt

COMMITTEE: Steve Bolton, Prog Dir, Maint Tom Cox, Spec, Fac Plan Rick Kilpatrick, Foreman, Maint

OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME.  ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN 
RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION IF ANY ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.  BOLD PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD.

COMMITTEE RECOMMENDS LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BID OF FOR GROUP A: Helms Contracting Inc., Utility Solutions Group LLC, and Curtis Remodeling; GROUP B: Tindle 
Enterprises Inc., Bell Construction, and Helms Contracting, Inc.;  GROUP C: Helms Contracting Inc., Mike Moulton Construction, and Curtis Remodeling ; GROUP D: Helms Contracting Inc., Tindle 
Enterprises Inc., and Bell Construction; AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BIDS BASED ON SQUARE YARDAGE PRICING.

$260.00 $264.85 $360.30 $255.00

RECOMMENDATION FOR FIXED PRICE ASPHALT PAVING, STRIPING, CURBING, AND SIDEWALK

"FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN FLORIDA STATUTES 120 57(3) SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDING UNDER CHAPTER 120 FLORIDA

GROUP D
Installation & Removal of 
Concrete Curbing

VENDORS WHICH RESPONDED NO BID: CRESTVIEW SITE & UNDERGROUND WITHDREW THEIR BID DUE TO CALCULATION ERRORS.

$281.61 $329.75 $318.50 $326.00 $371.00

"FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN FLORIDA STATUTES 120.57(3) SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDING UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA 
STATUTES"

POSTED: 4/6/09 3:15 CT

                         BOARD AGENDA 04/27/2009 
                                                  ITEM NO. 1A
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