




















































TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Antioch ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Baker School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1 Gbps $750.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1.5 Gbps No Bid No bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid

Location
Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf CoastBandwidth 

Speed
Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Bay Area Office 50 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No bid No bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Bluewater ES 50 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No bid No bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Summit BroadbandSouthern Light, LLC dba Uniti FiberBandwidth 
Speed

Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Bob Sikes ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Bruner MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Location
Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Carver Hill Complex 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $2,175.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $2,175.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $2,435.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Choctawhatchee HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,135.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,135.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,385.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location

Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Crestview HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Davidson MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti FiberBandwidth 
SpeedLocation

Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Destin ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Destin MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Location
Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Edge ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,590.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,590.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,595.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Edwins ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Bandwidth 
Speed

Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Eglin ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Elliott Point ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Cox Communications Gulf CoastSouthern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber
Location

Bandwidth 
Speed

Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Florosa ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,495.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,495.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,750.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Ft. Walton Bch HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf CoastBandwidth 
SpeedLocation

Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Kenwood ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Laurel Hill School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1 Gbps $740.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid

Cox Communications Gulf CoastBandwidth 
SpeedLocation

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Lewis MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1 Gbps $740.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid

Longwood ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location

Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Mary Esther ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Meigs MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location

Bandwidth 
Speed

Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Niceville HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,790.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,790.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,795.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Northwood ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber
Location

Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

NWFL Ballet Academie 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $856.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $856.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,115.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Okaloosa Detention Ctr 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid

Location
Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Okaloosa Technical Colle50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Plew ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,510.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,510.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,520.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Location
Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Pryor MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Riverside ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Bandwidth 
SpeedLocation

Cox Communications Gulf CoastSouthern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Ruckel MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Shalimar ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,730.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,730.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,990.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Location
Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Shoal River MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Silver Sands School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $885.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $885.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,140.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Location
Bandwidth 
Speed

Cox Communications Gulf CoastSouthern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Southside School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,945.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,945.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $2,205.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Stemm Academy 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $1,645.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $1,645.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $1,905.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Location
Bandwidth 
Speed

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf CoastSummit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES 

Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Walker ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Wright ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location

Bandwidth 
Speed

Summit Broadband



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

NONE
NONE

RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD:
COMMITTEE: Brandon McSween, Specialist Brian Walton, IT Field Tech

William Hagan, Mobile Learning Analyst Dustin Keith, Specialist

FUNDING
FUND FUNCTION OBJECT CENTER PROJECT
1010 7900 376 9050

Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf Coast

POSTED:  1/12/21 @ 1:45 PM CT
"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Florida Statutes 120.57,Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes."                               

BIDDERS WHO BID "NO BID":  
NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDERS:    

Committee Recommendation:                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     
Committee recommends award to the lowest responsible and responsive bidder Uniti Fiber in the amount of $43,200.00 and Cox Communications 
Gulf Coast in the amount of $176,820.00 (based on a 12 month contract period before E-Rate is applied). Recommended bandwidth speeds and 
monthly charges by site are included on the tabulation. Future bandwidth upgrades will be priced as stated as long as the contract is in force.  The 
initial contract term is one year with the option for up to four additional years at the same terms and conditions.  Services agreed upon above shall 
begin on July 1st, 2021. The Okaloosa Detention Center (DJJ) is not awarded at this time but may be in the future.

Yes Yes

YesYes

Signed E-Rate Participant Form?
Vendor Meets Stated Qualifications?           
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BIDDER REQUIREMENTS:
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