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Agenda Item Details 

Meeting Jan 25, 2021 - Regular Meeting 

8. Consent Agenda Category 

Subject 8.18 ITB 21-05 Telecommunication Services for Wide Area Network (WAN), presented 
by Vince Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended by the 
Superintendent for approval. 

Access Public 

Type Action (Consent) 

Fiscal Impact Yes 

Dollar Amount 220,020.00 

Budgeted Yes 

Budget Source General Funds 

Recommended Action Motion to approve the committee's recommendation to award ITB 21-05 
Telecommunication Services for Wide Area Network (WAN) in the amount of 
$220,020.00. The contract is effective July 1, 2021 through June 30, 2022. 

Public Content 

Request approval of the Committee's recommendation to award ITB 21-05 Telecommunication Services for 
Wide Area Network (WAN) to Uniti Fiber in the amount of $43,200.00 and Cox Business in the amount of 
$176,820.00, for a total contract amount of $220,020.00. Funds will be paid from General Funds and the 
contract is effective July 1, 2021 through June 30, 2022. Copies of the Award Tabulation and solicitation 
document are attached. 

For additional information, please contact Eric Mitchell, Director, IT & MIS, at (850) 689-7153. 

1TB 21-05 AWARD TABULATION.pdf (284 KB) 

ITB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN).pdf (613 KB) 

Administrative Content 

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several 
items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been 
provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items 
may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member. 

https://go.boarddocs.com/fl/okaloosa/Board.nsf/Private?open&login 1/26/2021 
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Motion & Voting 

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda as amended and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by 
the Superintendent 

Motion by Linda Evanchyk, second by Diane Kelley. 
Final Resolution: Motion Carries 
Yes: Tim Bryant, Linda Evanchyk, Marti Gardner, Diane Kelley, Lamar White 

https ://go. boarddocs.com/fl/ okaloosa/Board.nsf/Private ?open&login 1/26/2021 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 

e 

Antioch ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Chan::ie 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Chan:ie 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Chan.::ie 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charae 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Baker School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
500 Mbps $600.00 NoCharae $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1 Gbps $750.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern tight, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Bay Area Office 
-

50 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Chari:ie 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Chari:ie 
350 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Chari:ie 
450 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Chari:ie $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Chari:ie 
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No bid No bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Chari:ie 
2 Gbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Bluewater ES 50 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Chari:ie 
150 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $695.00 No Chari:ie $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No bid No bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Light, LLCdba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications GUif Coast' 

Bob Sikes ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Chan::ie 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Bruner MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Ught, LLC dba" Uniti Fiber summit Broadband Cox,Coininunications0 Gulf Coast 

Carver Hill Complex 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Chan:ie 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $2,175.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Chan:ie 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $2,175.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $2,435.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Choctawhatchee HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,135.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $1,135.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $1,385.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Li_qht, LLC dba Uniti Fiber . Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Crestview HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Davidson MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
..... 

Southern Ught, L.LC dba·OnitiFiber summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Destin ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Destin MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
..... 

Southern Ught, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband .cox Communications Gulf Coast 

EdQe ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charcie 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No CharQe 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charcie 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,590.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charcie 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No CharQe 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charcie 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No CharQe 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charae 
500 Mbos $1,590.00 No CharQe $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No CharQe 
1 Gbps $1,595.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charcie 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No CharQe 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Edwins ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charcie 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No CharQe 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charcie 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No CharQe 
250 Mbos $500.00 NoCharQe $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charcie 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charqe 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No CharQe 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charcie 
1 Gbps $695.00 No CharQe $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No CharQe 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Liaht, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

EQlin ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No CharQe 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No CharQe 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No CharQe 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No CharQe 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Elliott Point ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No CharQe 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No CharQe 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No CharQe 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No CharQe 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Ught, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Florosa ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,495.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $1,495.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $1,750.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Ft. Walton Bch HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications<Gulf Coast 

Kenwood ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Chari::ie 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Chari::ie 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Chari::ie 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Chari::ie 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Laurel Hill School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Chari::ie $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1 Gbps $740.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Uaht, LLC .. dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communicati<:Jns Gulf Coast .t 

Lewis MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1 Gbps $740.00 No Chan:1e $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 

Longwood ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
..... 

Southern Uaht, LLCdba Unifi Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast:. 

Marv Esther ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charqe 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charae 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charqe 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charae 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charqe 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charae 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charae 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbos No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charae 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charae 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Meiqs MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charae 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charae 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charqe 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charae 
250 Mbos No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charqe 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charae 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charae 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charae 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charae 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Niceville HS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,790.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $1,790.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $1,795.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Northwood ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 NoCharoe 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charqe 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charqe 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charqe 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charqe 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Ught, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

NWFL Ballet-Academie 
-

50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No CharQe 
250 Mbps $856.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Chan::ie 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $856.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $1,115.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Chan::ie 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Okaloosa Detention Ctr 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 No Bid No Bid 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Ught, LLC dl:fa Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox.Cofnmunications6iJ/fCoast 

Okaloosa Technical CollE 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Plew ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,510.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $1,510.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $1,520.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

--

Pryor MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charqe 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charqe 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charqe 
1 Gbps $695.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charqe 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Riverside ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charqe 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Ught, U.C dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Ruckel MS 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $500.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $600.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No CharQe 
1 Gbps $695.00 No CharQe $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No CharQe 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Shalimar ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,730.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No CharQe 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No CharQe 
500 Mbps $1,730.00 No CharQe $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $1,990.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No CharQe 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Light, LLC dba Unifi Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Shoa!River MS 
--

50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Chan::ie 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charae 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charae 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Silver Sands School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charae 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charae 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $885.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charae 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $885.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charae 
1 Gbps $1,140.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charae 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Ur,ht, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Southside School 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Chari:ie 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Chari:ie 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,945.00 No Chari:ie $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Chari:ie 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Chari:ie 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Chari:ie 
500 Mbps $1,945.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $2,205.00 No Chari:ie $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Chari:ie 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Stemm Academy 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Chari:ie 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Chari:ie 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps $1,645.00 No Chari:ie $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Chari:ie 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps $1,645.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps $1,905.00 No Charge $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

PRICING - DATA LINES 
Southern Ught, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Summit Broadband Cox Communications Gulf Coast 

Walker ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 

Wright ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $250.00 No Charge 
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $345.00 No Charge 
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $460.00 No Charge 
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $525.00 No Charge 
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $550.00 No Charge 
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $600.00 No Charge 
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $680.00 No Charge 
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $1,006.25 $0.00 $875.00 No Charge 



TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 21-05 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN) 

ment? 
Siqned DebarmenUDruq Free Form? 

Siqned E-Rate Participant Form? 
Vendor Meets Stated Qualifications? 

{Pages #18-23 of 1TB) 

BIDDERS WHO BID "NO BID": 
NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDERS; 

RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD: 

NONE 
NONE 

COMMITTEE: Brandon Mcsween, Specialist 

Yes 

Yes 

William Hagan, Mobile Learning Analyst 

Committee Recommendation: 

Yes 
Yes Yes 

Yes Yes 

Brian Walton, IT Field Tech 

Dustin Keith, Specialist 

Committee recommends award to the lowest responsible and responsive bidder Uniti Fiber in the amount of $43,200.00 and Cox Communications 
Gulf Coast in the amount of $176,820.00 (based on a 12 month contract period before E-Rate is applied). Recommended bandwidth speeds and 
monthly charges by site are included on the tabulation. Future bandwidth upgrades will be priced as stated as long as the contract is in force. The 
initial contract term is one year with the option for up to four additional years at the same terms and conditions. Services agreed upon above shall 
begin on July 1st, 2021. The Okaloosa Detention Center (DJJ) is not awarded at this time but may be in the future. 

FUNDING 
FUND 
1010 

FUNCTION 
7900 

OBJECT 
376 

CENTER 
9050 

PROJECT 

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Florida Statutes 120.57,Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes." 
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