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Agenda Item Details

Meeting Feb 12, 2018 - Regular Meeting
Category 8. Consent Agenda
Subject 8.9 ITB 18-09 Telecommunication Services for Wide Area Network (WAN), presented

by Vince Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended by the
Superintendent for approval.

Access Public

Type Action (Consent)
Fiscal Impact Yes

Dollar Amount 185,448.00
Budgeted Yes

Budget Source General Funds

Recommended Action Motion to approve the committee's recommendation to award ITB 18-09
Telecommunication Services for Wide Area Network (WAN).

Public Content

Request approval of the committee's recommendation to award ITB 18-09 Telecommunication Services for
Wide Area Network (WAN) to Southern Light d/b/a Uniti Fiber in the amount of $70,260.00 and Cox
Communications Gulf Coast in the amount of $115,188.00. Funding will be paid from General Funds. The
contract is effective July 14, 2018 through July 13, 2019. A copy of the award tabulation is attached.

For additional information, please contact Eric Mitchell, Director MIS & IT at (850) 689-7184.

[TB18-09_TAB.PDF (160 KB) |

H

Administrative Content

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several
items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been
provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items
may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member.

Motion & Voting

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by the
Superintendent
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Motion by Rodney Walker, second by Dewey Destin.
Final Resolution: Motion Carries
Yes: Tim Bryant, Dewey Destin, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker, Lamar White
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TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

- Southem Light LLC dba Unfti Fiber | Cox Communications Guif Coast
Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge
Antioch ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Charge
100Mbps No Bid No Bid - 843000 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge
Baker School 50 Mbps $395.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
100 Mbps $450.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
150 Mbps $505.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
200 Mbps $585.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
250 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
300 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
350 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
400 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
450 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
508 Mb $674.00 1 No Bid No Bid
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

__Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge
Bay Area Office 50 Mbps $257.00 $2,850.00 $273.00 No Charge
100Mbps . 538500 ~ NoCharge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $420.00 No Charge _ $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $450.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge _ $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $515.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge
Bluewater ES _ 50 Mbps $257.00 $5,500.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $400.00 $1,125.00 $430.00 No Charge
150 Mb o o $436.00 . No€harge $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $470.00 $1,375.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $350.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $524.00 No Charge _ $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge _ $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge _ $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge _ $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge _ $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

" Southern Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber . | Cox Communications Gulf Coast

Location Bandwidth Speed onthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Bob Sikes ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Charge
100Mbps =~ No Bid No Bid -~ $43000 NoCharge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge _
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge

Bruner MS 50 Mbps $260.00 $11,250.00 $273.00 No Charge
100Mbps $400.00 $6,950.00 943000 | NoCharge
150 Mbps $435.00 $5,900.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $470.00 $7,225.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $500.00 $6,450.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $540.00 $5,425.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $580.00 $4,400.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $615.00 $3,525.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 $3,275.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 $5,275.00 $707.00 No Charge _
1 Gbps $800.00 $1,450.00 $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

| Southem Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber |  Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge
Carver Hill Complex 50 Mbps $260.00 $10,850.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $400.00 $6,575.00 $430.00 | NocCharge
150 Mbps $435.00 $5,500.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $470.00 $6,825.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $5,800.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $540.00 $5,050.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $580.00 $4,025.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $600.00 $3,525.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 $2,875.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 $4,900.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 $1,075.00 $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge
Choctawhatchee HS 50 Mbps $263.00 $2,200.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $380.00 No Charge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $415.00 No Charge $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $450.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $520.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

. Southerm Light, LLC dba Uniti Fibe  Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge
Crestview HS 50 Mbps $458.00 $3,250.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $460.00 $3,200.00 $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $465.00 $3,025.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $474.00 $5,175.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $4,250.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $545.00 $3,375.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $581.00 $2,450.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $617.00 $1,525.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $640.00 $950.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 $3,350.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Ghps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge
[Davidson MS 50 Mbps $257.00 $1,825.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $375.00 No Charge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $410.00 No Charge $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $445.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $515.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450Mbps | @ $62500 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

_Southem Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber Cox Communications Gulf Coast

Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge
Destin ES 50 Mbps $263.00 $1,475.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps . $375.00 - NoCharge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $410.00 No Charge _ $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $445.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge _ $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $515.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge _ $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge _ $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge
[Destin MS 50 Mbps $257.00 $3,125.0 $273.00 No Chargie
= $375 . No Charge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $410.00 No Charge _ $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $445.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge _ $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $515.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge _ $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge _ $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge _ $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

Location

No Bid

Cox Communicalions

Bandwidth Speed Monthly“Cost One Tlme Charge\\ Monthly Cost One Time Chare

$273.00

100Mbps = No Bid No Bid . ~ No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge
[Edwins ES 50 Mbps $263.00 $1,825.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $365.00 No Charge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $400.00 No Charge $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $445.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $520.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge_
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

' Southem Light | EC dba UnitiFiber | = Cox Communications Gulf Coast

Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Eglin ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps: No Bid No Bid . 95430000 |  NoCharge:
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge _
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge _
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge

Elliott Point ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps = No Bid No Bid - $43000 |  NocCharge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

. Southem Light, LLC dba UnitiFiber | | Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge
Florosa ES 50 Mbps $257.00 $6,600.00 $273.00 No Charge
100Mbps $385.00 $2,700.00 . %43000 No Charge
150 Mbps $410.00 $1,925.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $461.10 $2,725.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 $2,100.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $515.00 $1,350.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 $325.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge _ $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge
[Ft. Walton Bch HS 50 Mbps $257.00 $5,525.00 $273.00 No Charg-é
100 Mbps $385.00 $1,600.00 $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $439.00 No Charge _ $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $474.00 $1,300.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $375.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $525.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400Mbps |  $58500 | NoCharge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge _ $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

_ Southern Light,

Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Kenwood ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid .. $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge

Laurel Hill School 50 Mbps $395.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
100 Mbps $450.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
150 Mbps $505.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
200 M ' ] No Bid No Bid
250 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
300 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
350 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
400 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
450 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
500 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge No Bid No Bid




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

_ Southem Light, dba Uniti Fiber |  Cox Communications Gulf Coast
Location Bandwidth Speed Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge
Lewis MS 50 Mbps $395.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
100 Mbps $450.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
150 Mbps $505.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
200 Mbps . $58500 | NoChamge No Bid No Charge
250 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
300 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
350 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
400 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
450 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
500 Mbps $674.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge No Bid No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Ch_arge No Bid No Charge
Longwood4ES 50 Mbps No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Charge
100Mbps No Bid No Bid $43000 | NoCharge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

Location

Mary Esther ES

Bandwidth Speed

outhern Light LLC dba UnitiFiber | o GO
Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Tlm o Charge

No Bid

No Bid

$273. 00

No Charge

No Bid No Bid - $43000 _:.-No Charge .
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge
Meigs MS 50 Mbps $354.75 $8,850.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 M% - I $400.00 $7,475.00 943000 \
150 Mbps $435.00 $6,400.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $474.00 $7,625.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $6,700.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $545.00 $5,825.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $581.00 $4,900.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $617.00 $3,975.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $630.00 $3,650.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $680.00 $5,025.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Ghps $800.00 $1,975.00 $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

Location

Bandwidth Speed

hem Light, LLC dba Uniti Fiber
Month/ Cost One Time Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

" Cox Communicalions Gulf Coas,

Niceville HS 50 Mbps . $2,975.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $425.00 $2,800.00 $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $439.00 $2,375.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $474.00 $3,725.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $505.00 $2,925.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $530.00 $2,300.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $565.00 $1,400.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $590.00 $750.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 $1,225.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge

Northwood ES 50 Mbps $354.75 $15,075.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $400.00 $13,700.00 $430.00 No Charge
150Mbps |  $435.00 $12,625.00
200 Mbps $474.00 $13,850.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $12,925.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $545.00 $12,025.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $581.00 $11,125.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $617.00 $10,200.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $640.00 $9,600.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 $12,000.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 $8,175.00 $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 $525.00 $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

Location

NWFL Ballet Academie M $260.00 $1,175.00 -
100 Mbps $365.00 No Charge . No Charge
150 Mbps $395.00 No Charge $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $425.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $475.00 No Charge $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $505.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge

Okaloosa Detention Ctr___|50 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid _
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATIO

PRICING - DATA LINES

N FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

Location Bandwidth Speed

Okaloosa Technical Collegg50 Mbps $263.00 $8,475.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $400.00 $4,300.00 $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $435.00 $3,225.00 $460.00 No Charge
200Mbps $470.00 $4,550.00 ' . 1 No Cl
250 Mbps $510.00 $3,525.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $525.50 $3,125.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 $2,375.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 $1,350.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 $600.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 $2,600.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge

[Plew ES 50 Mbps _ $263.00 $6,375.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $395.00 $2,350.00 $43000 | NoCharge
150 Mbps $435.00 $1,125.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $470.00 $2,450.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $1,425.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $520.00 $1,175.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $566.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

" nLight LLC dba UnitiFiber | C
Monthly Cost One Time Charge Monthl "Cost One Tlme Charge

Location Bandwidth Speed

Pryor MS 50 Mbps $257.00 $3,300.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $375.00 No Charge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $410.00 No Charge $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $445.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $515.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400Mbps = | 7 $585.00 NoCharge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No ChargL

Riverside ES 50 Mbps 'No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Charge _
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200Mbps No Bid No Bid 500 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge _
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge

2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

Location

Bandwidth Speed

Mo hly Cost One Time Charge Monthl Cost One Time Charge

ns Guif Coast

Ruckel MS 50 Mbps $263.00 $6,500.00 $273.00 No Charge _
100 Mbps $400.00 $2,325.00 $430.00 No Charge _
150 Mbps $430.00 $1,400.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $470.00 $2,575.00 $505.00 No Charge ‘
250 Mbps $510.00 $1,550.00 $550.00 No Charge _
300 Mbps $545.00 $650.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $571.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge _
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge

*450 Mbgs 0} $82500 2 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge _
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge

Shalimar ES 50 Mbps $263.00 $6,200.00 $273.00 No Chare
100 Mbps = $395.00 $2,175.00 | $43000 , i
150 Mbps $435.00 $950.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $470.00 $2,275.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $1,250.00 $550.00 No Charge _
300 Mbps $545.00 $350.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $559.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $663.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

Cox Commimications Gulf Coas

Monthly Cost One T/me Charge Monthly Cost One Time Charge

Location Bandwidth Speed

Shoal River MS 50 Mbps i i $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps No Bid No Bid $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge

Silver Sands School 50 Mbps| ‘ $260.30 $1,850.00 - $273.00 1 NoCharge

100 Mbps $375.00 No Charge $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $415.00 No Charge $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $450.00 No Charge $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $485.00 No Charge $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $525.00 No Charge $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $555.00 No Charge $601.00 No Charge _
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $650.00 No Charge $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge

2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

PRICING - DATA LINES

Location

Southside School $263.00 $6,925.00 No
100 Mbps $400.00 $2,750.00 $430.00 No Charge
150 Mbps $435.00 $1,675.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $474.00 $2,900.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $1,975.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $545.00 $1,075.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $581.00 $175.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 No Charge $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 No Charge $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $684.00 $200.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge _
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge

Stemm Academy 50 Mbps $263.00 $10,200.00 $273.00 No Charge
100 Mbps $400.00 $6,025.00 1:$43000 | NoCharge
150 Mbps $435.00 $4,950.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $474.00 $6,175.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $5,250.00 $550.00 No Charge _
300 Mbps $545.00 $4,350.00 $563.00 No Charge _
350 Mbps $580.20 $3,450.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $595.00 $3,075.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $625.00 $2,325.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $668.50 $3,850.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $800.00 $500.00 $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




PRICING - DATA LINES

Location

Walker ES

No Bid

No Bid

$273.00

TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

No Bid No Bid - H43l g
150 Mbps No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps No Bid No Bid $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps No Bid No Bid $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps No Bid No Bid $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps No Bid No Bid $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps No Bid No Bid $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps No Bid No Bid $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps No Bid No Bid $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps No Bid No Bid $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Charge
Wright ES 50 Mbps $263.00 $13,425.00 $273.00 No Charge
$400.00 $9,250.00 430 : '
150 Mbps $439.00 $8,050.00 $460.00 No Charge
200 Mbps $474.00 $9,400.00 $505.00 No Charge
250 Mbps $510.00 $8,475.00 $550.00 No Charge
300 Mbps $545.00 $7,575.00 $563.00 No Charge
350 Mbps $581.00 $6,675.00 $601.00 No Charge
400 Mbps $617.00 $5,750.00 $637.00 No Charge
450 Mbps $650.00 $4,900.00 $672.00 No Charge
500 Mbps $684.00 $6,700.00 $707.00 No Charge
1 Gbps $946.00 No Charge $740.00 No Charge
1.5 Gbps $1,100.00 No Charge $818.00 No Charge
2 Gbps $1,450.00 No Charge $930.00 No Charge




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-09 TELECOMMUNICATION SERVICES FOR WIDE AREA NETWORK (WAN)

mmiinications Gulf Coas

Signed Bidders Acknowledgment?

Signed Addendum? Yes Yes

Signed Debarment/Drug Free Form? Yes Yes

Signed E-Rate Participant Form? Yes Yes

Vendor Meets Stated Qualifications? Yes Yes

{Pages #15-21 of ITB)
COMMENDATION FORAWARD:
MMITTEE: Brandon McSween, Specialist Eric Mitchell, Director MIS & IT
William Hagan, Mobile Learning Analyst Dustin Keith, Specialist

Committee Recommendation:

Committee recommends award to the lowest responsible and responsive bidder Southern Light in the amount of $70,260.00

and Cox Communications GC in the amount of $115,188.00 (based on a 12 month contract period before E-Rate is applied).
Recommended bandwidth speeds and monthly charges by site are included on the attachment titled "Awards By Site". Future
bandwidth upgrades will be priced as stated as long as the contract is in force. The initial contract term is one year with the
option for up to four additional years at the same terms and conditions. Services agreed upon above shall begin on July 1st,
2018. The following locations are not awarded at this time but may be in the future.: Choctawhatchee HS, Crestview HS,
Edwins ES, Niceville HS, Okaloosa Detention Center (DJJ) and Shoal River MS.

FUNCTION OBJECT CTR PROJECT
7900 376 9050

“Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Florida Statutes 120.57 Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120,
Florida Statutes.”

POSTED: 1/23/18 2.00PMCT



