SCHOOL DISTRICT OF OKALOOSA COUNTY
Purchasing Department

BOARD MEMBERS
TIM BRYANT
LINDA EVANCHYK
MARTI GARDNER
DIANE KELLEY
LAMAR WHITE

SUPERINTENDENT OF SCHOOLS
MARCUS D. CHAMBERS

ATTORNEY TO THE BOARD
C. JEFFREY MCcINNIS, ESQ.

PGM. DIRECTOR - PURCHASING
VINCE WINDHAM, CPPB

December 12, 2023

Supreme Paper Supplies, LLC
Ray Millet, Branch Manager
8965 Pensacola Blvd
Pensacola, FL 32534

Subject: ITB 18-07 Custodial Equipment and Repair Services-District Wide

Acceptance of discontinuation of Iltem 46 with replacement item.

Dear Mr. Millet,

Per the terms and conditions of the ITB 18-07 the Purchasing Department is in acceptance of
the discontinued item: Item #46-ASO20BT Scrubber BE-E89769-EA with the replacement item
offered: Karcher Unit from Demo 10/31 BD5050 20"Walk Behind Scrubber in the amount of
$4,995.07

If you have any questions regarding this letter please feel free to contact the Purchasing
Department at (850) 833-7668.

Sincerely,

Ghef
Vince Windham, CPPB

Program Director — Purchasing

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT - ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX - 120 LOWERY PLACE S.E.
FORT WALTON BEACH, FLORIDA 32548
TELEPHONE (850) 833-7668 FAX (850) 833-6327



ITB 18-07 Custodial Equipment and Repair Services - District Wide - Opening Date and Time: 3/13/2018 2:00PM CT

Est.
Jtem# [hem Description c:z“a’c“’“ PR Chamical & Paper Supply Suprema Faper Supplies
ot Year
SIGNED BID / SK3NED Yes/ Yes Yes /Yes
IADDENDUMS
[Automatic Walk Bonind Serutber |5 g
16420 Gatton Commarcia! Eloor
GROUP [Machine, brush included. Approved ——45:309 0 Sea="$26,84550—
1 |Model: IPC Engle CT70 BTE0 24 Non-Responsive ! 6.711.38 '
1 Traction Drive {no substitutes) * $6, N
Trojan and/or Powertran (Brand
Name) Batterias
28" Autormatic Walk Behind Traction |5 ea
Crive Scrubbar 24725 Gallen
Commercial Floor Machine, brush
included. —46, 184 %5 02— $30,559:20—
2 |Approved Model: IPC Eagle CT80 Non-Responsive $7,639.80
BT70 (no subsiitules) * Trajan !
andfor Powerron (Brand Maimne)
Batteries.
Automatic Rider Scrubber 19720 2ea
Gallon Commercial Floor Machine,
biush incfuded Approved Modela: —$7.810:0x 2 va—915,220:80—
3 | iPC Eagle CTTO Rider (no Non-Responsive $9,513.00
substitutea} * Trojan andfor .
Powattion (Brand Name) Sattedes
Autcmatic Rider Scrubber 29/32 & 6a
Gallor: Commarcial Fisor Machine,
brush included Approvad Modala; —ﬂ;ﬁgg;ﬂﬂ*ﬂ-ea—uﬁﬁﬂ;ﬂ%:ﬂﬁ—
4 [IFc Eagie CT110 BT7O (na Nen-Respensive $12,499.85
substitutes) * Trofan and/er ? '
Powertron (Brand Name) Batterlea
32" Battery Powared Vacuum 2 ea
Sweeper, Commercial Flpar Machine.
Approved Models: IPC Eagle —$2;120:00 % 2 oa—-$4;240:60—
5 |smanvac684. (no substiutes) * Non-Respansive $2,650.00
Trojan andfor Powertran {Brand .
Nama) Batterien
21" Burnisher Propans Commerdal |5 ea
Floor Machine. Approved Models:
IPC Eagle PB21 (no substitutes) —$2.874 20 ea=$14;8 00—
6 Non-Respansive 5371775
W17,
!Sma\l Walk Behind Automatic fea
Scrubbar Commarcial Floor Machins,
brush Included. Approved Modela: W&rﬁi&;ﬂ?}m}n
7 |IPCEagls GT158 {ne substiuten) Non-Responsive $2.718.25
,718.
207 Burnigher Electric Commerdia! |5 ea
Floor Machine, pad holder Included.
|Apptoved Mode!s: (PG Eagle B1500 —4$957-00x Grea—$4;785:00—
8 [(no sybstitutes) Non-Responsive $1,196.25
196,
207 Buinisher Heavy-duty 1.5 HP b ea
Motor dual capacitar, 1756 RPM.
Appraved Madels, 1PG Eegle FM20 —3797.00x Sea=33,985.00
9 {no substitutea} Non-Rasponsive $996.25
Carpet Extractor Commerclal Fioor |5 ea
Machine. Approved Modal: IPC
Eagle SC7 17° {no subatitutes) — 4207000 5ea=510;390.60-
10 Non-Responsive $2,597.60
597,
Carpet Spotters Commardal Grads. |G sa
Approved Models: IPC Engle BX2
Fasttrack Extractor (no substitutes) —Gﬂmmmal—zfﬁ;oﬂ—
1 Non-Responsive $682.50
Autematic Scrubber 10413 20" Brush |5 o8
& Traction Driva. Approved Modal; GT 40850-QBC 20" Brush
IPC Eagle CT40 (no substtutes) $3,607:00- $4,533.75
12 Non-Responsive GT 408507T$0-0BC 20" Traction Diive
$4,274.69- $5,339.60
Canister Vacuum. Appioved Modsl, |15 ea
(PG Eagle LP (no subsiitutes)
230:00 %15 var=$345990—
13 Non-Responsive -3 $288.33 '
[/PC Eagla Backpack vac 8 ot 4 ca
(ne substitutes)
28770 xdrear=$1;150:80—
19 Non-Responsive -8 '

$359.63




ITB 18-07 Custodial Equipment and Repair Services - District Wide - Qpening Date and Time: 3/13/2018 2:00PM CT

Eat.
lem#  |item Description ’;""3""'“ PR Chemlcal & Paper Supply Supreme Paper Suppllas
er rear
IPC Eagle Backpack Vac 10 qt. 4 ea
(no substitutes)
15 Non-Responsive - 368 ;D e
Carpet Extractor Commarcial Floor San
Machine. Approved Modal: Tornado AT K ea =101 7285—
Group 7 |Marathan 1200 88188 fno 20N Y e
'J—Lm substitutes) '92;610:5:;;'-4 ;542:‘;58:94”—- Ne Bid
,684,
Carpet Extracter Commercial Floor |5 ea.
Machine. Approved Models: Tornade AT SBaT S8 1850—
Marathon 2000 98180 {na $2170 36—
17 [aubstitutes) $4:450.08— —$5-207-40 23 No Bid
SELS L340
$5,456.65 ea
Wel/Dry Vacs with front kquasgen. 5ea
Approved Models: Tormado Tank
Force 20 Tro-Map 84236 {no $456:TTx-5oao-522085:05—
f No BIg
18 [oubsiten) $566:210a— $622.02 ea
Commercial Upright Vecuum 14° Inch [10 ea
Appraved Modsl: Tornado Uprght " et -
TOR-9814T {no substtuten) 263,66 % t0oar= 92,535:50
19 $270:86-08— —$3168:37-e0— No Bld
$334.04 ea
Canister Yacuum_ Appraved Modal: |5 ea
Tornado TV Z 55 (ng substitutes)
20 $215.03 x5 0a = $1,07515 No B1d
TFacVac 6 Arcemton Backpack Sea
Vacuum  Approved Model: Terade $2t5 03 S Ear=$1,075T15—
Fat Vac 8 Air Comfort 83912 {ng $20515ea-
21 |substitutes) $303:04-8a— —$348:50-0a— No Bld
$365.69 ea
rPac-Vacw ‘Arcomier Backpack |5 ea
Vacuum Approved Model; Tornaco T35 $4:202:35
Pac Vac 10 Air Comfort 82014 (no 2404 e
2 [substituten) $20249 v No Bid
£322:20-00— $370.T5ea
Commeicial Grada FantAlr Mover, 10ea
tApproved Modsls: Teinade ~$185:00xH0ea=31.850.00—
I'indshear Storm Deluxe Daisy Chaln - v
23 [capasle Mode #9870 $228: 00 e —$262:25w @ — No Bid
{no substitutes) $275.36 e
Commercial Grade Fana/Ar Movers |5 ea
Approved Models: Tormado—
emsvear-3500-FOR-607 72—
y $TISEUX S SEGEUU
24 |(no substitutas) . xvea= No Bld
Tornada Windshaar 3200 52072602 $260.04 ea
(replacament for abave ilem that was
discontinued $-248-18)
Cylindrical Brush Scrubber, 10 ea
Commercial Floar Machins.
Approved Model: ‘Tomado BR 1341 “$H52a b t0ea=$15,213710—
25 |MW (no substiutes) 174760 ea Ko Bid
$4675.50-00— g
20" Automatic Walk Behind Scrubber |5 aa
10/13 Gallon Sommerciel Floor SHHO M Sra=$15,550.20
mazhilnes. ;nsu:h ir::lud;:é?ppmmlf) Triple § / Panther 2081 $2,987.52 x 5 ea = $14,937.60
odal: anther or equa . 3.909.45
» *Tiojan (Brand Nama} Batterles $3;514:f;:33:|9 G ei— Boteo E2993700
3 Y ea
2. Auto Scrubber, Solution/Rocovery]s ea
Capacity 17.qallon,_Approvest Model:) discontinued item 3/2021 00:00—
S8 Panlner sLequa) ~$5,8298T xS ea=327,647.65— TSRO0 X BT = $26,100:
a7 | Tiolan (Brand Name) Battaries Lainhil L 1PC Eagle CT70BT70
teplacement BE066-S5S Panthet $5:519.66—46,237-06-ea— $6,525.00
2671 (3-16-21) $6,778.60 ea e
28 petExtracior Froor 5 ea
| Boboot-4D-56026- -
o AR x Sroa=37150:50— No Bid
SSS Thundarcat (Replacement for $4608:63—-$+763:t6ea—
abova item that was discontinued $2,062.90 ea
5-7.2019)
2B |20 Floor Machine, 173 rpm, pad §oa
halder Incfuded. Approved hadal: 55720615 $2-860-30—
588 20" Cougat Q e $495.00 x 5 aa = $2,475.00
for equa) $ e 000 o Edic ED-20L§3-BK-EA




ITB 18-07 Custodial Equipment and Repair Services - District Wide - Opening Date and Time: 3/13/2018 2:00PM CT

Est.
Item #  |item Description ‘:l“;';ﬁ::' PR Chemical & Paper Supply Supreme Papar Suppliag
r
30 |20° Bumnisher 1500 RPM with flexitle |5 aa
pad driver - 55° cord/aafety grange. STA9.06 X S BT 5T TS5 30—
Auf_:;""d Model: 553 Cheetah500 Altesnato: Tormado BrutoForce 1800 Glarer $742.80 x § ea » $3,590.00 $726.40 x 5 oa = $3,682.00
far E'q“,) $863-80-e0—5+,023:25-ea— Beteo EB201500
$1,19541 ea
3 (WetDry Vace - veruatile, sacy-to-uza [5 ag
machine vil foot pedal for front BTSN B v = $2,696:75— $695:40-5-8mw $AATT00—
mount squaegoa release for ensa of
use. Approved Model; 5SS Black Cat $603:43-00-—$694-2000— IPC Eagle 415P-T80184
18 FMS 86040 {or oqual) $811.26 ea $869,25
Carpet Spotters Commercia! Grede. |8 o
. 37t xbea= —
Approved Models: SSS Wildeat -3 W 5556.40 X5ea= 33,398.40
32 |carpet Spotter 85030 {or squal) (this item discontinued - no replacement item available) Belco EB550900
5-7-2019
124" Burnisher Propane Commercial |5 ea
Floor Machine. Approved Madel; 3375000 X Sea =S 1075000
At 21 al]
. ec Answer 21° (or equal) $3060-00ea— No Bid
-$3,482.00-02~-—§3,752-87ea—
$3,893.40ea
24" Propane Fowel Floof Finish 208
Strippes Commoerclal Floor Machina,
Approved Model: Azlo 24" TIGHLEY X Zoa=§10;:88566—
34 |Sidswinder —45,659:50-ea— Ne Bld
{ar equal) —&5,288.00.0a- $7,132.71 62
20" Propane Power Flaor Finish 2 aa
. |Stripper Commaercial Floor Machina, .
agproved Macel: Agtac 30° $5:300:00x 2w =S HE0000—
35 |sidewinder {or equal) —46;105:00-ea— No Bid
—$6,308.00 6a- $7,045,05¢a
207 1.5 hp. Classic Metal Dual Spoed [§ ga
Floor Maching, pad hefder Includad.
Approved Macel: Powerfiita C202 $781:80 x5 oer=53,858:00 $746.90 x 5 ea = $3,734.50
3 Jior eaua) §798-44ca— Botco E830100
$835.54 8a
SuperCoach Backpack Vas & qt.: (or |4 ea
sgual)
a7 $652.33 x 4 ea = $2,609.32 $387.90 x 4 a = $1,6561,60
ProTeam C202 proteam 107310
SuperCoach Backpack Vac 10 qt: [o¢]4 ea
equal)
= $399.70 x 4 0a = $1,598.80
EL) $663,78 x 4 ea = $2,655.12 proteam 107303
Side Brush for BR 131 MW 10ea
Gropp 4 — 3582y ma=§5e 230 No Bld
38 $58.67 ea
Hoover Type A Vac Bags for Hoover [10G sa
Uprighi. —
iS5 100wa=s 'v'i'“ $.59 ea x 100 ea = 569,00
“0 'G'“n:;f;; 2:’“0 $1.77 pk *Greanilesn 3/pk
Green Klaan Vac Bags GK-300BP = [300 ea
Bags for 6qt. back pack
. —50: 0% 300-ea=$243:00— $.564 va x 300 oa = $169.20
$7.72¢ca 10fpk
Green Klean Vac Baga GK-1000BP - | 300 ea
Bags fer 104t back pack
42 —$H07-200-ea 532406 $.763 ea x 300 oa = §225,90
$10.36 ea 10/pk
Reuszbie Cloth Bag CM-Cloth = Baga |20 ea
for Toinado Upright
obsclate - fo longar evailable
43 [21818 — 5124020 nar e $245:80— No Bld
TReusabie Bag # 90014 Bags for 10 ea
Tornada Canlster Vac
. $22.84 x 10 ea = $228.40 No BId
Reusable Bag #80035 for TV23S $22.84 x 10 = $228.40




ITB 18-07 Custodial Equipment and Repair Services - District Wide - Opening Date and Time: 3/13/2018 2;00PM CT
Fel.
lom # | Item Deseription ?,_,':'3‘::” PR Chemical & Paper Supply Supreme Paper Supplies
(AZ3-070-27LRD Azlec Tha Low

Rider High Spead Piopans Burnisher
27" wiDust (Addiion 1o the Bld 4-29-

$3,845.00— $4,037.25 ea

45 2019)
Karcher Unit Fiom DEMO BDS050
20"Walk Behind Scrubber (Replaced
Stealth ASO208T Sciubber $4,995.07
44 12/12/2023)
[Preventative Maintenance Labor Rate)
for Annual Services on Equipment -
Srous | $60.00 $45,00
Maintenance Laber Rata for Repalra
to Braken Equipment ssO 00 545 00
e e PR SR L o P S R S s R e ko B i
VWarranty Manufactures warranties enclosed IPC Eagle, Belco, Proteam,
Enclosed with Bid Edic
Years in Business
34 Years, 3 Months 32 Years

Referances

GCA Services, Brevard Achievement,

Ckaloosa County School

Escambia County Schools, University of West Florida, GCA
Services

Bidders Slatement of Principal
Plage of Business;

Florida

Flerida




