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Agenda Item Details

Meeting Jan 22, 2018 - Regular Meeting

Category 8. Consent Agenda

Subject 8.17 ITB 18-06 Remanufactured Bus Parts, presented by Vince Winham, Program
Director, Purchasing, and recommended by the Superintendent for approval.

Access Public

Type Action (Consent)

Fiscal Impact Yes

Budgeted Yes

Budget Source General Funds

Recommended Action Motion to approve the committee's award of ITB 18-06 Remanufactured Bus Parts to
Test Calibration Company, Inc.

Public Content

Request approval of the committee's award of ITB 18-06 Remanufactured Bus Parts to Test Calibration
Company, Inc. The bid was awarded based on fixed prices and will be used on an as needed basis. Funding
will be paid from General Funds and a copy of the award tabulation is attached.

For additional information, please contact Jay Mclnnis, Program Director, Transportation at (850) 833-3553.

ITB 18-06 TAB.pdf (33 KB)

Administrative Content

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several
items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been
provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items
may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member.

Motion & Voting

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommg
Superintendent

Motion by Rodney Walker, second by Tim Bryant.
Final Resolution: Motion Carries
Yes: Tim Bryant, Dewey Destin, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker
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TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 1TB 18-06 REMANUFACTURED BUS PARTS

. Commercial Truck ]Commercial Truck JO'Reilly Auto Parts }Test Calibration Jasper Engines &
DESCRIPTION/MODEL/MAKE: & Tire, Inc & Tire, Inc-pricing Company inc transmissions

Item 1. Remanufactured Fuel including 5% Bidder
R Preference discount
Injector:

" given to the lowest
Completely reconditioned, flowed FL bidder

and calibrated. Includes all
necessary O-rings

1994-1996 Navistar T444E-

Total Quote Price with Core Charge:

$ 325.00( % 308.75| % 34940 | $ 250.00| $ 355.00

Total Quote Price without Core
Charge:

1997-1999 Navistar T444E-

Total Quote Price with Core Charge: |

150.00] $ 205.00

$ 325.001 $ 30875 $ 364.59 | $ 250.00

Total Quote Price without Core
Charge: $ 23500 % 223251 % 176591 $ 150.00| $ 205.00

1999-2004 Navistar T444E-
Total Quote Price with Core Charge:

250.00

Total Quote Price without Core
Charge: $ 235.00( % 223251 % 179.35| $ 150.00] $ 205.00

2005-2006 Navistar VT365-
Total Quote Price with Core Charge:

$ 340.00| $ 323.00| % 388.19| $ 275.00] $ 317.00

Total Quote Price without Core
Charge: $ 235.001 % 223251| % 189.19] $ 175.00] $ 192.00

2007-2010 Navistar DT466-
Total Quote Price with Core Charge: |

380.00

Total Quote Price without Core
Charge: $ 33500| $ 318.25 No Bid $ 280.00] $ 355.00




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-06 REMANUFACTURED BUS PARTS

Item 2. Remanufactured IPR
Valves:
1994-1996 Navistar T444E-

Total Quote Price with Core Charge:

3 319.001 % 303.05 No Bid $ 171.00] $ 255.00

Total i ith
Crapgar 1€ Frice wiaut Gore $  23000|$  21850] NoBid |$ 15000 §  180.00

1997-1999 Navistar T444E-
Total Quote Price with Core Charge:

3 319.00] $ 303.05 N/A $ 175.001 $ 255.00

Total Quote Price without Core

Charge: $ 230.00{ $ 21850 | $ 139.621 $
1999.2004 Navistar TA44E- - -
Total Quote Price with Core Charge: $ 319.00| $ 303.05 N/A $
Total Quote Price without Core

Charge: 5 23000|$ 21850/ $ 139.62| $ 150.00{ $  180.00

2005-2006 Navistar VT365-

Total Quote Price with Core Charge: | $ 319.00] $ 303.05 N/A $ 175.00
—
é?]frlg?;me Price without Core $ 230.00| $ 21850| $ 211.09] $ 150.00| $ 175.00

2007-2010 Navistar DT466-Max

Total Quote Price Including Core
Charge:

175.00f $ 420.00

Total Quote Price without Core
Charge: $ 426.00| $ 404.70 No Bid $ 150.00] $ 270.00




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-06 REMANUFACTURED BUS PARTS

item 3. Redesigned EGR Valve
& Oil Cooler Kit:

2005-2006 Navistar VT365
EGR Cooler & Oil Cooler Kit -

Total Quote Price with Core Charge:

$ 600.00| $ 570.00 No Bid $ 629.00[ $ 650.00

;ztaa:g(ggote Price without Core $ 500001 5 570,00 . S p—— —
2007-2010 Navistar DT466 [ R
EGR Cooler Exhaust Side-

Total Quote Price with Core Charge: |

3 1,220.00| $ 1,159.00 No Bid $ 895.001 $ 1,980.00

Total Quote Price without Core
Charge:

2007-2010 Navistar DT466
EGR Cooler Intake Side-

Total Quote Price with Core Charge:

$ 971.00| $ 922.45 No Bid $ 895.00] $ 1,680.00

$ 1624003 154280  NoBid $ 725.00{ $  1,500.00
Ez‘::g‘;?°te Price without Core $  1,42400|$  1,352.80 No Bid $ 725000 $  1,200.00
Signed Bid: Yes Yes Yes Yes
Signed Amendments 1: Yes Yes Yes Yes
Signed Vendor Preference: Yes/FL Yes/MO Yes/AL Yes/IN

Warranty Statements:

No No No Yes




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 18-06 REMANUFACTURED BUS PARTS

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in
response to this solicitation, if any are hereby rejected as late.

BIDDERS WHO BID "NO BID": None
NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDERS: None

‘RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD

Committee: Jay Mcinnis Kevin Bell

Tim Roberts

Committee recommends award to the lowest responsible and responsive bidder Test Calibration. Purchases will be
made on an as needed basis.

FUNDING
Fund Function Object Cost Center Project
1010 7801 0550 9113
1010 7802 0550 9213
1010 7803 0550 9313

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Florida Statutes 120.57,Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter
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