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Agenda Item Details

Meeting Oct 27, 2014 - Regular Meeting
Category 7. Consent Agenda
Subject 7.11 ITB 15-07 Emergency Bid for Electrical Wire Replacement-Ruckel, presented by

Vince Windham, Program Director, Purchasing, and recommended by the
Superintendent for approval.

Access Public

Type Action (Consent)

Fiscal Impact Yes

Dollar Amount 32,754.00

Budgeted Yes

Budget Source Capital Funds, Project 2336, Emergency Maintenance-District Wide

Recommended Motion to approved the committee's recommendation to award the Emergency Bid for

Action Electrical Wire Replacement at Ruckel Middle School to Bearden Construction Company,
Inc. in the amount of $32,754.00. The amount of $26,854.00 for wire replacement and
$5,900.00 for the option to replace the conduit, if needed. Emergency Bid procedures
per School Board Policy 2-17(A)(13) were used for this solicitation due to the following:
Ruckel Middle School lost power to part of the campus on Wednesday, October 8, 2014.
The Maintenance Department discovered conductors that pose a potential to short out a
400 amp feed to one (1) of the ramps at Ruckel. What caused the electrical splice to
deteriorate is unknown. What is known is that it should not have occurred. One (1) of
the four (4) 600 MCM Aluminum conductors shorted out and overheated causing the
outage. The damaged conductor is still alive and overheating is damaging the conductor
it is laying on in the underground manhole. They could short out at any time and we
would have to rent a generator to run that portion of the school until the new
conductors are installed. Funding will be paid from Capital funds, Project 2336,
Emergency Maintenance-District Wide. A copy of the tabulation is attached.

Public Content

Request approval of the committee's recommendation to award the Emergency Bid for Electrical Wire
Replacement at Ruckel Middle School to Bearden Construction Company, Inc. in the amount of $32,754.00.
The amount of $26,854.00 for wire replacement and $5,900.00 for the option to replace the conduit, if
needed. Emergency Bid procedures per School Board Policy 2-17(A)(13) were used for this solicitation due
to the following: Ruckel Middle School lost power to part of the campus on Wednesday, October 8, 2014.
The Maintenance Department discovered conductors that pose a potential to short out a 400 amp feed to
one (1) of the ramps at Ruckel. What caused the electrical splice to deteriorate is unknown. What is known
is that it should not have occurred. One (1) of the four (4) 600 MCM Aluminum conductors shorted out and
overheated causing the outage. The damaged conductor is still alive and overheating is damaging the
conductor it is laying on in the underground manhole. They could short out at any time and we would have
to rent a generator to run that portion of the school until the new conductors are installed. Funding will be
paid from Capital funds, Project 2336, Emergency Maintenance-District Wide. A copy of the tabulation is
attached.

For additional information, please contact Steve Bolton, Program Director, Maintenance at (850) 689-7159.
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Administrative Content

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several
items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been
provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items
may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member.

Motion & Voting

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by the
Superintendent

Motion by Cathy Thigpen, second by Cindy Frakes.
Final Resolution: Motion Carries
Yes: Dewey Destin, Cindy Frakes, Cathy Thigpen, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker
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TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 156-07 EMERGENCY BID FOR ELECTRICAL WIRE REPLACEMENT - RUCKEL MIDDDLE SCHOOL.
Hem !

Peaden Bearden Construction Co. Bayou Mechanical

Provide and install a new
feed consisiting of 4 runs of
600 XHHW Aluminum and 1
run of #2 THHN2 copper in
existing conduit - appx 535
Termination of new feeds;
Remove existing
conductors/debris and
sipose of conductors &
debris; Work to begin on
10/17/14 and job to be $28,650.00 $26,854.00 No Bid
completed and up and
running prior to start of
school on 10/21/14 provided
no unforeseen issues;
Electrical permit included.

Option #1: Provide 116KW

Generator, Price Per Day : $1,470.00 per Day $2,400.00 per day No Bid
Option #2: Replace 200" of .
3.5" conduit if required $5,730.00 $5,900.00 No Bid

Completion Time: No later than 10/20/14 No later than 10/20/14. No Bid

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any are
hereby rejected as late.

BIDDERS WHO BID "NO BID": None
NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDERS: None




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION FOR ITB 15-07 EMERGENCY BID FOR ELECTRICAL WIRE REPLACEMENT - RUCKEL MIDDDLE SCHOOL.

RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD:
Committee: Steve Bolton, Maintenance Dept Bill Smith, Facilities

Committee recommends award to the lowest responsible and responsive bidder Bearden Canstruction Company, Inc. in the amount of

$26,854 00 for wire replacement and $5,900.00 (Option to replace conduit if needed). District intends to rent a generator on a daily basis if option
to replace conduit is needed.

FUNDING
Fund Function Object  Center Project Amount
3715 7400 0684 9025 2336 $32,754.00 Emergency Maintenance

“Failure to fite a protest within the time prescribed m Florida Statutes 120.57,Flonda Statutes, shall constitite a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.”

Emergency Bid procedures per School Board Policy 2-17(A)(13) were used for this solictation due to the following: Ruckel Middle School lost
power to part of the campus on Wednesday, October 8, 2014. The Maintenance Department discovered conductors that pose a potential to short
out a 400 amp feed to one of the ramps at Ruckel. What caused the electrical splice to deteriorate is unknown. What is known is that it should
not have occured. One of the four 600 MCM Aluminum conductors shorted out and overheated causing an outage. The damaged conductor is
still ative and overheating is damaging the conductor it is laying on in the underground manhole. They could short out at any time and we would
have to rent a generator to run that portion of the school until new conductors are installed.
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Approval of Emergency Bid Award:

Posted: 10/14/14 2:00 PMCT




Bearden Construction Company, Inc.

ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS
industrial Commercial Pole Line
October 14, 2014

To: Okaloosa School District, Tom Cox and Luke Mitchell
Ref: Ruckel Middle School-Niceville Emergency Wire Replacement

Gentlemen,

Bearden Construction Company, Inc. E.C. is pleased to provide our quote on the electrical
portion of the above referenced project per the attached scope of work and our pertinent notes.

item #1: Wire Replacement: $ 26,854.00
ltem #2: Add Option #1 Temporary Genset Connection per day: $ 2,400.00

item #3: Add Option #2: Ditching and Re-place Duct: $ 5,900.00

The following notes apply.

1. Our quote is in accordance with the attached scope of work provided.
If you have any questions please call Gary Bearden or the undersigned.

Thank you,

ar ol

Earl Bearden, C.E.O. Via fax or e-mail 2-pages
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