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Agenda Item Details

Meeting Apr 14, 2014 - Regular Meeting

Category 7. Consent Agenda

Subject 7.25 ITB 14-09 Band Instruments, presented by Vince Windham, Program Director,
Purchasing, and recommended by the Superintendent for approval.

Access Public

Type Action (Consent)

Fiscal Impact Yes
Budgeted Yes
Budget Source General Funds, Project 2393 Band Instrument Replacement

Recommended Motion to approve the committee's recommendation of award of ITB 14-09 Band

Action Instruments to multiple vendors, based on fixed pricing, for the contract period of April
15, 2014 through October, 15, 2014. This is a district wide bid and purchases will be
made on an as needed basis.

Public Content

Request approval of the committee's recommendation of award of ITB 14-09 Band Instruments to multiple
vendors, based on fixed pricing, for the contract period of April 15, 2014 through October, 15, 2014, This is
a district wide bid and purchases will be made on an as needed basis. A copy of the tabulation is attached.

For additional information, please contact Vince Windham, Program Director, Purchasing at (850) 833-7668.

[ZITB_14-09.pdf (114 KB)

Administrative Content

Our adopted rules of Parliamentary Procedure, Robert's Rules, provide for a consent agenda listing several
items for approval of the Board by a single motion. Documentation concerning these items have been
provided to all Board members and the public in advance to assure an extensive and thorough review. Items
may be removed from the consent agenda at the request of any board member.

Motion & Voting

Motion to approve the Consent Agenda and all of the Consent Agenda items as recommended by the
Superintendent

Motion by Cindy Frakes, second by Cathy Thigpen.

Final Resolution: Motion Carries
Yes: Dewey Destin, Cindy Frakes, Cathy Thigpen, Melissa Thrush, Rodney Walker
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TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ITB 14-09 BAND INSTRUMENTS - OPENING DATE AND TIME 3-11-14 2:00PM CT

494.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) wl MO MD FL ($28.50) $541.50
Peart 16 inch Champion Series MDR1614XN46
PEA-PBD 1614-46 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 15 days 30 days 10 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1-3 Years see attached Statements attached 1 Year
Marimba 4.3 Octave: with Grid lron Power Cart $ 4,181.00 No Bid 4,075.00 | § 4,499.00 No Bid
Preference to Florida Business (5%) Wl MD FL ($224.95) $4,274.05
MARKMPSE43G
Dynasty PO8-DMP43 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-75 days ARQ 60 days 30 Days
Warranty: Standard Mir. Statements attached 1 Year
Clarinet, Bass: Low Eb Includes: Compact Case, 4C Plastic :
Mouthpiece, Ligature, Cap, Cork Grease, Neck Strap, Treated
Polishing Cloth and Cleaning Cioth $ 1,636.00 1,645.00 1 $ 1,637.00] § 1,850.00 | $ 1,636.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) Wi MD MD FL ($92.50) $1,757.50 SD
sacycL221ll
Yamaha YCL221 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Spedified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-45 days ARQ No Response 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: Standard Mir. SYear . 5 Year statements attached 5 Year 1 Year
Clarinet, Bass: low Eb Includes: Case, Mouthpiece, Cap and o i
Ligature $ 1,321.00 No Bid 1,321.00 | $ A 1,31900 | $ 1,65000 | $ 1,320.95
Preference to Florida Business {5%) w MD - ;“ MO FL ($77.50) $1,472.50 SD
BBCL7168 i S
Leblanc 7168 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified - As Specified = As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-45 days ARO 15 days 30days . 7 days 10 days
Warranty: Standard Mir. 5 Year statements aftached 5 Year 1 Year
Clarinet, Bass: Bb Indudes: Case/Mouthpiece/Cap and Ligature $ 1,336.00 No Bid 1,336.00 31,334.00 < $ 1,55000 | $ 1,335.00
Preference to Florida Business {5%) Wi MD . LMD FL {$77.50) $1,472.50 SD
BBC1430LP As :
Selmber 1430LP Brand & Model Bid: Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 3045 days ARO 15 days 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 5 Year statements attached 5 Year 1 Year
Saxophone, Tenor: intermediate Bb s 177570 1,794.00 1,785.00 | $ 1,77600 | $ 1,99500 [ $ 1,788.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) Wi NY MD FL ($99.75) $1,895.25 sD
Yamaha YTS 480 Brand & Model Bid: BTSYTS480C As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 3045 days ARQ 30 days No Response 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: - Standard Mfr. 5 Year 5 Year statements attached 5 Year 1 Year
Saxophone, Soprano: Professional $ 2,758.80 No Bid 2,962.00 | $ 2,757.001 8 3,225.00 3 2,749.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) Wi MD MD FL ($161.25) $3,063.75 sD.
Yanagisawa S-991 Brand & Model Bid: BSSSS991  As Specified As Specified As Spacified As Specified £ Asépedﬂgd
Delivery Lead Time: 30-45 days ARO 15 days 30 days 30 days : 10 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 5 Year statements attached 5 Year [ . 1Year -




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ITB 14-09 BAND INSTRUMENTS - OPENING DATE AND TIME 3-11-14 2:00PM CT

b

8 p Inter No Bid $ 1,595.00 | § 1,588.00 | $ 1,795.00 1,588.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) MD MD FL ($89.75) $1,705.25 sD
Yamaha YSS-475I! Brand & Model Bid: As Spedified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 1545 days 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: 5 Year statements attached 5 Year 1 Year
9 Timpani, Hammered Copper: 23 Inch No Bid $ 237600 | $ 235400 | § 272500 | $ 2,316.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) MD MD FL ($136.25) $2,588.75 SD
Adams Professional Generation
Il Hammered/Cambered ADM-
P2KH23 Brand & Modei Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 15-30 days 30 days 30 days 14 days
Warranty: 1 Year statements attached 1 Year 1 Year
10| Timpani, Hammered Copper: 26 Inch No Bid $ 2,50000 [ § 2,478.00| $ 2,865.00 $2,437.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) MD MD FL ($143.25) $2,721.75 SD
Adams Professional Generation
I Hammered/Cambered ADM-
P2KH26 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 15-30 days 30 days 10 days 14 days
Warranty: 1 Year statements attached 1 Year 1 Year
11 |Trombone, Bass Independent $ 2,266.00 No Bid $ 238400 | 8 2,589.00 | § 2,575.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%} Wi MD MD FL ($128.75) $2,446.25
BBO1052FDR T
Getzen 1052FD Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified +: As Spedified
Delivery Lead Time: 60-90 days ARO 30-90 days 60 days 30 days '60.90 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 5 Year . AYear
12 Trombone, Bass: $ 2,897.70 No Bid S 2,314.001 $ 2,505.00 | $§ 2,695.00 No Bid
Preference to Florida Business {§%) Wl L iEs MD MD FL ($134.75) $2,560.25
Bach Stradivarius 50 BL  Bass T 3
Trombone Brand & Model Bid: 88050821 : As'Specified As Spedified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-45 days ARO . 30-45dwys 30 days 60 days
Warranty: Standard Mir, . 5Year : statements attached 1 Year
13|Snare: 14"x12"": Maple/Chrome Hardware/Clear Lacquer Finish | § G 484.00 No Bid $ 617.00 | $ 622001 § 655.00 | $ 480.00
MDRFFXL1412A368 -
FFXL1412A Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Spedified As Specified As Specified As Specified
: custom color est.
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARC 4-6 months 4 to 6 months 5-6 manths 120-160 days
Warranty: Standard MIr. 1year see attached statements attached 1 Year 1 Year
14|stand $ 95.35 No Bid $ 109.00 | $ 91.00| 11200 109.00
£S41351030L
S-1030L Brand & Model Bid: As Spacified MSS-300 As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO. 15-30 days 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: Standard Mir, 1 Year statements attached 1 Year 1 Year




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD (TB 14-09 BAND INSTRUMENTS - OPENING DATE AND TIME 3-11-14 2:00PM CT

31.00

31.50

15]Cover No Bid 36.00 $ 36.50
MDCG14 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 15-30 days 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: 1 Year statements attached 1 Year 1 Year
16 [carrier No Bid 191.00 17000 ] $ 190.00 168.95
CXS1 Brand & Model Bid: As Spedified As Spedified As Spaecified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 15-30 days 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: 1 Year statements attached 1 Year 1 Year
TOTAL ITEMS 13-16 No Bid 953.00 914.00 | § 993.50 789.45
Preference to Florida Business (§%) NY MD MD FL ($49.68) $943.82
17 | Tenors: 6"-10"-12"'13"14"; Maple/Chrome Hardware 1,058.80 No Bid 1,076.00 1,085.00 | $ 1,150.00
Clear Lacquer Finish
MDRPMTLG0234NC
PMTL60234N/A Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 4-6 months 4 to 6 months 5-6 months
Jyrs on shell
Warranty: Standard Mfr, 1 Year statements attached 1yr on parts
18 stand: 126.70 No Bid 123.00 12200 | 3 14000 { §
SS143MT53000 :
MTS-3000 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
19 cover 45.90 No Bid 48.00 4200
MDCG60234 Brand & Model Bid: DC1298023G As Specified As Specified As Specified
Defivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr, 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
20|carrier 194.40 No Bid 191.00 19000 | $ 208.00
CXT-1 Brand & Model Bid: MA910T As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year 1 Year
TOTAL ITEMS 17-20 1,425.80 No Bid 1,438.00 1,439.00 | § 1,548.00 11,316.90
Pref to Florida Busi (5%) wl NY MD MD FL ($77.40) $1,470.60 osb
Marching Bass: 16": Maple/Chrome Hardware/Clear Lacquer Ep
21 |Finish 418.00 No Bid 454.00 457.00 ] $ 482.00 414,00
MDRPBDL1614302 7 T
PBDL1614 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
custom color est.
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 4-6 months 4 to 60 months 5-6 months 120160 days
3 yrs on shell : :
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 yr on parts ~4 Year




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ITB 14-09 BAND INSTRUMENTS - OPENING DATE AND TIME 3-11-14 2:00PM CT

M 110
18" Maple/Chrome Hardware/Clear Lacquer

IMarching Bass:
22 {Finish 445.00 483.00 487.00
WMDRPBDOL 1814302
PBDL1814 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 4-6 months 4 o 6 months 5-6 months
3 yrs on shel
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 yr on parts
Marching Bass: 20" Maple/Chrome Hardware/Clear Lacquer
23 |Finish 476.00 No Bid 522.00 527.00
MDRPBDL2014302
PBD:2014 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 4-6 months 4 to 6 months 5-6 months
3 yrs on sheil
Warranty: Standard Mir, 1 Year statements attached 1 yr on parts
Marching Bass: 24" Maple/Chrome Hardware/Clear Lacquer
24 {Finsih 655.00 No Bid 570.00 575.00 600.00
MORPEOLZ414302
PBDL2414 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 4-6 months 4 to 6 months 5-6 months
3yrs on shell
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 yr on parts
Marching Bass: 28" Maple/Chrome Hardware/Clear Lacquer
25 {Finish 587.00 No Bid 635.00 640.00 670.00
MDRPBDL2814302
PBDL2814 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 4-6 months 4 to 6 months 5-6 months
3 yrs on shell
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 yr on parts
26 |stand 124.90 No Bid 121.00 170.00 135.00
SS143MB53000
MBS-3000 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Defivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
27 |Cover 16" 35.90 No Bid 38.00 33.00 $ 42.00
DC12916G
MDCG16 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr, 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
28 |Cover 18" 35.90 No Bid 38.00 33.00 42.00
DC12918G
MDCG18 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year i




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ITB 14-09 BAND INSTRUMENTS - OPENING DATE AND TIME 3-11-14 2:00PM CT

Cover 20"
DC12920G
MDCG20 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Spedified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
ép_ Cover 24" $ 42.90 No Bid 3 4500 | $ 40.00 | $
DC12924G
MDCG24 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-80 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr, 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
31 |cover 28" s 45.90 No Bid $ 4900 (s 4200(s
DC12928G
MDCG28 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
32 |carrier $ 174.90 No Bid $ 17100 | $ 17000 | $ 18800 | §
CX8-1 Brand & Model Bid: MA910B As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 1yt LTD 15-30 days 30 days 7 days
Warranty: Standard Mir. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
TOTAL ITEMS 21-32 $ 2,981.30 No Bid $ 3,164.00 | § 3,211.00 | § 3,384.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) wi NY MD MD FL ($169.20) $3,214.80
33 |saxophone, Tenor $ g . 22389 No Bid $ 2251001 $ 224100 $ 2,450.00
Preference to Florida Business (5%) e o - MD MD FL ($122.50) $2,327.50 sD
Yamaha YTS 62111 Brand & Model Bid: BTSYTS62N As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified As Spacified
Delivery Lead Time: 3045 days ARO 15-45 days 30 days 7 days 10 days
Warranty: Standerd M. ] 5 Year statements attached 5 Years 1Year
34 |Classic Orchestra Bells: Classic 2.5 Octave $ 1,043.00 No Bid $ 1,074.00 | $ 112000 § 1,295.00 .
Preference to Florida Business (5%) wi MD MD FL ($64.75) $1,230.25
Musser M 646 Brand & Model Bid: BELM646 As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-45 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 30 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
35 |Round Top Bells: 2.6 Octave $ 1,677.00 No Bid $ 1,669.00 | $ 1,70000 | $ 1,890.00
Preference to Florida Business wi (] MD FL ($94.50) $1,795.50
BELGCO26
Adams GCO-26 Brand & Model Bid: As Specified As Specified As Specified As Specified
Delivery Lead Time: 30-60 days ARO 15-30 days 30 days 30 days
Warranty: Standard Mfr. 1 Year statements attached 1 Year
36 [Bassoon Bocal No Bid No Bid No Bid . $979.00 No Bid
Preference to Florida Business i Mo
Heckel CC2 Brand & Model Bid: © | Nickel Pated Hackel
Delivery Lead Time: 60 days
Warranty: ’ nane
Signed Bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes _; Yes Yes
Service Facility ? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




TABULATION AND RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ITB 14-09 BAND INSTRUMENTS - OPENING DATE AND TIME 3-11-14 2:00PM CT

* Notes / Alternate Items Bid:
. Interstate Music noted: Orders received without our bid reference number may be processed at Casio Interstate Music's standard prices and terms.

. Interstate Music noted: Item 12 Bach 50BL is N/A. They Bid 50B2L. An Alternate Item is 50B3L for $3,393.00. Ship time 30-45 days ARQ with Standard Mfr. Warranty.
. Interstate Musice noted: ltem 19 Discontinued. Provided Model Number DC1298023G.

. Music & Arts noted: Item 14 - the S1030L Stand is not for Marching Drums. They Bid MSS-300.
. Music & Arts noted: Delivery time quoted is as of today's information from various manufacturers. Obviously this can change based on their production schedules.

. Music & Arts noted: Warranty issues will be handled thru our office. We will work direcly with the manufacturers for the School District. Since we do not have a facility in Fort Walton Beach - the time requirement may
not be met however, we will try.

7. Taylor Music Inc. noted: Provided additional prices for Item 33 Yamaha YAS-62lll Alto $2,088.00, Yamaha YTSIl| Tenor $2,199.00

DA WwN =

Non- Responsive Bids:
1. Melhart Music Center was declared Non-Responsive because they did not bid items as specified.

No Bids:
1. Peripole, Inc. and Suzuki Music Usa responded with a "No Bid".



RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ITB 14-09 BAND INSTRUMENTS OPENING DATE: 3-11-14 2:00PM CT

RECOMMENDATIONS FOR AWARD  (Bid Tabulation attached)

Company Name Item Numbers Awarded

Interstate Music 6,8,9,10,13,14,15,16,33

Northeast Music, Inc. 3

Music & Arts 2,12

Washington Music Center 4,5,36

Taylor Music 1,7,11,17,18,19,20,21,22,23,24,25,26,27,28,29,30,31,32,
34,35

Contract Period: The contract period shall be for a six (6) month period and is estimated to
commence on or around April 15, 2014 and end October 15, 2014. Prices and discounts
shall remain firm for this period and shall include all freight and handling charges. This
contract may be renewed for one (1) additional six (6) month period. Items will be purchased
on an as needed basis Item by Item and or by Group.

COMMITTEE RECOMMENDING AWARD

Tony Chiarito - Baker School Band Randy Folsom, Fort Walton Beach H.S. Band
Jay McArthur - Choctawhatchee H.S. Band Dan Wooten, Niceville H.S. Band
Jody Dunn - Crestview H.S. Band

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date
and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any are hereby rejected as late.

NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDERS
Melhart Music Center was delcared Non-Responsive because they did not bid as specified.

BIDDERS WHO BID NO BID
Peripole, Inc. and Suzuki Music Usa responded with a "No Bid"

FUNDING
Fund Function Object Center Project
3714 7400 0041 2393
3714 7400 0581 2393
3714 7400 0601 2393
3714 7400 0641 2393
714 7400 0211 2393

Object 0641 for instruments purchased equal to or greater than $1,000 and object 0642 for
instruments purchased less than $1,000

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Florida Statutes 120.57,Florida Statutes, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.”

POSTED: 3/20/14 10:09AM CT




